
 

Date/Time: February 15, 2006 09:12:00 

 
 
 
 

Bid Title Printed & Promotional 
Products 

 Number of Vendors Notified  
417 

Bid Number 06-120-MK  Number of Bids Distributed  
84 

Date 
Solicited 

12/15/2005  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

 
11 

Date Opened 1/25/2006  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

          
          1 

Date Board 
Presentation 

March 7, 2006  Number of Vendors Bidding  
10 

Total Savings Estimated $9,000.00  Grand Total of Bid Estimated 
$50,000.00 

Recommendation:   Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet. 
Term of Contract:   This is a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual agreement of 
both parties.  The first year of the contract will commence on July 1, 2006 through June 5, 2007. 
Notations and Exceptions: 
No totals are given as purchases will be awarded on an “as needed” basis at the unit prices for Part A and 
Part B.  Catalog discounts for Part C.  Unit prices and discounts will remain firm and in effect throughout 
the term of the contract. 
 
Bids from Apples, Angels and More and Incentive Mall were disqualified – failure to properly execute bid 
documents.  B&B Sports was not considered as a vendor due to insufficient products offered to meet the 
needs of the District. Pride Enterprises submitted a “No Bid” response. 
 
Bids were awarded on a weighted point system:  Net Cost/Discount (10 pts.); Vendor Location (6 pts.); 
References (4 pts.).  Two vendors were awarded per region – see attached. 
 
Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and 
time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By: 
Sherry Wooten, Buyer Assistant  
Bids Prepared By: 
Mina Kaeding, Buyer 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Missing pages 2-6, 10-12

REGIONS AWARDED PART A & B pages 14-27, 32-36

PR-01 White T-Shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom Gldan 800B Hanes 5370 Jerzees 29B
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal Gildan 800 Hanes 5170 Jerzees 29M
Sample Required with Screen Printing
Youth Small $5.30 $2.70 $2.68
Youth Medium $5.30 $2.70 $2.68
Youth Large $5.30 No Bid $2.68
Adult Small $5.30 No Bid $2.54
Adult Medium $5.30 No Bid $2.54
Adult Large $5.30 No Bid $2.54
Adult X-Large $5.30 No Bid $2.54
Adult 2X-Large $6.30 $4.10 $4.28
Adult 3X-Large $6.50 $4.60 $4.38

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $5.30 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $6.55 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $7.80 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $9.05 +$1.05 *$5.50

*Price based on 12 pieces
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts $1.00 $1.00 $0.85
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $5.30 $0.00 *12-23/$7.28
37-72 $3.70 $0.00 *24-47/$5.88
73-143 $3.65 $0.00 *48-95/$5.18
144+ $3.55 $0.00 $4.48

See bid document/add. Breaks *Based on 1-color youth
sizes

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Part A - Screen Printing



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-02 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom Gildan 830 Fruit of the Loom 5930P Jerzees 29P
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Medium N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Large N/A No Bid N/A
Adult Small $7.55 No Bid $4.78
Adult Medium $7.55 $3.90 $4.78
Adult Large $7.55 $3.90 $4.78
Adult X-Large $7.55 $3.90 $4.78
Adult 2X-Large $10.05 $5.30 $6.53
Adult 3X-Large $10.30 $6.50 $6.73

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $7.55 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $8.80 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $10.05 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $11.30 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts $1.50 $1.25 $0.95
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $7.55 $0.00 *12-23/$9.38
37-72 $6.00 $0.00 *24-47/$7.98
73-143 $5.90 $0.00 *48-95/7.28
144+ $5.80 $0.00 *$6.58

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color imprint



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-03 White T-shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fuit of Loom Gildan 200B Fruit of the Loom 3930B Jerzees 363B
100% Cotton. Sample Required w/Screen Printing Gildan 200 Fruit of the Loom 3930 Jerzees 363B
Youth Small $5.55 $2.85 $2.58
Youth Medium $5.55 $2.85 $2.58
Youth Large $5.55 $2.85 $2.58
Adult Small $5.55 $2.85 $2.50
Adult Medium $5.55 $2.85 $2.50
Adult Large $5.55 $2.85 $2.50
Adult X-Large $5.55 $2.85 $2.50
Adult 2X-Large $6.75 $3.95 $4.20
Adult 3X-Large $6.85 $4.95 $4.40

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $5.55 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $6.80 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $8.00 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $9.30 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts $1.00 $0.75 $0.75
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $5.55 $0.00 *12-23/$7.18
37-72 $3.95 $0.00 *24-47/$6.08
73-143 $3.90 $0.00 *48-95/$5.25
144+ $3.80 $0.00 *$4.38

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color youth
sizes



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-04 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom Gildan 230 Fruit of the Loom 3930P Jerzees 363P
100% Cotton or Equal See attached letter
Youth Small N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Medium N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Large N/A No Bid N/A
Adult Small $7.75 No Bid $4.26
Adult Medium $7.75 $4.25 $4.26
Adult Large $7.75 $4.25 $4.26
Adult X-Large $7.75 $4.25 $4.26
Adult 2X-Large $9.75 $5.65 $6.01
Adult 3X-Large $10.00 $6.85 $6.21

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $7.75 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $9.00 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $10.25 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $11.50 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts $1.50 $2.50 $0.95
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $7.75 $0.00 *12-23/$8.86
37-72 $6.15 $0.00 *24-47/$7.46
73-143 $6.05 $0.00 *48-95/$6.76
144+ $6.00 $0.00 *6.06

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color imprint



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-05 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil Gildan 280 Jerzees J100 Jerzees J100
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
with Screen Printing
Youth Small N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Medium N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Large N/A No Bid N/A
Adult Small $10.15 $5.75 $6.78
Adult Medium $10.15 $5.75 $6.78
Adult Large $10.15 $5.75 $6.78
Adult X-Large $10.15 $5.75 $6.78
Adult 2X-Large $12.50 $9.25 $8.53
Adult 3X-Large N/A $9.75 $10.28

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $10.15 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $11.40 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $12.65 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $13.90 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts $1.00 $1.20 $1.00
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $10.15 $0.00 *12-23/$11.38
37-72 $8.55 $0.00 *24-47/$9.98
73-143 $8.45 $0.00 *48-95/$9.28
144+ $8.40 $0.00 *$8.58

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color imprint



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-06 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100% Port Authority K420P No Bid No Bid
Combed Cotton or Equal Not Applicable
Youth Small N/A
Youth Medium N/A
Youth Large N/A
Adult Small $21.55
Adult Medium $21.55
Adult Large $21.55
Adult X-Large $21.55
Adult 2X-Large $23.20
Adult 3X-Large $25.20

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color
1-Color Imprint $21.55
2-Color Imprint $22.80
3-Color Imprint $24.05
4-Color Imprint $25.30
Additional Charge for Color T- Shirts N/A
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $21.55
37-72 $19.95
73-143 $19.85
144+ $19.80

See bid document/add breaks



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-07 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil Gildan 880B Jerzees 437Y Gildan G880B
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal Sample Required Gildan 880 Jerzees 437 Gildan G880
with Screen Printing
Youth Small $8.90 $7.40 $5.98
Youth Medium $8.90 $7.40 $5.98
Youth Large $8.90 $7.40 $5.98
Adult Small $8.90 $8.50 $6.86
Adult Medium $8.90 $8.50 6.86
Adult Large $8.90 $8.50 6.86
Adult X-Large $8.90 $8.50 6.86
Adult 2X-Large $11.00 $10.50 8.71
Adult 3X-Large $11.50 $13.00 8.91

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $8.90 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $10.15 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $11.40 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $12.65 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts N/A $1.20 $1.00
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $8.90 $0.00 *12-23/$10.58
37-72 $7.35 $0.00 *24-47/$9.18
73-143 $7.25 $0.00 *48-95/$8.48
144+ $7.15 $0.00 *$7.78

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color youth
sizes



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-08 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 50/50 Jerzees 436MP Jerzees 436MP Gildan G890
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Medium N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Large N/A No Bid N/A
Adult Small $13.65 $9.75 $8.98
Adult Medium $13.65 $9.75 $8.98
Adult Large $13.65 $9.75 $8.98
Adult X-Large $13.65 $9.75 $8.98
Adult 2X-Large $15.75 $11.50 $10.73
Adult 3X-Large $17.50 $13.00 $10.93

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $15.00/color $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $15.00/color $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $13.65 Included *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $14.90 +$0.35 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $16.15 +$0.70 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $17.40 +$1.05 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts N/A $1.20 $1.00
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $13.65 $0.00 *12-23/$13.58
37-72 $12.05 $0.00 *24-47/$12.18
73-143 $12.00 $0.00 *48-95/$11.48
144+ $11.90 $0.00 *$10.78

See bid document/add breaks *Based on 1-color imprint



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-11 Canvas Tote Bag - 15 X 16 w/Canvas Handles. Harriton M905 $2.38
Sample Required with Screen Printing BE007
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $37.50 $10.00/color $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $37.50 $0.75 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $3.00 $3.30 *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $3.60 $3.65 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $4.20 $4.00 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $6.08 $4.35 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color Bag N/A N/A $0.50
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $3.00 $0.00 *12-23/$6.98
37-72 $3.00 $0.00 *24-47/$5.58
73-143 $2.75 $0.00 *48-95/$4.88
144+ $2.75 $0.00 *$4.18

*Based on 1-color, one
side imprint

PR-12 Large Canvas Tote Bag - 14 X 15 X 5 w/Canvas No Bid $3.98
Handles. Sample Required with Screen Printing BE008/10-1/2x14x5
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo $37.50 $17.50/color
Additional Location of Imprint per color $37.50 $0.90
1-Color Imprint $8.95 *$4.60
2-Color Imprint $9.55 *$4.90
3-Color Imprint $10.15 *$5.20
4-Color Imprint $10.75 *$5.50
Additional Charge for Color Bag N/A $0.50
Quantity Price Breaks *Based on 12 pieces
13-36 $8.95 *12-23/$8.58
37-72 $8.95 *24-47/$7.18
73-143 $8.47 *48-95/$6.48
144+ $8.47 *$5.78

*Based on 1-color, one
side imprint

Total Points Part A 58.5 39



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

REGIONS AWARDED PART  B

PR-13 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil Gildan 280 Jerzees J100 Jerzees J100
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
Youth Small N/A N/A N/A
Youth Medium N/A N/A N/A
Youth Large N/A N/A N/A
Adult Small $13.45 $8.50 *$6.78
Adult Medium $13.45 $8.50 *$6.78
Adult Large $13.45 $8.50 *$6.78
Adult X-Large $13.45 $8.50 *$6.78
Adult 2X-Large $15.50 $11.50 *$8.53
Adult 3X-Large N/A $12.00 *$10.28
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts $1.00 $1.20 $1.00

*Logo digitizing, and
embellishment/additional

Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $13.45 $0.00 $0.00
37-72 $12.65 $0.00 $0.00
73-143 $12.40 $0.00 $0.00
144+ $12.30 $0.00 $0.00

Part B - Embroidery



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-14 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100% Port Authority K420P No Bid No Bid
Combed Cotton or Equal. See attached letter
Youth Small N/A
Youth Medium N/A
Youth Large N/A
Adult Small $24.90
Adult Medium $24.90
Adult Large $24.90
Adult X-Large $24.90
Adult 2X-Large $26.55
Adult 3X-Large $28.55
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts N/A
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $24.90
37-72 $24.00
73-143 $23.80
144+ $23.70



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-15 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil Gildan 880B Jerzees 437Y Gildan G880B
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal. Sample Required Gildan 800 Jerzees 437 Gildan G880
Youth Small $12.25 $9.95 *$5.98
Youth Medium $12.25 $9.95 *$5.98
Youth Large $12.25 $9.95 *$5.98
Adult Small $12.25 $12.95 *$6.86
Adult Medium $12.25 $12.95 *$6.86
Adult Large $12.25 $12.95 *$6.86
Adult X-Large $12.25 $12.95 *$6.86
Adult 2X-Large $14.45 $14.45 *$8.71
Adult 3X-Large $14.85 $14.95 *$8.91
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts N/A $0.50 $1.00
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $12.25 $0.00 $0.00
37-72 $11.50 $0.00 $0.00
73-143 $11.20 $0.00 $0.00
144+ $11.10 $0.00 $0.00

*Logo digitizing, and
embellishment/additional



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-16 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil. 50/50 Jerzees 436MP Jerzees 436MP Gildan G890
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Medium N/A No Bid N/A
Youth Large N/A No Bid N/A
Adult Small $17.00 $12.00 *$8.98
Adult Medium $17.00 No Bid *$8.98
Adult Large $17.00 No Bid *$8.98
Adult X-Large $17.00 No Bid *$8.98
Adult 2X-Large $19.10 $14.00 *$10.73
Adult 3X-Large $20.85 $15.50 *$10.93
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts N/A $1.25 $1.00
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $17.00 $0.00 $0.00
37-72 $16.15 $0.00 $0.00
73-143 $15.90 $0.00 $0.00
144+ $15.85 $0.00 $0.00

*Logo digitizing, and
embellishment/additional



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-17 Basic Cap - Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro or Buckle No Bid Refer to pg 289 in Alpha
Back, Sample Required with Embroidery Catalog Item #156
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $8.35 $0.00
37-72 $7.50 $0.00
73-144 $7.25 $0.00
144+ $7.20 $0.00

PR-18 Basic Cap - Brushed Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro No Bid Refer to pg 281 in Alpha
or Buckle Back, Sample Required Catalog 
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36 $9.85 $0.00
37-72 $9.00 $0.00
73-144 $8.75 $0.00
144+ $8.70 $0.00
One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image) $55.00 No Bid $100. - $125.00
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000 Included No Bid $8.00
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+ $0.25 per 1,000 No Bid $10.00 - $12.00

One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image)
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+

TOTAL POINTS - PART B 57.67



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Advantage Promotional Products Apples Angels & More B & B Sports Crowley & Company
9234 Shenandoah Run 2148 16th Ave. S.W. 6109 N. Nebraska Ave. 2416 N. Essex Ave.

Wesley Chapel, FL 33544 Largo, FL 33770 Tampa, FL 33604 Hernando, FL 34442
813-991-5118 800-441-8600 813-238-2542 352-527-0005

ITEM# UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Fixed Percentage Discount No Bid
Up to 250 10.00% 5.00%
Up to 500 10.00% 10.00%
Up to 1,000 10.00% 15.00%
Up to 2,500 10.00% 15.00%
2,500 over 10.00% 15.00%

Average Set - Up Fee Average $35.00/per catalog Per Catalog

Catalog Names: Adva-Lite The Positive Line
Gemini Bulletline
Wov-in Line Lewtan
Gempire
Souvenir Best Seller
Alpha Shirt Company
Beacon Brand Builders
Pioneer Line
Bag Makers

REGIONS AWARDED - PART C 1, 2, 3, & 4
TOTAL POINTS - PART C 31.08

Part C - Catalog Discount/Balance of Line



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

REGIONS AWARDED PART A & B

PR-01 White T-Shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Sample Required with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint

Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Part A - Screen Printing

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Regions Awarded Regions Awarded
1, 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6

Hanes 5370 Hanes 5730 Fruit of the Loom 5930B
Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170  Fruit of the Loom 5930

$1.65 $2.50 $4.77
$1.65 $2.50 $4.77
$1.65 $2.50 $4.77
$1.60 $2.50 $4.77
$1.60 $2.50 $4.77
$1.60 $2.50 $4.77
$1.60 $2.50 $4.77
$2.45 $3.50 $5.77
$2.65 $4.50 $6.77

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $4.77
$2.00 $2.50 $6.13/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $6.30/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $6.48/48pc minimum

$0.65 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.25 $4.19
*$1.25 -$1.00 $3.81
*$1.00 -$1.25 $3.13
*$0.75 -$2.00 $2.76

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-02 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Fruit of the Loom 5930P Gildan G830 Gildan G830

N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A

$2.60 $3.50 N/A
$2.60 $3.50 $6.56
$2.60 $3.50 $6.56
$2.60 $3.50 $6.56
$3.85 $5.00 $7.56
$4.05 $6.00 $8.56

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $6.56
$2.00 $2.50 $8.11/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $8.29/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $8.46/48pc minimum
$0.80 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.50 $6.53
*$1.25 -$1.00 $5.60
*$1.00 -$1.25 $5.23
*$0.75 -$2.00 $4.86

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-03 White T-shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fuit of Loom
100% Cotton. Sample Required w/Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Hanes 5380 Gildan G200B Gildan G200B
Hanes 5180 Gildan G200 Gildan G200 

$2.30 $2.50 $4.92
$2.30 $2.50 $4.92
$2.30 $2.50 $4.92
$2.50 $2.50 $4.92
$2.50 $2.50 $4.92
$2.50 $2.50 $4.92
$2.50 $2.50 $4.92
$4.00 $3.50 $5.92
$4.80 $4.50 $6.92

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $4.92
$2.00 $2.50 $5.57/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $5.95/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $6.23/48pc minimum
$1.35 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.25 $4.59
*$1.25 -$1.00 $3.66
*$1.00 -$1.25 $3.28
*$0.75 -$2.00 $3.18

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-04 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
100% Cotton or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Hanes 5190 Gildan G230 Jerzee 363P

N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A

$4.50 $3.50 N/A
$4.50 $3.50 $5.74
$4.50 $3.50 $5.74
$4.50 $3.50 $5.74
$5.55 $5.00 $6.74
$6.00 $6.00 $7.74

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $5.74
$2.00 $2.50 $7.09/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $7.27/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $7.44/48pc minimum
$1.10 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.50 $5.45
*$1.25 -$1.00 $4.52
*$1.00 -$1.25 $4.15
*$0.75 -$2.00 $3.78

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-05 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Jerzees 440Y Gildan G280 Jerzee J100
Jerzees 440M

$8.20 N/A N/A
$8.20 N/A N/A
$8.20 N/A N/A
$7.75 $5.00 7.33
$7.75 $5.00 7.33
$7.75 $5.00 7.33
$7.75 $5.00 7.33
$9.25 $6.50 8.33

$10.75 $8.00 9.33

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 0.75

$1.80 $2.00 7.33
$2.00 $2.50 $9.03/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $9.56/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $10.09/48pc minimum
$0.85 $0.75 1.50

*$1.50 -$0.50 7.14
*$1.25 -$1.00 6.21
*$1.00 -$1.25 5.83
*$0.75 -$2.00 5.46

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-06 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100%
Combed Cotton or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T- Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Ultra Club 8534 *Anvil 6030 Polo No Bid

N/A N/A
N/A N/A
N/A N/A

$9.95 N/A
$9.95 $7.50
$9.95 $7.50
$9.95 $7.50

$11.05 $9.00
$13.05 N/A

$10.00 $10.00
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75

$1.80 $2.00
$2.00 $2.50
$2.20 $3.00
$2.40 $4.00
$0.00 $0.75

*$1.50 -$0.50
*$1.25 -$1.00
*$1.00 -$1.25
*$0.75 -$2.00

*Quantity breaks on screen * See attached letter 
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-07 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal Sample Required
with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Jerzees 437Y Gildan G880B Gildan G880B
Jerzees 437M Gildan G880 Gildan G880

$5.65 $5.00 $7.21
$5.65 $5.00 $7.21
$5.65 $5.00 $7.21
$6.50 $5.00 $7.21
$6.50 $5.00 $7.21
$6.50 $5.00 $7.21
$6.50 $5.00 $7.21
$8.15 $8.00 $8.21
$8.65 $9.00 $9.21

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $7.21
$2.00 $2.50 $8.55/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $8.73/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $8.90/48pc minimum
$0.80 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.50 $7.00
*$1.25 -$1.00 $6.07
*$1.00 -$1.25 $5.70
*$0.75 -$2.00 $5.32

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-08 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 50/50
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Anvil 4603 Hanes 054P Gildan G890

N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A

$5.75 $6.00 N/A
$5.75 $6.00 $8.39
$5.75 $6.00 $8.39
$5.75 $6.00 $8.39
$7.50 $7.00 $9.39
$9.00 $8.00 $10.39

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per shirt $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $2.00 $8.39
$2.00 $2.50 $9.74/24pc minimum
$2.20 $3.00 $9.92/36pc minimum
$2.40 $4.00 $10.09/48pc minimum
$0.60 $0.75 $1.50

*$1.50 -$0.50 $8.26
*$1.25 -$1.00 $7.33
*$1.00 -$1.25 $6.96
*$0.75 -$2.00 $6.58

*Quantity breaks on screen
print only



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-11 Canvas Tote Bag - 15 X 16 w/Canvas Handles.
Sample Required with Screen Printing
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Bag
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

PR-12 Large Canvas Tote Bag - 14 X 15 X 5 w/Canvas 
Handles. Sample Required with Screen Printing
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Bag
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Total Points Part A

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
* Size 12x15x3

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per bag $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $4.00 $4.90
$2.00 $4.50 $6.25
$2.20 $5.00 N/A
$2.40 $6.00 N/A

N/A N/C N/A

$3.85 -$0.25 $4.56
$3.35 -$0.50 $3.63
$2.95 -$0.75 $3.26
$2.50 -$1.00 $2.89

*14x19x6

$10.00 $10.00 $25./$10. ea add. Logo
*$0.90 per bag $0.75 $0.75

$1.80 $6.00 $5.53
$2.00 $6.50 $6.89
$2.20 $7.00 N/A
$2.40 $8.00 N/A
$0.00 N/C N/A

$5.25 -$0.25 $4.95
$4.85 -$0.50 $4.06
$4.55 -$0.75 $3.71
$4.15 -$1.00 $3.36

82 67.5



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

REGIONS AWARDED PART  B

PR-13 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts

Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Part B - Embroidery

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Regions Awarded Regions Awarded
1, 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6

Jerzees 440Y Gildan G280 Gildan G380
Jerzees 440

$8.20 N/A N/A
$8.20 N/A N/A
$8.20 N/A N/A
$7.75 5.00 $11.50
$7.75 5.00 $11.50
$7.75 5.00 $11.50
$7.75 5.00 $11.50
$9.25 6.50 $12.50

$10.75 8.00 $13.50
$0.85 0.75 $1.50

$0.75 per 1,000 stitches -0.50 $11.39
$0.70 per 1,000 stitches -1.00 $11.28
$0.65 per 1,000 stitches -1.25 $11.20
$0.60 per 1,000 stitches -2.09 $11.11



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-14 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100%
Combed Cotton or Equal.
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Ultra Club 8534 Anvil 6030 Anvil 6030

*100% Cotton Pig
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A

$9.95 N/A N/A
$9.95 $7.50 $12.67
$9.95 $7.50 $12.67
$9.95 $7.50 $12.67

$11.05 $9.00 $13.67
$13.05 N/A $14.67

$0.00 $0.75 $1.50

$0.75 per 1,000 stitches -$0.50 $12.48
$0.70 per 1,000 stitches -$1.00 $12.37
$0.65 per 1,000 stitches -$1.25 $12.29
$0.60 per 1,000 stitches -$2.00 $12.12

*See attached letter



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-15 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal. Sample Required
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Jerzees 437Y Gildan G880B Gildan G880B
Jerzees 437M Gildan G880 Gildan G880

$5.65 $5.00 $9.69
$5.65 $5.00 $9.69
$5.65 $5.00 $9.69
$6.50 $5.00 $9.69
$6.50 $5.00 $9.69
$6.50 $5.00 $9.69
$6.50 $5.00 $9.69
$8.15 $8.00 $10.69
$8.65 $9.00 $11.69
$0.80 $0.75 $1.50

$0.75 per 1,000 stitches -$0.50 $9.50
$0.70 per 1,000 stitches -$1.00 $9.40
$0.65 per 1,000 stitches -$1.25 $9.32
$0.60 per 1,000 stitches -$2.00 $9.30



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-16 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil. 50/50
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Anvil 4603 Gildan G890 Gildan G890

N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A

$5.75 $6.00 N/A
$5.75 $6.00 $10.86
$5.75 $6.00 $10.86
$5.75 $6.00 $10.86
$7.50 $7.00 $11.86
$9.00 $8.00 $12.86
$0.60 $0.75 $1.50

$0.75 per 1,000 stitches -$0.50 $10.67
$0.70 per 1,000 stitches -$1.00 $10.56
$0.65 per 1,000 stitches -$1.25 $10.48
$0.60 per 1,000 stitches -$2.00 $10.47



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-17 Basic Cap - Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro or Buckle
Back, Sample Required with Embroidery
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-144
144+

PR-18 Basic Cap - Brushed Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro
or Buckle Back, Sample Required
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-144
144+
One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image)
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+

One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image)
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+

TOTAL POINTS - PART B

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
$2.00 ea plus embroidery

$4.95 -$0.25 $7.00
$4.20 -$0.50 $6.81
$3.50 -$1.00 $6.71
$2.50 -$1.50 $6.63

$2.00 ea plus embroidery

$5.10 -$0.25 $7.88
$4.35 -$0.50 $7.66
$3.65 -$1.00 $7.55
$2.65 -$1.50 $7.46

$25.00 $45.00 $45.00
$0.75 per 1,000 stitches $6.00 Included up to 15,000
$0.20 per 1,000 stitches N/C $.30 for ea add 1,000 

over 15,000

$65.00
$5.90
$6.37

82 64.308 72.978



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Fixed Percentage Discount
Up to 250
Up to 500
Up to 1,000
Up to 2,500
2,500 over

Average Set - Up Fee

Catalog Names:

REGIONS AWARDED - PART C
TOTAL POINTS - PART C

Part C - Catalog Discount/Balance of Line

Fielder's Choice Sporting Goods Gulf Coast Graphics Gulfside Custom T-Shirts
10234 Waterside Oaks Drive 8902 State Road 52 10152 US 19

Tampa, FL 33647 Hudson, FL 34667 Port Richey, FL 34668
813-991-5911 727-861-1770 727-862-1960

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

No Bid No Bid
10.00%
15.00%
20.00%
25.00%
25.00%

Per Catalog

Hit Promo
Sweda
Pepco
Sonoma Pins
Bag Makers
Overnight Fields
Shepenco

1, 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6
40.31



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

REGIONS AWARDED PART A & B

PR-01 White T-Shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Sample Required with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint

Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Part A - Screen Printing

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Missing pages 1-6, 11-12,
pages 32-36

No Bid Gildan G800B
Gildan G800

$5.50
$5.50
$5.50
$5.50
$5.50
$5.50
$5.50
$6.50
$6.75

$25.00
$0.50
$5.50
$6.00
$6.50
$7.00

$0.70

$5.50
$5.25
$5.00
$4.75



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-02 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Gildan G830

N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

$6.25
$6.25
$6.25
$7.25
$7.40

$25.00
$0.50
$6.25
$6.75
$7.25
$7.50
$1.00

$6.25
$6.15
$5.85
$5.75



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-03 White T-shirt w/out Pocket, Hanes or Fuit of Loom
100% Cotton. Sample Required w/Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Gildan G200B

Gildan 200
$6.00
$6.00
$6.00
$6.00
$6.00
$6.00
$6.00
$7.00
$7.25

$25.00
$0.50
$6.00
$6.50
$7.00
$7.50
$0.70

$6.00
$5.75
$5.25
$5.00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-04 White T-Shirt w/Pocket, Hanes or Fruit of Loom
100% Cotton or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T-shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Gildan G230

N/A
N/A
N/A

$7.25
$7.25
$7.25
$7.25
$8.25
$8.50

$25.00
$0.50
$7.25
$7.50
$7.75
$8.00
$0.70

$7.25
$7.00
$6.75
$6.50



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-05 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Jerzees 440Y

Jerzees 440

$12.00
$12.00
$12.00
$12.00
$12.00
$12.00
$12.00
$14.00
$16.00

$25.00
$0.50

$12.00
$12.50
$13.00
$14.00

$1.50

$12.00
$11.75
$11.50
$11.00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-06 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100%
Combed Cotton or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color T- Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Anvil 6030

N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

$11.75
$11.75
$11.75
$13.25

N/A

$25.00
$0.50

$11.75
$12.25
$12.75
$13.25

$0.75

$11.75
$11.50
$11.25

$9.50



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-07 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal Sample Required
with Screen Printing
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Gildan G880B

Gildan G880

$10.00
$10.00
$10.00
$10.00
$10.00
$10.00
$10.00
$11.50
$11.75

$25.00
$0.50

$10.00
$10.50
$11.00
$12.00

$1.00

$10.00
$9.75

$10.50
$10.00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-08 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 50/50
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large

Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Gildan G890

N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

$11.00
$11.00
$11.00
$12.50
$12.75

$25.00
$0.50

$11.00
$11.50
$12.00
$12.50

$1.00

$11.00
$10.75
$10.50
$10.25



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-11 Canvas Tote Bag - 15 X 16 w/Canvas Handles.
Sample Required with Screen Printing
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Bag
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

PR-12 Large Canvas Tote Bag - 14 X 15 X 5 w/Canvas 
Handles. Sample Required with Screen Printing
Screen Printing: Set up/Logo
Additional Location of Imprint per color
1-Color Imprint
2-Color Imprint
3-Color Imprint
4-Color Imprint
Additional Charge for Color Bag
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Total Points Part A

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid Canvas Promo BE007

$4.00
$25.00

$0.50
$4.00
$4.50
$5.00
$5.00
$0.50

$4.00
$3.90
$3.70
$3.60

No Bid Canvas Book BE008
$6.00

$25.00
$0.50
$6.00
$6.50
$7.00
$7.50
$0.50

$6.00
$5.90
$5.80
$5.70



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

REGIONS AWARDED PART  B

PR-13 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
100% Combed Cotton or Equal. Sample Required
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts

Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

Part B - Embroidery

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Jerzees 440Y Jerzees 440Y
Jerzees 440 Jerzees 440

$13.00 $16.00
$13.00 $16.00
$13.00 $16.00
$12.00 $16.00
$12.00 $16.00
$12.00 $16.00
$12.00 $16.00
$14.00 $18.00
$16.00 $20.00

1.50 $1.50

$12.00 $16.00
$9.00 $15.80
$9.00 $15.60
$9.00 $15.40



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-14 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil 100%
Combed Cotton or Equal.
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Anvil 6030 Anvil 6030

N/A N/A
N/A N/A
N/A N/A
N/A N/A

$16.00 $15.75
$16.00 $15.75
$16.00 $15.75
$18.00 $17.25

N/A N/A
$1.50 $0.75

$16.00 $15.75
$12.00 $15.55
$12.00 $15.35
$12.00 $15.15



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-15 White Golf Shirt w/out Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil
50/50 Cotton/Polyester or Equal. Sample Required
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Jerzees 437Y Gildan G880B
Jerzees 437 Gildan G880

$8.00 $14.00
$8.00 $14.00
$8.00 $14.00
$9.00 $14.00
$9.00 $14.00
$9.00 $14.00
$9.00 $14.00

$11.00 $15.50
$13.00 $15.75

$1.50 $1.00

$8.00 $14.00
$7.00 $13.80
$7.00 $13.60
$7.00 $13.40



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-16 White Golf Shirt w/Pocket, Jerzees or Anvil. 50/50
Cotton/Polyester or Equal
Youth Small
Youth Medium
Youth Large
Adult Small
Adult Medium
Adult Large
Adult X-Large
Adult 2X-Large
Adult 3X-Large
Additional Charge for Color Golf Shirts
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-143
144+

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Jerzees 436P Gildan G890

N/A N/A
N/A N/A
N/A N/A
N/A N/A

$11.00 $15.00
$11.00 $15.00
$11.00 $15.00
$13.00 $16.50
$15.00 $16.75

$1.50 $1.00

$11.00 $15.00
$8.00 $14.80
$8.00 $14.60
$8.00 $14.40



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

PR-17 Basic Cap - Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro or Buckle
Back, Sample Required with Embroidery
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-144
144+

PR-18 Basic Cap - Brushed Cotton Twill: 6 Panel w/Velcro
or Buckle Back, Sample Required
Quantity Price Breaks
13-36
37-72
73-144
144+
One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image)
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+

One-Time Embroidery Digitizing Fee (per image)
Stitch Count Charges:  Up to 10,000
Stitch Count Charges:  10,000+

TOTAL POINTS - PART B

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BX004
$9.00

$4.00 $9.00
$4.00 $8.90
$3.00 $8.80
$3.00 $8.70

BX001
$9.00

$5.00 $9.00
$5.00 $8.90
$3.00 $8.80
$3.00 $8.70

$12.00 per 1,000 stitches $45.00
$3.00 $45.00

$0.50 per add 1,000 stitches $0.60

32.98 58.976



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM#

DATE OF OPENING:  January 24, 2006 @ 10:00 A.M.
BID TITLE: Printed & Promotional Merchandise
BID:  06-120-MK

Fixed Percentage Discount
Up to 250
Up to 500
Up to 1,000
Up to 2,500
2,500 over

Average Set - Up Fee

Catalog Names:

REGIONS AWARDED - PART C
TOTAL POINTS - PART C

Part C - Catalog Discount/Balance of Line

The Incentive Mall StarStitch Embroidery Triangle T's Screen Printing
5625 Glann Rd 6020 3rd Ave. 2208 Wain Ranch Lane

Indianapolis, IN 46216 New Port Richey, FL 34653 Lutz, FL 33549
317-541-0569 727-847-6095 813-949-1833

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

No Bid
15.00%
15.00%
15.00%
15.00%
15.00%

Per Catalog

Hit Promotional Products
Positive Promotions


