
Date/Time:March 1, 2006:09:34:00 

 
 
 

Recommendation:   Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as 
lowest and best bids meeting written specifications and testing criteria. 
Term of Contract:   This is a one time purchase for office supplies to be stocked in the central 
warehouse to be utilized by the District.  
Notations and Exceptions:   
Item OS-01:  Recommend acceptance of bid from National Art & School Supplies as best bid 
meeting written specifications.  All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation 
purposes or, if samples were provided, samples did not meet testing criteria.  (i.e., poor color 
quality).  
 
Please see page 2 for additional notations.   
 
Savings were based upon the total average price for each item.  Offers from the vendors listed 
herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.  All other offers 
submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By: 
Joanne Hattaway, Secretary II, Community, Career, and Technical Education 
Mary Ellen Taylor, Secretary II, Staff Development 
Lois Knoer, Secretary II, Information Serivces 
Jerry Maciaszek, Graphic Services Manager  
Betsy Eanes, Secretary II, Employee Benefits 
Jan Stroh, Assistant II, Employee Benefits  
Bids Prepared By: 
Mina Kaeding, Buyer 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 

Bid Title Office Supplies – 
Warehouse Stock 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

109 

Bid Number 07-007-MK  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

31 

Date 
Solicited 

1/25/2006  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

13 

Date Opened 2/15/2006  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

0 

Date Board 
Presentation 

3/7/2006  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

13 

Total Savings $95,313.48  Grand Total of Bid $147,081.96 



Date/Time: 

Page 2 
07-007-MK Recommendation 
 

Items OS-02:  Reject – No samples were received for testing purposes as specified in bid documents.  Request 
permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. 
 
Items OS-07:  Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as best bid meeting written specifications.  
All lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes or, if samples were provided, 
samples did not meet testing criteria (i.e., durability). 
 
Items OS-08:  Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as best bid meeting written specifications.  
All lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes or, if samples were provided, 
samples did not meet testing criteria (i.e., durability). 
 
Items OS-11:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Bye Mo’R as best bid meeting written specifications.  All 
lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes or, if samples were provided, samples 
did not meet testing criteria (i.e., durability, color density). 
 
Items OS-16:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  All lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes or, if samples were 
provided, samples did not meet testing criteria (i.e., non-translucent). 
 
Items OS-17:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower priced bid did not meet testing criteria (i.e., jammed in various staplers and did not 
provide a consistent finish on the reverse side of the paper). 
 
Items OS-18:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Ace Office Supplies as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower priced bid did not meet testing criteria (i.e., did not provide a consistent finish). 
 
Items OS-19:  Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as best bid meeting written specifications.  
All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes. 
 
Items OS-29:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Apex Office Products as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  All lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes or, if samples were 
provided, samples did not meet testing criteria (i.e., durability). 
 
Items OS-33:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Apex Office Products as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes.  Bid from Standard 
Stationery was disqualified as vendor bid more than one alternate as specified in the bid documents. 
 
Items OS-34:  Recommend acceptance of bid from General Binding as best bid meeting written specifications.  
All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes. 
 
Items CP-39:  Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as best bid meeting written specifications.  
All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes. 
 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers 0.660 3,960.000 1.440 8,640.000 0.610 3,660.000

Sets Manufacturer

OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sets Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-02 1000 Surgestrips 17.990 17,990.000 12.880 12,880.000 No Bid
Each Manufacturer Fellows 99113

OS-04 720 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo 0.290 208.800 0.260 1,872.000 No Bid
Packages Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 2.490 298.800 16.730 2,007.600 2.980 357.600
Each Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 1.050 2,520.000 0.980 2,352.000 0.740 1,776.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-07 2000 File Folder, Letter, Hanging 3.990 7,980.000 5.020 10,040.000 3.580 7,160.000
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-08 400 File Folder, Legal, Hanging 5.490 2,196.000 6.540 2,616.000 4.680 1,872.000
Boxes Manufacturer Oxford 81622

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Liqui Mark 60540

Leonard 81300

Ampad 421 1/5

Ampad 422 1/5

Leonard 301E/order 100 pk

Leonard 900Bit

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

Avery 17752

Kensington 62663

Office Mate PCJ

3M C25

Sparco 64007

Esselte 81602

Eselte 81622

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

Status Plus 61042

Status Plus 61040

Liqui Mark 60540

Oxford 81602



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 4.950 14,850.000 8.290 24,870.000 4.980 14,940.000
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-12 240 Rubber Bands Large 1.890 453.600 No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-13 240 Rubberbands Standard 1.890 453.600 No Bid No Bid
Boxes

OS-14 600 Rubber Bands Assorted 1.790 1,074.000 No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer Leonard 56454

OS-15 2400 Scissors 0.720 1,728.000 1.610 3,864.000 0.480 1,152.000
Each Manufacturer Leoanrd 75812

OS-16 2400 Sheet Protectors 2.490 5,976.000 3.390 8,136.000 2.180 5,232.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-17 6000 Staples 0.390 2,340.000 0.390 2,340.000 .338 2,028.000
Boxes Manufacturer

Top Flight 576A File 10021-100

Sam Sill 42794

Leonard 84500

Leonard 56417

Leonard 56419

Esselte 57713

C-Line 90129

Hunt SE1

Fiskars 21087797

Status Plus 34150

Status Plus 66066

Status Plus 26183s/26184B



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 1.950 9,360.000 2.220 10,656.000 1.580 7,584.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C 3.960 2,851.200 6.720 4,838.400 3.720 2,678.400
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" Core No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C 4.920 3,542.400 8.280 5,961.600 4.580 3,297.000
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" Core No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 10.920 1,965.600 18.840 3,391.200 No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" Core No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

3M 6200

3M 6200

3M 6200

Leonard 8210

Leoanrd 49125

Leoanrd 49534

Leonard 49575

Hunt 73602 Staus Plus 66041

Mead All 60662

Mead All 60664



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 1.200 2,160.000 1.240 2,232.000 1.180 2,124.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 2.650 4,770.000 2.760 4,968.000 2.610 4,698.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5" 3.750 3,375.000 3.960 3,564.000 3.680 3,312.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-26 900 Post-It Notes, pink, 3"x3" 2.800 2,520.000 2.880 2,592.000 7.880 7,092.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-27 900 Post-It Notes, blue, 3"x3" 2.800 2,520.000 2.880 2,592.000 7.880 7,092.000
Packages Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers 0.220 440.000 0.240 480.000 0.160 320.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

3M Highland 6549

3M Highland 6559

3M 654PK

3M 654BE

3M 6549YW

3M 6559YW

3M 6549PK

3M 6549BE

3M 6539YWHighland 6539

Highland 6549

Highland 6559

Highland 6549PK

Highland 6549BE

Leoanrd 050

15,345.000

Officemate 95691

15,948.000

3M Highland 6539

24,318.000

Status Plus 66008

Total "All or None" Bid Price Items OS-23 Through OS-27



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

OS-29 600 Insertable Ring Binder Index 10.560 6,336.000 12.960 7,776.000 9.480 5,688.000
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-30 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips #1 4.500 4,050.000 4.600 4,140.000 2.680 2,412.000
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-31 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips, Jumbo 4.500 4,050.000 17.900 16,110.000 4.280 3,852.000
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler 1.820 2,184.000 6.720 8,064.000 2.880 3,456.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer 4.990 4,990.000 6.180 6,180.000 4.880 4,880.000
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 0.890 19,224.000 0.910 19,656.000 0.860 18,576.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

Status Plus 50024

Bostitch 42100

Zlabel 30200

WJ 27602

Oxford 81351 /50 per box

Status Plus 50039

Kleerfax 11905

Leoanrd 80033

Leoanrd 80050

Leoanrd 82105

Wilson Jones 27602

Z Intl 30200

Kleerfax 44905/36 per box

Bostitch 42100

Sparco 01603

Sparco 01604

Avery 30600

Avery 05711



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

Ace Office Supplies
631 Triumph Court Unit #5

Orlando, FL 32805
407-523-6440

Apex Office Products
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 1.550 7,440.000 1.570 7,536.000 1.520 7,296.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 2.450 4,410.000 2.390 4,302.600 2.360 4,248.000
Each Manufacturer

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-42 600 Folders, Hanging, Letter, Asst. Colors 6.990 4,194.000 7.080 4,248.000 5.180 3,108.000
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11" 8.000 32,000.000 10.790 43,160.000 6.880 27,520.000
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

WJ 27608

Zewar CRS100

Oxford 81612

WJ 27606

Esselte 81612

3M 903

Wilson Jone s27606

Wilson Jones 27608

Everett 915091

Image Data 221MR1500

Avery 05741

Avery 05731



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers

Sets Manufacturer

OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers
Sets Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-02 1000 Surgestrips
Each Manufacturer

OS-04 720 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Packages Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-07 2000 File Folder, Letter, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-08 400 File Folder, Legal, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1.260 7,560.000 1.320 7,920.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 15.900 15,900.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.070 2,568.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.930 7,860.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Avery 24052

Kensington 62689

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

AV2 17752

Leonard 900

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

Sanford 64077
Until 7/1/06/quantitied 900 boxes 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-12 240 Rubber Bands Large
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-13 240 Rubberbands Standard
Boxes

OS-14 600 Rubber Bands Assorted
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-15 2400 Scissors
Each Manufacturer

OS-16 2400 Sheet Protectors 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-17 6000 Staples 
Boxes Manufacturer

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

4.830 14,490.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 2.770 6,648.000 No Bid

1.650 3,960.000 4.300 10,320.000 No Bid

0.400 2,400.000 No Bid No Bid

ACME 41218

C-Line 62108

File EZ 80128

C-Line 90126

Leonard



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

2.920 14,016.000 2.850 13,680.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

14.000 10,080.000 No Bid No Bid

5.230 3,765.600 No Bid No Bid

18.350 13,212.000 No Bid No Bid

6.940 4,996.800 No Bid No Bid

34.500 6,210.000 No Bid No Bid

14.740 2,653.200 No Bid No Bid

Bostitich B440

3M 6200

3M 6200

3M 810

3M 810

3M 810

3M 6200

Bostitch B440



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-26 900 Post-It Notes, pink, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-27 900 Post-It Notes, blue, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

Total "All or None" Bid Price Items OS-23 Through OS-27

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

3.200 5,760.000 No Bid No Bid

1.010 1,818.000 No Bid No Bid

7.510 13,518.000 No Bid No Bid

2.220 3,996.000 No Bid No Bid

9.940 8,946.000 No Bid No Bid

3.200 2,880.000 No Bid No Bid

8.120 7,308.000 No Bid No Bid

8.120 7,308.000 No Bid No Bid

42,840.000
0.280 560.000 0.250 500.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

6559

Bostitch G600K

3M 6539

3M 6549

3M 653

3M 654

Bostitch G600

655

3M 654

3M 654BE

23,310.000



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-29 600 Insertable Ring Binder Index 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-30 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips #1 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-31 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips, Jumbo 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

20.000 12,000.000 15.860 9,516.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 2.890 3,468.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 17.770 17,770.000 No Bid

No Bid 4.930 4,930.000 No Bid

1.040 22,464.000 *.877 18,943.200 0.840 18,144.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

GBC 8313001

Zlabel 30200

Avery CV11 10WESparco 05711

Avery 11109 Kleer Fax 44905

Bostitch 42100

Avery 5160



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-42 600 Folders, Hanging, Letter, Asst. Colors
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973

Bye MO'R
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

General Binding 
1 GBC Plaza

Northbrook, IL 60062

1.670 8,016.000 1.515 7,272.000 1.240 5,952.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.300 4,140.000 2.324 4,183.200 22.680 3,402.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

13.500 54.000.00 No Bid No Bid

6.540 26,160.000 No Bid No Bid
Ship all or none Order in cartons of 12

GBC 8313003

GBC 8313051

Pearson Image 10110

3M PP2200

Avery CV11 20WE

Avery CV11 25WE

05731

05741



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers

Sets Manufacturer

OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers
Sets Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-02 1000 Surgestrips
Each Manufacturer

OS-04 720 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Packages Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-07 2000 File Folder, Letter, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-08 400 File Folder, Legal, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1.670 10,020.000 2.180 13,080.000 0.980 5,880.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

21.770 21,770.000 39.990 39,990.000 No Bid

0.410 295.200 0.390 280.800 No Bid

17.770 2,132.400 24.250 2,910.000 14.700 1,764.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

0.940 2,256.000 0.440 2,376.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.910 17,820.000 4.650 9,300.000 No Bid

11.460 4,584.000 6.150 2,460.000 No Bid

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

Dixon 47033

3M C25

Avery AVE17752

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

DiTek DTK8FF

Universal UNV72220

Scotch MMML25

Universal 15001

Universal 14115

Universal 14215

Oxford ESS4152 1/5

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

Sparco 64007

Sparco 01526

Fellows 99016

Sparco 85009

3M C25

Oxford CSS4153 1/5



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-12 240 Rubber Bands Large
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-13 240 Rubberbands Standard
Boxes

OS-14 600 Rubber Bands Assorted
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-15 2400 Scissors
Each Manufacturer

OS-16 2400 Sheet Protectors 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-17 6000 Staples 
Boxes Manufacturer

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

14.080 42,240.000 17.180 51,540.000 5.230 15,690.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.840 681.600 1.560 374.400 No Bid

2.840 681.600 1.560 374.400 No Bid

0.940 530.160 1.560 936.000 No Bid

23.580 56,592.000 No Bid No Bid

5.260 12,624.000 4.080 9,792.000 No Bid

1.130 6,780.000 0.540 3,240.000 No Bid

Unviersal 00119

Universal 00154

Universal 21126

Universal 79000

File EZ 80128DuoTang ESS5412800

Universal 01117Sparco 107

Sparco 191

Sparco 54

Clauss 352XN

Oxford 57713

Sparco 74102

ACE 74001



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

4.710 22,608.000 10.470 50,256.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

17.520 12,614.400 1.670 12,024.000 12.660 9,115.200

No Bid No Bid No Bid

22.080 15,896.000 1.940 4,656.000 15.300 11,016.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

43.320 7,797.600 1.970 3,546.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Swingline 74701

Scotch MMM810

Scotch MMM810

Scotch MMM810

3M 810-12

3M 810343M 810

3M 810

Bostitch B440BK

33M 810



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-26 900 Post-It Notes, pink, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-27 900 Post-It Notes, blue, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

Total "All or None" Bid Price Items OS-23 Through OS-27

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

1.400 2,520.000 4.110 7,398.000 2.840 5,112.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.000 5,400.000 12.920 23,256.000 6.340 11,412.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.560 4,104.000 No Bid 8.920 8,028.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Discontinued No Bid No Bid 7.680 6,912.000

Discontinued No Bid No Bid 7.680 6,912.000

0.250 500.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Post It MMM653RPYW

Post It MMm654RPYW

3M 654PK

38,376.000

3M 654BE

3M 653

3M 654

3M 655

Sparco 8600

Sparco 19783

Sparco 19784

Sparco 19772



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-29 600 Insertable Ring Binder Index 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-30 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips #1 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-31 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips, Jumbo 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

26.880 16,128.000 No Bid No Bid

4.400 3,960.000 No Bid No Bid

16.700 15,030.000 No Bid No Bid

5.730 6,876.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.590 7,590.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.050 22,680.000 2.250 48,600.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

WJ 36214W

Avery 30600

Sparco 05711

Avery 11109

Sparco 01603

Sparco 01604

Bostitch 42100



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-42 600 Folders, Hanging, Letter, Asst. Colors
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065

MG Office Products
1644 Land O Lakes Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32216

2.010 9,648.000 3.710 17,808.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.610 4,698.000 94.200 14,130.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.600 5,160.000 13.890 8,334.000 No Bid

12.960 51,840.000 22.000 88,000.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Oxford 81612

MMMPP2200

WJ 36244W

WJ 36249W

Sparco 05731

Sparco 05741

Sparco SP5215AST

Sparco 01852



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers

Sets Manufacturer

OS-01 6000 Highlighting Markers
Sets Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-02 1000 Surgestrips
Each Manufacturer

OS-04 720 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Packages Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-05 120 3" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer

OS-06 2400 1" Core Tape Dispenser 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-07 2000 File Folder, Letter, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-08 400 File Folder, Legal, Hanging 
Boxes Manufacturer

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
No Bid 0.640 3,840.000 1.120 6,720.000 0.500 3,000.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.590 3,540.000

No Bid 11.640 11,640.000 No Bid 11.450 11,450.000

No Bid 2.640 1,900.800 0.320 230.400 2.430 1,749.600

No Bid 1.990 238.800 1.750 210.000 1.730 207.600

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 0.760 1,824.000 0.640 1,536.000 0.754 809.600

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 3.300 6,600.000 No Bid 3.180 6,360.000

No Bid 4.220 1,688.000 No Bid 4.140 1,656.000

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Ampad 422

Dixon 47303

School Smart Leonard 59972

School Smart 081904

Ningbo 040617

Tripp Lite 808

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

Liqui Mark 60540

Leoanrd 301E

Status Plus 61042

Status Plus 61040

Ampad 421 

Ampad 422

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Liqui Mark L5004

EMPHASIZER 814

Fellows 99015

Office Mate PC-G

Standard G250

Standard C38

Ampad 421

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-11 3000 Double Pocket Portfolios 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-12 240 Rubber Bands Large
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-13 240 Rubberbands Standard
Boxes

OS-14 600 Rubber Bands Assorted
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-15 2400 Scissors
Each Manufacturer

OS-16 2400 Sheet Protectors 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-17 6000 Staples 
Boxes Manufacturer

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

No Bid 4.180 12,540.000 No Bid Disqu No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 1.900 285.600 No Bid No Bid

No Bid 0.294 70.560 1.560 374.400 No Bid

No Bid 0.280 168.000 1.560 936.000 0.308 184.800

No Bid 0.510 1,224.000 No Bid Disq No Bid

No Bid 1.810 4,344.000 No Bid 1.340 3,216.000

No Bid 0.320 1,920.000 2.150 12,900.000 0.298 1,788.000

Premier 4229U

Standard STBC

School smart 599919/16 inch

School Smart 59954

Alliance Eco 117

Alliance Eco 19

Alliance Eco 54

DuoTang 5482800

Status Plus 26183

ng Line Speed Point S703554

General 54PKG

Boston 73785B

Leonard 48145



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer

OS-18 4800 Staple Machines 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-19 720 Tape, 1/2"x1296' Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-20 720 Tape, 3/4"x1296'  Magic Transp., 1" C
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-22 180 Tape, 3/4" x 2592' Magic Transp., 3" 
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

No Bid 1.590 7,632.000 1.580 7,584.000 Disq No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 3.720 2,678.400 No Bid 5.590 4,024.800

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 4.020 5,054.040 No Bid 7.050 5,076.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 10.800 1,944.000 No Bid 15.310 2,755.800

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LePage 44102

LePage 44001

LePage 44101

School Smart 038178

Leoanrd 49734

Leoanrd 49575

Status Plus 66041

Leonard 49512



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-23 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 1 1/2"x2" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-24 1800 Post-It Notes, yel. 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer

OS-25 900 Post-It Notes, yel. 3" x 5"
Packages Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-26 900 Post-It Notes, pink, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-27 900 Post-It Notes, blue, 3"x3" 
Packages Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer

OS-28 2000 Staple Removers
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

Total "All or None" Bid Price Items OS-23 Through OS-27

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

No Bid 0.990 1,782.000 1.050 1,890.000 0.938 1,688.480

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 2.160 3,880.000 2.280 4,104.000 2.070 3,726.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 3.130 2,817.000 3.290 2,961.000 3.040 2,736.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 2.600 2,340.000 2.910 2,619.000 2.070 1,863.000

No Bid 2.600 2,340.000 2.910 2,619.000 2.070 1,863.000

11,876.400

No Bid 0.128 256.000 0.170 340.000 0.122 244.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Beautone 11031

Standard 32002

Beautone 11032

Beautone 11110

Beautone 11030

Beuatone 11050

3M Highland 6549PK

3M Highland 6549BE

14,193.000

School Smart 000189

3M Highland 6539

3M Highland 6549YW

3M Highland 6559

Status Plus 66008

3M Highland 6549PK

3M Highland 6549BE

13,167.000

3M Highland 6539

3M Highland 6559

3M Highland 6549



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-29 600 Insertable Ring Binder Index 
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-30 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips #1 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-31 900 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips, Jumbo 
Cartons Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer

OS-32 1200 Hand-Held Stapler
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer

OS-33 1000 Labels, Laser Printer
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-34 21,600 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 1", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

No Bid 10.980 6,588.000 *15.36 9,216.000 7.840 4,704.000

No Bid 2.860 2,574.000 1.300 1,170.000 4.060 3,654.000

No Bid 4.260 3,834.000 No Bid No Bid

No Bid 1.690 2,028.000 No Bid 2.820 3,384.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.690 4,428.000

No Bid 4.920 4,920.000 No Bid DISQ No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.720 37,152.000 .875 18,900.000 0.930 20,088.000 0.824 17,798.400

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.080 23,328.000
WJ 27602

Offcie Mate 97100

Bostitch 42100

SWING LINE 09901.99PL

WJ 36214W

WJ 54309

Samsill 18537

Leonard 93333

Leonard 93350

Status Plus 66040

Zlabel 30200

Pride 3B6102

School Smart 081940

School Smart 023959

ool Smart GBC SSOV1RRW

Oxford 81351



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING:February 15, 2006 @ 2:00 P.M.
TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-007-MK

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-35 4800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 2", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer

OS-36 1800 3-Ring Presentation Binder, 3", 
Each Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

OS-42 600 Folders, Hanging, Letter, Asst. Colors
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer

CP-39 4000 Transparency Film, 8-1/2" x 11"
Boxes Manufacturer - ALTERNATE 

UNIT PRICETOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Standard Stationery
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090

Pride Enterprises
12425 28th St. North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.

Greenville, WI 54942

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

2.520 12,096.000 1.550 7.440.00 1.540 7,392.000 1.460 7,008.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.670 8,016.000

2.600 4,680.000 2.420 4,356.000 2.280 4,104.000 2.210 3,978.000

No Bid 2.470 4,446.000
No Bid No Bid

No Bid 5.250 3,150.000 No Bid 5.250 3,150.000

No Bid 6.300 25,200.000 No Bid 6.890 27,560.000

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

WJ 27608

Oxford 81612

Zelar CRS106

WJ 36244W

WJ 27606

WJ 36249W

Samsill 18567

Samsill 18587

Will not honor split shipments

Oxford 81612

Precision 10110

Pride 3B6104

Pride 3B6106

School Smart GBC SS0V2r

School Smart GBC SSOV3R


