District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Classroom Supplies- Number of Vendors 312
Warehouse Stock/Part | Notified
Bid Number 07-008-MK Number of Bids 84
Distributed
Date 12/22/2005 . Number of Vendors 22
Solicited Responding
Date Opened 21212006 Number of Vendors Not 2
Bidding
Date Board 3/7/2006 Number of Vendors 20
Presentation Bidding
Total Savings $85,601.36 | Grand Total of Bid $95,409.00

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as
lowest and best bid meeting written specifications and testing criteria.

Term of Contract: This is a one time purchase for classroom supplies to be stocked in the
Central Warehouse to be utilized by various Departments and Schools.

Notations and Exceptions: Two No Bids were received from Dick Blick and All Flag &
Flagpoles, Inc.  Savings were based upon the total average price for each item.

Please see page 2 for additional notations

Item CS-03: Reject — No samples were received for testing purposes. Request permission to
obtain quotes and purchase on the open market.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening
date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby
rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:

Betsy Eanes, Secretary, Employee Benefits

Jan Hawkins, Secretary, Food & Nutrition

Joanne Hattaway, Secretary, Community Career Technical Center
Amber Robinson, Secretary, Curriculum and Instructional Services
Liz Supeau, Bookkeeper, Curriculum and Instructional Service

Bids Prepared By:
Gail Fowler, CPPB, Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized By:
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

DATE/TIME:



Page 2
07-008-MK
Recommendation

Item CS-07: Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-08: Recommend acceptance of alternate bid from Liberty Flags as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-08A: Reject — Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market as no bids were
received for this item.

Item CS-9A: Recommend acceptance of bid from S& S World Wide as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-12: Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-14: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-15: Reject — Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. All lower priced bids
either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified in the bid documents or if samples were provided,
they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor durability, color bleeds).

Item CS-16: Reject — Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. All lower priced bids
either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified in the bid documents or if samples were provided,
they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor durability, color bleeds).

Item CS-17: Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications — all lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in the bid documents
or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., sharpens hard and rough, smoothness of finish
and inadequate handle).

Item CS-18: Recommend acceptance of bid from AFP Industries as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., did not clean clearly leaving
ink behind).

Item CS-21: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-22B: Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting written

specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

DATE/TIME: March 1,2006 09:36:00



Page 3
07-008-MK
Recommendation

Item CS-32: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-35: Reject — Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market as no samples were
received for this item

Item CS-45: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified;
or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., flimsy, poor durability).

Item CS-49: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-50: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-51: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

Item CS-53 and CS-54: Reject — Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market as no
samples were provided for testing purposes.

Item CS-55: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting written
specifications and testing criteria. All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for testing purposes as specified in
the bid documents.

DATE/TIME:



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m. AFP Industries Amerilam Supply Group Bye Mo'R, Inc. Competitive Edge

BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock P.O. Box 43-0747 5544 Washington Pike P.O. Box 107 P.O. Box 439086

BID #07-008-MK South Miami, FL 33243-0747 Knoxville, TN 37918 Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107 Chicago, IL 60643

305-663-8300 800-895-2747 800-847-9219 866-848-2049

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICH

CS-03 ART GUM ERASERS (12/box, 24 boxes per case) (240) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000) 1.88/box of 2 940.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Status Plus 13061

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-06 U.S.A.FLAGS (1,200) 5.520 6,624.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 23761000

CS-07 FLAG, STATE OUTDOOR (100) 15.480 1,548.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 35232090/Nylon

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR (100) 16.280 1,628.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 35111000

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-08A FLAG, US w/STAND-PLASTIC 6" (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE4o0z. (12/box) (1,200) 4.080 4,896.000 No Bid 3.990 4,788.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers E304NR Elmers E304

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300) 5.840 1,752.000 No Bid 5.960 1,788.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers E395NR Elmers E395

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNTE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747
South Miami, FL 33243-0747
305-663-8300

Amerilam Supply Group
5544 Washington Pike
Knoxville, TN 37918
800-895-2747

Bye Mo'R, Inc.

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

800-847-9219

Competitive Edge
P.O. Box 439086
Chicago, IL 60643
866-848-2049

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICH

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid 1.650  1,980.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 13308

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-13  PEN OVERHEAD BLACK REMOV. 12/PKG.(1,200) 1.940 2,328.000 No Bid 6.500  7,800.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark L2121 Sanford Tranis 1600X

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG. (2,400) 0.880 2,112.000 No Bid 2.190  5,256.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 12004 VisaVis 16074

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG. (600) 1.980 1,188.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Liqui Mark 17121 Discontinued

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG. (600) 1.180 708.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 17406 Discontinued

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) 5.680 6,816.000 No Bid 6.340  7,608.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Status Plus 10004 Boston KS/min 240

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) 1.180 3,540.000 No Bid 31.000  3,875.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Correct Solutions 50000 Evans 50000

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747
South Miami, FL 33243-0747
305-663-8300

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" Box (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-29 PUSHPINS (100 per box) (1,000 cases)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

No Bid

2.680 1,608.000
ACME 10207

2.680 1,608.000
ACME 10212

0.328 3,280.000
Status Plus 53012

No Bid

No Bid

Amerilam Supply Group Bye Mo'R, Inc. Competitive Edge
5544 Washington Pike P.O. Box 107 P.O. Box 439086
Knoxville, TN 37918 Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107 Chicago, IL 60643
800-895-2747 800-847-9219 866-848-2049
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICE
No Bid 4.040  7,272.000 No Bid
ACME 10526
No Bid 2.700  1,620.000 No Bid
ACME 10207
No Bid
No Bid 2.700  1,620.000 No Bid
ACME 10212
No Bid
No Bid 0.490 49,000.000 No Bid
CLI 20AR
29.000  17,400.000 No Bid 14.950 17,940.000
Translin Rap FGS1524 DryLam SL25511
No Bid
No Bid 31.50/24  3,150.000 No Bid

Pacon 3763/0One shipment Fee Freight




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747
South Miami, FL 33243-0747
305-663-8300

Amerilam Supply Group
5544 Washington Pike
Knoxville, TN 37918
800-895-2747

Bye Mo'R, Inc.

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

800-847-9219

Competitive Edge
P.O. Box 439086
Chicago, IL 60643
866-848-2049

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICH

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN (1000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN (100) 0.350 350.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Status Plus 51050

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) 1.380 6,624.000 No Bid 2.309 11,083.200 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 25400 Expo 2 80074

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) 2.680 12,864.000 No Bid 4599 22,075.200 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 25800 Expo2 80078

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) 1.380 3,312.000 No Bid 2.320  5,568.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Liqui Mark 24400 Expo2 82074

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) 2.680 6,432.000 No Bid 5.355 12,852.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 24800 Expo 88078

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747
South Miami, FL 33243-0747
305-663-8300

Amerilam Supply Group
5544 Washington Pike

Knoxville, TN 37918 Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

800-895-2747

Bye Mo'R, Inc.
P.O. Box 107

800-847-9219

Competitive Edge

P.O. Box 439086

Chicago, IL 60643
866-848-2049

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEUNIT PRICETOTAL PRICH

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL .5MM EACH (1,200) 24.60 box of 2,460.000 No Bid 25.200  2,525.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Page Mate/Sanford 64051 Logo | San 64051

CS-54 LEAD REFILLS (12 leads per tube) (1,200 tubes) 4.68 box of 1 468.000 No Bid 4,720  5,664.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Page Mate Sanford 64761 Sanford 64761
Total All or None for Items CS-53 and CS-54 2,928.000 No Bid 8,189.000 No Bid

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.) (2,400) 5.040 12,096.000 No Bid 5.808 13,939.200 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Eagle 22420 Dixon 12872

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD (12/Box) (720) 8.280 5,961.600 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model #

Status Plus 06056




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m. Con Serv Flag Company CVS Wholesale Flag Elgin School Supply Co. Gator Office Products

BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock 1003 Illinois St. 1139 S. Baldwin Ave. 260 Ryan Ave. 6160 Beach Blvd.

BID #07-008-MK Sidney, NE 69162 Marion, IN 46953 Chico, CA 95973 Jacksonville, FL 32216

308-254-4720 800-825-1100 530-894-6338 904-725-1144

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-03 ART GUM ERASERS (12/box, 24 boxes per case) (240) No Bid No Bid 1.830 439.200 5.040 1,209.600
Manufacturer and Model # General Pencil 137 Sanford 73030

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000) No Bid No Bid 2.520 1,260.000 8.640 4,320.000
Manufacturer and Model # General Pencil 102E Paper Mate 70520

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-06 U.S.A.FLAGS (1,200) 44.850 5,820.000 5.000  6,000.000 7.300 8,760.000 10.000 12,000.000
Manufacturer and Model # Atlas CVS CF23 Valley Forge 23761000 Annin 043100

CS-07 FLAG, STATE OUTDOOR (100) 18.500 1,850.000 11.700  1,170.000 16.200 1,620.000 49.370 4,935.600
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forg 35232090/Nylon CVS N35FL/Nylon Valley Forge 35343090/Nylon  Annin 35232095

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR (100) 15.500 1,550.000 11.670  1,167.000 17.150 1,715.000 24.490 2,449.000
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forg 35211000/Nylon CVS N35 Valley Forge 3511100 Annin 2460

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-08A FLAG, US w/STAND-PLASTIC 6" (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE4o0z. (12/box) (1,200) No Bid 3.950 4,740.000 12.240 14,688.000
Manufacturer and Model # No Bid Elmers E372 Borden E372

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300) No Bid No Bid 5.700 1,710.000 9.850 2,955.000
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers E395 Borden E395

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNTE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Con Serv Flag Company
1003 Illinois St.
Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

CVS Wholesale Flag
1139 S. Baldwin Ave.
Marion, IN 46953
800-825-1100

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.
Jacksonville, FL 32216
904-725-1144

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid 1.179 1,414.800 2.960 3,552.000
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 13304-11/32 Dixon 13308

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD BLACK REMOV. 12/PKG.(1,200) No Bid No Bid 6.156 7,387.200 9.360 11,232.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 16001 San 16001

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG. (2,400) No Bid No Bid 2.065 4,956.000 2.680 6,432.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 16074 San 16074

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.680 6,408.000
Manufacturer and Model # STD 3189

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.950 2,370.000
Manufacturer and Model # STD 318WP4

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid 5.770 6,924.000 8.260 9,912.000
Manufacturer and Model # Boston KS1031 Hunt 1031

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid 1.160 3,480.000 1.860 5,580.000
Manufacturer and Model # UnDO 5000 San 81823

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Con Serv Flag Company
1003 Illinois St.
Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

CVS Wholesale Flag
1139 S. Baldwin Ave.
Marion, IN 46953

800-825-1100

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.
Jacksonville, FL 32216
904-725-1144

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" Box (1,800) No Bid No Bid 1.440 2,592.000 2.760 4,968.000
Manufacturer and Model # ACME 10526 SPR 01488

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid 2.940 1,764.000 5.040 3,024.000
Manufacturer and Model # KleenCut 241B ACM 10207

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid 2.950 1,770.000 5.040 3,024.000
Manufacturer and Model # ACME 241S ACM 10212

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-29 PUSHPINS (100 per box) (1,000 cases) No Bid No Bid 0.560 5,600.000 0.460 460.000
Manufacturer and Model # Leonard 200AR/56. per case  SPR 81001

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.860 80,232.000
Manufacturer and Model # SPR 01158

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.100 7,440.000
Manufacturer and Model # SHW SB24R




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.
Jacksonville, FL 32216
904-725-1144

Con Serv Flag Company
1003 Illinois St.
Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

CVS Wholesale Flag
1139 S. Baldwin Ave.
Marion, IN 46953
800-825-1100

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN (1000) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.660 3,320.000
Manufacturer and Model # ACCO 71502/1/2"-3/8 Not avail

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.010 2,010.000
Manufacturer and Model # ACCO 71504

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid 2.170 10,416.000 3.020 14,496.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 80074 Sanford 83074

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid 4.385 21,048.000 6.840 32,832.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 80078 Sanford 83078

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid 2.185 5,244.000 3.680 8,832.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 82074 Expo Sanford 88074

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid *7.11 17,064.000
Manufacturer and Model # No 8-color bullet point set Sanford 88078

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Con Serv Flag Company
1003 Illinois St.
Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

CVS Wholesale Flag
1139 S. Baldwin Ave.
Marion, IN 46953
800-825-1100

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Gator Office Products
6160 Beach Blvd.
Jacksonville, FL 32216
904-725-1144

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL .5MM EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid 2.120 2,544.000 3.130 3,756.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 64051 Paper Mate 64051

CS-54 LEAD REFILLS (12 leads per tube) (1,200 tubes) No Bid No Bid 0.250 300.000 0.510 612.000
Manufacturer and Model # Pentel 1008B Pentel C505HB
Total All or None for Items CS-53 and CS-54 No Bid No Bid 2,844.000 4,368.000

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.) (2,400) No Bid 7.470 17,928.000 6.490 15,576.000
Manufacturer and Model # No Bid General 3652 Dix 14412

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD (12/Box) (720) No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.800 14,256.000
Manufacturer and Model # San 81505

* Item will be discontinued




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

General Binding Corporation
1 GBC Plaza

Liberty Flags, Inc.
2606 S. Sheridan Road
Norhtbrook, IL 60062 Tulsa, OK 74129

800-723-4000 918-834-1110

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes Blvd.
Lutz, FL 33549

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065
866-381-5001

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-03 ART GUM ERASERS (12/box, 24 boxes per case) (240)

CS-05

CS-05

CS-06

CS-07

CS-08

CS-08

CS-08A

CS-09

CS-09A

CS-09A

Manufacturer and Model #

PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

U.S.A. FLAGS (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

FLAG, STATE OUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

FLAG, US OUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

FLAG, US OUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

FLAG, US w/STAND-PLASTIC 6" (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

GLUE 4 oz. (12/box) (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

GLUE GALLON (300)
Manufacturer and Model #

GLUE GALLON (300)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNTE

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid 4.300 5,160.000

Liberty US2436PC

No Bid 16.900 1,690.000

Valley Forge 35232090
No Bid 13.900 1,390.000
Valley Forge 35111000

12.000 1,200.000
Liberty US35N
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

28.000 6,720.000
Quartet ESP31
14.100 14,100.000
Paper Mate 70520
No Bid
No Bid
38.950 3,895.000

Advantis MBE002460

No Bid
10.200 12,240.000

Elmers Hun E304
18.790 5,637.000

Elmers HUN E395

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

General Binding Corporation
1 GBC Plaza
Norhtbrook, IL 60062
800-723-4000

2606 S. Sheridan Road

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes Blvd.
Lutz, FL 33549

Liberty Flags, Inc.

Tulsa, OK 74129
918-834-1110

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065
866-381-5001

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.680 1,896.000
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 13308

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD BLACK REMOV. 12/PKG.(1,200) No Bid No Bid 1.430 1,716.000 5.960 7,152.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 16001 Sanford 16001

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG. (2,400) No Bid No Bid 5.650 13,560.000 2.060 4,944.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 16074 Sanford 16074

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid 1.850 1,110.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Staedler STP3189

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid 7.400 4,400.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Staedler STD 318WP4

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid 15.990 19,188.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # X-Acto HNN1031

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid 9.95/16 oz. 14,850.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Quartet 550

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

General Binding Corporation
1 GBC Plaza
Norhtbrook, IL 60062
800-723-4000

Liberty Flags, Inc.
2606 S. Sheridan Road
Tulsa, OK 74129
918-834-1110

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes Blvd.
Lutz, FL 33549

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065
866-381-5001

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" Box (1,800) No Bid No Bid 0.890 1,602.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Universal UnV59022

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid 111.28 per box 66,768.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # ACME United 10200

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid 86.950 52,170.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # ACME 44216

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-29 PUSHPINS (100 per box) (1,000 cases) No Bid No Bid 1.180 11,800.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Universal 31310

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) 26.020 15,612.000 No Bid 45.360 54,432.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # GBC 3000004 GBC 300004

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model #




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

General Binding Corporation
1 GBC Plaza
Norhtbrook, IL 60062
800-723-4000

Liberty Flags, Inc.
2606 S. Sheridan Road
Tulsa, OK 74129
918-834-1110

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes Blvd.
Lutz, FL 33549

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065
866-381-5001

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN (1000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid 4.190 20,112.000 2,510  12,048.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 83074 Expo 83074

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid 8.640 41,472.000 5.020  24,096.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 83078 Expo 83078

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid 4.190 10,056.000 2.600 6,240.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 88074 Sanford 88074

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid 8.640 20,736.000 5130  12,312.000
Manufacturer and Model # Expo San 88078 Sanford 88078

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes Blvd.
Lutz, FL 33549

General Binding Corporation
1 GBC Plaza

Liberty Flags, Inc.
2606 S. Sheridan Road
Norhtbrook, IL 60062 Tulsa, OK 74129

800-723-4000 918-834-1110

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave.
Rahway, NJ 07065
866-381-5001

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL .5MM EACH (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-54 LEAD REFILLS (12 leads per tube) (1,200 tubes)

Manufacturer and Model #
Total All or None for Items CS-53 and CS-54

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.) (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD (12/Box) (720)
Manufacturer and Model #

No Bid No Bid 66.450 79,740.000
Paper Mate 64051

No Bid No Bid 12.570 15,084.000
Universal 32905

No Bid No Bid 94,824.000

No Bid No Bid 1.990 4,776.000
Universal 55400

No Bid No Bid 39.000 28,080.000

Expo San 81505

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m. Oriental Trading Company Polyvision Pyramid School Products Quill Corporation

BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock 5405 S. 90th Street 3970 John's Creek Ct. Suite 325 6510 North 54th Street 100 Schelter Road

BID #07-008-MK Omaha, NE 68127-3501 Suwanee, GA 30024 Tampa, FL 33610 Lincolnshire, IL 60069

402-596-1212 678-542-3100 813-621-6446 800-634-4809

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-03 ART GUM ERASERS (12/box, 24 boxes per case) (240) No Bid No Bid 1.00 doz 240.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Vitagum 1144427/24 box

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000) No Bid No Bid .80 doz 1,600.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Leonard 71504

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-06 U.S.A. FLAGS (1,200) No Bid No Bid 5.200 520.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 23761000

CS-07 FLAG, STATE OUTDOOR (100) No Bid No Bid 16.700 1,670.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Annin 140960

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100) No Bid No Bid 14.600 1,416.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 3511100

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-08A FLAG, US w/STAND-PLASTIC 6" (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4o0z. (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid 3.640 4,368.000 4.080 4,896.000
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers E304 Elmers E304NR

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300) No Bid No Bid 5.250 1,575.000 5.180 1,554.000
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers E395 Elmers E395NR

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNTE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m. Oriental Trading Company Polyvision Pyramid School Products Quill Corporation

BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock 5405 S. 90th Street 3970 John's Creek Ct. Suite 325 6510 North 54th Street 100 Schelter Road

BID #07-008-MK Omaha, NE 68127-3501 Suwanee, GA 30024 Tampa, FL 33610 Lincolnshire, IL 60069

402-596-1212 678-542-3100 813-621-6446 800-634-4809

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid 1.290 1,548.000 2.370 2,844.000
Manufacturer and Model # Musgrave 500T Dixon 33312

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD BLACK REMOV. 12/PKG.(1,200) No Bid No Bid 6.120 7,344.000 7.140 8,568.000
Manufacturer and Model # Visual Sanford 16001 Sanford 16001

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG. (2,400) No Bid No Bid 2.050  4,920.000 2.130 5,112.000
Manufacturer and Model # Visual Sanford 16074 Sanford 16074

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid 1.940 1,164.000 5.050 3,030.000
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 17121 Dixon 92207

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid 1.160 696.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark 17400

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid 5.590 6,708.000 9.010 10,812.000
Manufacturer and Model # Leonard 89508 Boston 1034Q

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid 3.150 9,450.000 1.030  3,090.000 1.500  4,500.000
Manufacturer and Model # Polyvision Azor PT5000 Sanford 81823

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Oriental Trading Company
5405 S. 90th Street
Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Polyvision
3970 John's Creek Ct. Suite 325
Suwanee, GA 30024
678-542-3100

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" Box (1,800) No Bid No Bid 0.915 1,647.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Pyramid 1111518

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) 4.280 5,136.000 No Bid 2.360 1,416.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Hands on Fun 575534 Kleencut 2418 4-1/2

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) 4.280 5,136.000 No Bid 2.360 1,416.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Hands on Fun 575514 Kleencut 2415

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-29 PUSHPINS (100 per box) (1,000 cases) No Bid No Bid 0.300 300.000].23/22.08 csase  22,080.000
Manufacturer and Model # Pyramid 1286178 Quill 111732L

CS-32  LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid 11.980 14,376.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # GBC 3000004

CS-32  LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH (2,400) No Bid No Bid 1.570 3,768.000 No Bid

Manufacturer and Model #

Showboard 1247535




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Oriental Trading Company
5405 S. 90th Street
Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Polyvision

3970 John's Creek Ct. Suite 325
Suwanee, GA 30024
678-542-3100

Pyramid School Products

6510 North 54th S

813-621-6446

Tampa, FL 33610

treet

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road
Lincolnshire, IL 60069

800-634-4809

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN (1000) No Bid No Bid 0.300 300.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Leonard 1RBP

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN (100) No Bid No Bid 0.475 475.000 0.580 14,500.000
Manufacturer and Model # Leonard 4RBP Quill 99814

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid 2.100 10,080.000 2.680 12,864.000 2.550  12,240.000
Manufacturer and Model # Polyvision 100 per box Sanford Expo 83074 Sanford 80074Q

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid 5.280 25,344.000 5930 28,464.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 83078 Sanford 83078

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid 2.180 5,232.000 2.550 6,120.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 82074 Sanford 82074

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) No Bid No Bid 5.330 12,792.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 88078

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

Oriental Trading Company
5405 S. 90th Street
Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Polyvision
3970 John's Creek Ct. Suite 325
Suwanee, GA 30024
678-542-3100

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL .5MM EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid 1.990 2,388.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Logo 2 64051

CS-54 LEAD REFILLS (12 leads per tube) (1,200 tubes) No Bid No Bid 0.400 480.000 0.340 408.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 64761 Pentel LC5054B
Total All or None for Items CS-53 and CS-54 No Bid No Bid 2,868.000 Disqualified

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.) (2,400) No Bid No Bid 4.080 9,792.000 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model # Musgrave Prospector Il

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD (12/Box) (720) No Bid No Bid 3.600 2,292.000 15.480 11,145.600
Manufacturer and Model # Pyramid 1099274 Sanford 81505




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT, 06415
800-243-9232

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.
Greenville, WI 54942
888-388-3224

Smith Office & Computer Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.
Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE A TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-03 ART GUM ERASERS (12/box, 24 boxes per case) (240) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.370 328.800
Manufacturer and Model # Standard AG100

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000) No Bid 6.22 box 3,110.000 No Bid 1.250 1,250.000
Manufacturer and Model # Paper Mate Pink Pearl 70520 Standards GS 100

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER (2 dozen per box) (1,000) 1.600 800.000 No Bid 0.850 850.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE School Smart 077355 Standards G90

CS-06 U.S.A. FLAGS (1,200) No Bid 6.840 8,208.000 No Bid 5.620 6,744.000
Manufacturer and Model # Annin 043100/Staff 7/16 x 48 Valley Foge 2376100

CS-07 FLAG, STATE OUTDOOR (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.260 1,926.000
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 35332090/Polyester

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.060 1,406.000
Manufacturer and Model # Valley Forge 35111000

CS-08 FLAG, USOUTDOOR (100)
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

CS-08A FLAG, US w/STAND-PLASTIC 6" (100) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE4o0z. (12/box) (1,200) 0.410 492.000 4.560 5,472.000 4.020 4,824.000 3.880 4,656.000
Manufacturer and Model # Elmers GL417A Elmers 008970 Elmers E304 Elmers E304

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300) 4.630 1,389.000 6.800 2,040.000 5.800 1,740.000 5.540 1,662.000
Manufacturer and Model # Color Splash GL 419X Elmers 008997 Elmers E395 Elmers #340

CS-09A GLUE GALLON (300) 5.240 1,572.000 No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNTE

School Smart 068941




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT, 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.
Greenville, WI 54942
888-388-3224

Smith Office & Computer Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.
Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid 1.69/doz 2,028.000 No Bid 1.260 1,512.000
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 017670 Musgrave 500T

CS-12 PENCILS ELEM. W/ERASER (12/box) (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.510 1,812.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Dixon 13308

CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD BLACK REMOV. 12/PKG.(1,200) No Bid 5.45/doz 6,540.000 6.220 7,464.000 Disqualified
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 079876 Sanford 16001

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG. (2,400) No Bid 1.78/set 4,272.000 2.100 5,040.000 Disqualified
Manufacturer and Model # Dixon 865850 Sanford 16074

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.820 4,092.000
Manufacturer and Model # Stadtler 3189

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG. (600) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.270 1,362.000
Manufacturer and Model # Staedtler 318WP4

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid 7.270 8,724.000 5.750 6,900.000 5.650 6,780.000
Manufacturer and Model # Hunt Boston 380144 Hunt Boston KS Boston KS 1031

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL EACH (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.800 6,960.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Stanley Bostitch UpS1BLK

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.260 3,780.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford 81803

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 0z. EACH (3,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.170 3,510.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE SKM CS18




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT, 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.
Greenville, WI 54942
888-388-3224

Smith Office & Computer Suppl
1009 S. 21st Ave.
Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12" Box (1,800) No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.924 1,663.200
Manufacturer and Model # Standard 16220

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) 1,362.000 3.120 1,872.000 No Bid 2.330 1,398.000
Manufacturer and Model # S & S S7241B ACME 080255 Standard 9416

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.420 1,452.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Kleencut 241B

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) 1,542.000 3.120 1,872.000 No Bid 2.340 1,404.000
Manufacturer and Model # S&S SZ7241S ACME 080256 Standard 9430

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX (1,200) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.420 1,452.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Kleencut 241S

CS-29 PUSHPINS (100 per box) (1,000 cases) No Bid 0.035 350.000 No Bid 0.308 308.000
Manufacturer and Model # Ningbo Zhenda 00351 Standard PPAST

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid 14.810 17,772.000 23.700 28,440.000 11.920 14,304.000
Manufacturer and Model # GBC 669692 GBC 3000004 GBC

CS-32 LAMINATING FILM - Clear High Speed (1,200 rolls) No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.590 13,908.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE HOP LR /1.5x25x500

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH (2,400) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model #




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT, 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.
Greenville, WI 54942
888-388-3224

Smith Office & Computer Suppl
1009 S. 21st Ave.
Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN (1000) No Bid].29 box of 100 290.000 No Bid 2.490 249.000
Manufacturer and Model # Ningbo Zhenda 009952 General 1RH

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN (100) No Bid .46 box of 100 460.000 No Bid 3.520 352.000
Manufacturer and Model # Ningbo Zhenda 059952 General 4RH

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid 3.490 16,752.000 2.650  12,720.000 2.100  10,080.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 059460 Sanford 83074 Sanford Expo2 80074

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET (4,800) No Bid 1.350 6,480.000 No Bid 2.480  11,904.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Dixon 023155 Sanford Expo 83074

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid 6.880 33,024.000 5150  24,720.000 4200  20,160.000
Manufacturer and Model # Sanford Expo 059463 Sanford 83078 Sanford Expo 2 80078

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET (4,800) No Bid 2.690 12,912.000 No Bid 4870  23,376.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Dixon 023156 Sanford Expo 83078

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) 1.980 4,752.000 3.280 7,872.000 2.650 6,360.000 2.090 5,016.000
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark SC920 Sanford 026248 Sanford 88074 Sandord Expo2 82074

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET (2,400) No Bid 1.350 3,240.000 No Bid 2.470 5,928.000
Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE Dixon 037994 Sanford Expo 88074

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) 3.640  8,736.000 6.470 15,528.000 No Bid 4870  11,688.000
Manufacturer and Model # LiquiMark SC967 Sandord Expo 026251 Sanford Expo 88078

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET (2,400) 2.690 6,456.000 No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer and Model # - ALTERNATE

Dixon 037995




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 9, 2006 @ 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: Classroom Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #07-008-MK

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT, 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty
W6316 Design Dr.
Greenville, WI 54942
888-388-3224

Smith Office & Computer Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.
Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL .5MM EACH (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-54 LEAD REFILLS (12 leads per tube) (1,200 tubes)

Manufacturer and Model #
Total All or None for Items CS-53 and CS-54

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.) (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #
CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD (12/Box) (720)

Manufacturer and Model #

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid #2005169695AP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




