District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Health Supplies-Warehouse Number of Vendors Notified 206
Stock
Bid Number 07-013-MK l Number of Bids Distributed 42
Date Solicited January 26 , 2006 . Number of Vendors 15
Responding
Date Opened February 16, 2006 Number of Vendors Not 1
Bidding
Date Board Marc 7, 2006 Number of Vendors Bidding 14
Presentation
Total Savings $7,532.68 | Grand Total of Bid $21,362.50

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of the bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheets as lowest and best
bid meeting written specifications and testing criteria.

Term of Contract: This is a one time purchase for items to be stocked in the central warehouse to be utilized by the
District.

Notations and Exceptions: Savings were based upon the total average price for each item.

HS-06 Napkins, Sanitary-Recommend acceptance of bid from Grainger as best bid meeting written specifications. All
lower priced bids either did not meet specifications (i.e. very thin and rips apart easily).or failed to provide a sample
for evaluation purposes.

HS-23-CRP Micro Shield-Recommend acceptance of bid from Henry Schein as best bid meeting written
specifications. All lower priced bids failed to provide a sample for evaluation purposes

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All
other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:
KarenBrown, Supervisor of Student Services
Linda Graham, Secretary Il, Student Services

Bids Prepared By:
Mina Kaeding, Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized By:
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

DATE/TIME: March 1, 2006 09:37:00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. Alliance Medical Grainger Gulf South Medical Supply
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock P.O. Box 147 4505 W. Hillsborough Ave. 4345 Southpoint blvd.
BID #: 07-013-MK Russellville, MO 65074 Tampa, FL 33614 Jacksonville, FL 32216
888-633-6908 813-781-5425 800-520-3767
ITEM#  QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE ~ TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-01 600 |Vinyl Gloves-Large 100/box-10 box/case No Bid $3.88 $2,328.00 $2.38 $1,428.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Ansell 34500 GS Select 6361
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-05 50 |Tampons-200/case No Bid $50.50 $2,525.00 79.73/500 case $3,986.50
Cases [Manufacturer Tampax T500 Tampax Hospital Specialty t500
Amount Per Case 500 500
Price per case of 200 $1,375.00 $2,000.00
HS-06 50 [Napkins, Sanitary 250/per case No Bid $27.99 $1,399.50 $29.16 $1,265.54
Cases [Manufacturer Hospeco MT4 Hospital Specialty 48044
Amount Per Case 250 288
HS-13 300 |Tongue Depressors 200/per hox $2.96 $888.00 No Bid $3.21 $963.00
Box [Manufacturer Dynarex 4312 GS Select 17110
Amount Per Box 500 500
HS-15 300 |Digital Thermometer $4.49 $1,347.00 No Bid $4.69 $1,407.00
Each |Manufacturer Mabis 15-732-000 GS Select 585




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. Alliance Medical Grainger Gulf South Medical Supply
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock P.O. Box 147 4505 W. Hillsborough Ave. 4345 Southpoint blvd.
BID #: 07-013-MK Russellville, MO 65074 Tampa, FL 33614 Jacksonville, FL 32216
888-633-6908 813-781-5425 800-520-3767
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-16 | 2000 [Latex Large Gloves $416 | $8,320.00 $311 | $6220.00 $251 | $5020.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Microflex FMO150LG Ansell 69210 GS Select 22405
Amount Per Box 100 100 100
HS-18 2000 |Latex Gloves-Medium 400/per hox $4.16 $8,320.00 $3.17 $6,340.00 $2.51 $5,020.00
Box |Manufacturer Microflex FMO150MD Ansell 692 GS Select 22400
Amount Per Box 100 100 100
HS-21 2000 |Vinyl Gloves 1,500/per box No Bid $3.87 $7,740.00 $2.44 $4,880.00
Box |Manufacturer Ansell 34500 GS Select 6360
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-23 300 |Shield, CRP Micro 100 each $3.87 $1,161.00 No Bid $7.54 $2,262.00
Each [Manufacturer Microtek 70-150 Sammons Preston 928617
HS-30 600 [Thermometer probe covers 100 per box $2.34 $1,404.00 No Bid $3.26 $1,956.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Mabis 15-168-000 Omron 0009PROB
Amount Per Box 100 | 100 |




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. Interboro Packaging Company Kentron Health Care Laerdal Medical Corporation
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 114 Brachen Rd. P.0. Box 120 167 Myers Corners Road
BID #: 07-013-MK Montgomery, NY 12549 Springfield, TN 37172 Wappingers Falls, NY 12590
845-457-2700 615-384-0573 845-297-7770
ITEM# QTYV. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-01 600 |Vinyl Gloves-Large 100/box-10 box/case $2.45 $1,470.00 No Bid No Bid
Boxes |Manufacturer Emerald LRG-VG
Amount Per Box 100/shipped 1000 per case
HS-05 50 |Tampons-200/case No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cases |Manufacturer

Amount Per Case

Price per case of 200

HS-06 50 |Napkins, Sanitary 250/per case No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cases |Manufacturer

Amount Per Case

HS-13 300 |Tongue Depressors 200/per hox No Bid $3.10 $930.00 No Bid
Box |Manufacturer Kentron 450675
Amount Per Box 500
HS-15 300 |Digital Thermometer No Bid $2.25 $675.00 No Bid
Each |Manufacturer Kentron Oral 60 seconds,

Axillary 120 seconds,




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M.

Interboro Packaging Company

Kentron Health Care

Laerdal Medical Corporation

TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 114 Brachen Rd. P.0. Box 120 167 Myers Corners Road
BID #: 07-013-MK Montgomery, NY 12549 Springfield, TN 37172 Wappingers Falls, NY 12590
845-457-2700 615-384-0573 845-297-7770
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE =~ TOTALPRICE  UNITPRICE @ TOTAL PRICE
HS-16 2000 |Latex Large Gloves $2.48 | $4,960.00 No Bid No Bid
Boxes [Manufacturer Imco Lrg-LPFG/Powder free
Amount Per Box 100/shipped 1000 per case
HS-18 2000 |Latex Gloves-Medium 400/per box $2.55 $5,100.00 No Bid No Bid
Box [Manufacturer Imco Med-LPFG/Powder free
Amount Per Box 100/shipped 1000 per case
HS-21 2000 |Vinyl Gloves 1,500/per box $2.35 $4,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Box [Manufacturer Emerald Med-VG
Amount Per Box 100/shipped 1000 per case
HS-23 300 [Shield, CRP Micro 100 each No Bid No Bid $10.95 $1,095.00
Each |Manufacturer Laerdal 820019 page 114
HS-30 600 |Thermometer probe covers 100 per box No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boxes |Manufacturer
Amount Per Box




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M.

Henry Schein, Inc.

Medco Sup

ply Company

William V. MacGill & Company

TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 135 Duryea Road 500 Fillmore Ave. 1000 N Lombard Rd.
BID #: 07-013-MK Melville, NY 11747 Tonawanda, NY 14150 Lombard, IL 60148
800-851-0400 800-556-3326 800-323-2841
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTALPRICE =~ UNITPRICE TOTALPRICE  UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-01 600 |Vinyl Gloves-Large 100/box-10 box/case $2.19 $1,314.00 $2.40 $1,440.00 No Bid
Boxes |Manufacturer Criterien 1025332 Basic 18709M
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-05 50 [Tampons-200/case $58.70 $2,935.00 $27.80 $1,390.00 No Bid
Cases [Manufacturer Tampax 9904431 Tampax 57021M
Amount Per Case 500 200
Price per case of 200
HS-06 50 [Napkins, Sanitary 250/per case $35.98 $1,799.00 $31.35 $1,567.50 $44.00 $2,200.00
Cases [Manufacturer Hospital Specialties 7036054 Maxithins 57031M Stayfree 4S
Amount Per Case 250 250 250
HS-13 300 |Tongue Depressors 200/per hox $2.82 $846.00 $3.60 $1,080.00 $5.15 $1,545.00
Box |Manufacturer Dukal 1002416 Dynarex 04220 Solon 70S
Amount Per Box 500 500 500
HS-15 300 |Digital Thermometer $2.99 $897.00 $3.05 $915.00 $5.00 $1,500.00
Each |Manufacturer Mabis 101395 Mabis 1560M Mabis AST4B




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M.

Henry Schein, Inc.

Medco Supply Company

William V. MacGill & Company

TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 135 Duryea Road 500 Fillmore Ave. 1000 N Lombard Rd.
BID #: 07-013-MK Melville, NY 11747 Tonawanda, NY 14150 Lombard, IL 60148
800-851-0400 800-556-3326 800-323-2841
ITEM# QTYV. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE =~ TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-16 2000 |Latex Large Gloves $3.25 | $6,500.00 $2.60 | $5,200.00 No Bid
Boxes |Manufacturer Microflex 5659617 Medco 16025
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-18 2000 |Latex Gloves-Medium 400/per hox $3.25 $6,500.00 $2.60 $5,200.00 No Bid
Box |Manufacturer Microflex 5659024 Medco 16009
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-21 2000 |Vinyl Gloves 1,500/per box $2.19 $4,380.00 $2.40 $4,800.00 No Bid
Box |Manufacturer Criterion 1025329 Basic 18708M
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-23 300 ([Shield, CRP Micro 100 each $3.62 $1,086.00 $3.85 $1,155.00 $4.20 $1,260.00
Each |Manufacturer MDI Microshield 3729613 MDI 51001M CPR Microshield 87860
HS-30 600 |Thermometer probe covers 100 per box $1.99 $1,194.00 $2.25 $1,350.00 $2.20 $1,320.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Tidi 1009361 Mabis 15604 Sanitherm DT100
Amount Per Box 100 | 100 | 100 |




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. Pyramid School Products Moore Medical Safeco, Inc.
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 6510 North 54th Street 389 John Downey Dr. 9866 Currie Davis Drive
BID #: 07-013-MK Tampa, FL 33610 Mew Britain, CT 06050 Tampa, FL 33619
813-621-6446 800-234-1464 813-627-9840
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE ~ TOTAL PRICE  UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-01 600 |Vinyl Gloves-Large 100/box-10 box/case $2.18 $1,308.00 $2.43 $1,458.00 $2.60 $1,560.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Amercare 400L Cypress 77110 Memphis 5020L
Amount Per Box 100/minimum order of 600 boxes 100 100
HS-05 50 |Tampons-200/case $46.98 $2,349.00 $57.64 $2,882.00 No Bid
Cases [Manufacturer Tampax T500 Fabriquetarl Unisource 65596
Amount Per Case 500 500
Price per case of 200 $1,250.00
HS-06 50 [Napkins, Sanitary 250/per case $25.98 $1,299.00 $29.16 $1,458.00 No Bid
Cases [Manufacturer Hospital Specialties 4-147 Hospital Specialties Unisource 65599
Amount Per Case 250 250
HS-13 300 |Tongue Depressors 200/per hox No Bid $2.30 $690.00 No Bid
Box |Manufacturer Dukal/Moore 69617
Amount Per Box 500
HS-15 300 |Digital Thermometer No Bid $2.81 $843.00 No Bid
Each |Manufacturer Mabis/Moore 64635




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. Pyramid School Products Moore Medical Safeco, Inc.
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 6510 North 54th Street 389 John Downey Dr. 9866 Currie Davis Drive
BID #: 07-013-MK Tampa, FL 33610 Mew Britain, CT 06050 Tampa, FL 33619
813-621-6446 800-234-1464 813-627-9840
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE ~ UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-16 | 2000 [Latex Large Gloves $241 | $4820.00 $274 | $5480.00 $275 | $5500.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Amercare 100L Cypress 77114 Memphis 5060L
Amount Per Box 100 100 100
HS-18 2000 |Latex Gloves-Medium 400/per box $2.41 $4,820.00 $2.74 $5,480.00 $2.75 $5,500.00
Box [Manufacturer Amercare 100M Cypress 77113 Memphis 5060M
Amount Per Box 100 100 100
HS-21 2000 |Vinyl Gloves 1,500/per hox $2.18 $4,360.00 $2.43 $4,860.00 $2.60 $5,200.00
Box [Manufacturer Amercare 400M Cypress 77109 Memphis 5020M
Amount Per Box 100 100 100
HS-23 300 |Shield, CRP Micro 100 each No Bid $3.73 $1,119.00 No Bid
Each |Manufacturer MDI 35472
HS-30 600 [Thermometer probe covers 100 per box No Bid $1.59 $954.00 No Bid
Boxes |Manufacturer Mabis/Moore 65354
Amount Per Box 100 |




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. School Health Corporation Supreme Medical Fulfillment System
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock 865 Muirfield Drive P.O. Box 850247
BID #: 07-013-MK Hanover Park, IL 60133 Mobile, AL 36685
800-323-1305 800-461-1370
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-01 600 |Vinyl Gloves-Large 100/box-10 box/case $4.90 $2,940.00 $2.47 $1,482.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Medline 21-308 Dynarex 2603
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-05 50 |Tampons-200/case $37.76 $1,880.00 No Bid
Cases [Manufacturer Rochester Midland 22-008
Amount Per Case 200

Price per case of 200

HS-06 50 [Napkins, Sanitary 250/per case $48.56 $2,428.00
Cases |Manufacturer Rochester Midland 22-003 Hospeco 147
Amount Per Case 250 250
HS-13 300 [Tongue Depressors 200/per box $5.09 $1,527.00 $2.60 $780.00
Box [Manufacturer Puritan 90-022 Dynarex 4312
Amount Per Box 500 500
HS-15 300 |Digital Thermometer $6.26 $1,878.00 No Bid

Each [Manufacturer Mabis 13-083




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 16, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M.
TITLE: Health Supplies - Warehouse Stock
BID #: 07-013-MK

School Health Corporation
865 Muirfield Drive
Hanover Park, IL 60133
800-323-1305

Supreme Medical Fulfillment System
P.0. Box 850247
Mobile, AL 36685
800-461-1370

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE =~ TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HS-16 2000 |Latex Large Gloves $5.63 | $11,260.00 $2.63 | $5,260.00
Boxes [Manufacturer Ansell Perry 21-181 Dynarex 2328
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-18 2000 |[Latex Gloves-Medium 400/per box $5.63 $11,260.00 $2.63 $5,260.00
Box [Manufacturer Ansell Perry 21-180 Dynarex 2327
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-21 2000 |Vinyl Gloves 1,500/per box $5.36 $10,720.00 $2.47 $4,940.00
Box |Manufacturer Medline 21-307 Dynarex 2602
Amount Per Box 100 100
HS-23 300 |Shield, CRP Micro 100 each $5.36 $1,608.00 $1.02 $306.00
Each |Manufacturer MDI 55-038 Dynarex 4921
HS-30 600 |Thermometer probe covers 100 per box $2.66 $1,596.00 $2.37 $1,422.00
Boxes |Manufacturer Sani-therm 21-051 Tidi 20633
Amount Per Box 100 | 100 |




