
DATE/TIME:  March 29, 2006 08:45:00

 
 
 
 

Bid Title Art Supplies -  
Warehouse Stock 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

153 

Bid Number #07-002-MK  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

37 

Date Solicited 1/17/06  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

13 

Date Opened 2/7/06  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

2 

Date Board 
Presentation 

4/4/06  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

11 

Total Savings $19,512.76  Grand Total of Bid $49,843.92 

Recommendation:   
Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as lowest and best bid meeting 
specifications and testing criteria. 
Term of Contract:    
One time purchase for Distribution Services Stock to be utilized by various Departments and Schools. 
Notations and Exceptions: 
Item AS-03:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation 
purposes as specified in the bid documents and therefore could not be considered.  
 
Item AS-04: Reject – All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified in 
the bid documents and therefore could not be considered or did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, 
incorrect size and poor knead ability).  Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. 
 
Item AS-05: Reject - No samples were provided for evaluation purposes as specified in the bid documents and 
therefore could not be considered.   Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. 
 
Please see page 2 for additional notes 
 
Two “No Bids” were received from Business Solutions and Science Kit.  Offers from the vendors listed herein 
are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.  All offers submitted in response to 
this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By:  
Jan Mallett, Art Teacher, SSMS 
Clay Verge, Art Teacher, HHS 
 
Bids Prepared By: 
Mina Kaeding, Buyer 
 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 



DATE/TIME: 

Page 2 
07-002-MK Recommendation 

 
Item AS-10: Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationary Supply, Co as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria, (i.e., 
poor color and poor blending). 
 
Item AS-13: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria (i.e., 
poor quality, dry, and poor color density).    
 
Item AS-14: Reject – All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified 
in the bid documents or did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality and dry).  Request permission to 
obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. 
 
Item AS-18: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria (i.e., 
poor quality and crumbly).   
 
Item AS-23:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery Supply as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specification and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria (i.e., 
poor quality and plastic bristles). 
 
Item AS-24:  Reject – No samples were provided for evaluation purposes as specified in the bid 
documents.  Request permission to obtain quotes and purchase on the open market. 
 
Item AS-16 – AS-31:  Reject – No complete sets of colors were provided for evaluation purposes as 
specified in the bid documents for testing of color combinations.  Request permission to obtain quotes and 
purchase on the open market. 
 
Item AS-51 – AS-54:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best 
bid meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria 
(i.e., shedding, poor quality and painting quality). 
 
Item AS-72:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Sax Arts & Crafts as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria (i.e., soft, 
crumbly and low durability). 
 
Item AS-82: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for 
evaluation purposes as specified in the bid documents and therefore could not be considered. 
 
Item AS-83: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids did not meet testing criteria (i.e., 
poor color changeability and poor color). 
 
Item AS-84: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid 
meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  All lower priced bids failed to provide samples for 
evaluation purposes as specified in the bid documents and therefore could not be considered. 
 
 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
AS-03 360 Blades, X-Acto  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Packages Manufacturer

AS-04 1,200 Kneaded Erasers No Bid No Bid 0.560 672.000 0.800 960.000
Each Manufacturer

AS-05 360 Student Economy Water Color Sets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sets Manufacturer

CRAYONS:
AS-06 1,200 8-Small Assorted No Bid 3.120 3,744.000 No Bid 12.050 14,460.000

Dozen Manufacturer

AS-07 1,800 16-Small Assorted No Bid 5.520 9,936.000 No Bid 14.760 26,568.000
Dozen Manufacturer

AS-10 1,200 Watercolor Pencil Set  - 12 Colors/Set No Bid 0.948 1,137.600 6.600 7,920.000 3.320 3,984.000
Sets Manufacturer

Sanford SUN-70531Sanford 70532

Bye MO"r, Inc.
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
800-847-9219

Sanford PC952

877-321-2787

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Artist Brushstrokes
14545 J. Military Trail #154

Delray Beach, FL 33484

Sargent 220531/ 6 pkg to case

Sargent 220533/6 pkg per case

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300

Sagent 22-7204 Crayola 684302

813-490-5790

Crayola 520008

Crayola 520016

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes, Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bye MO"r, Inc.
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
800-847-9219877-321-2787

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Artist Brushstrokes
14545 J. Military Trail #154

Delray Beach, FL 33484

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 813-490-5790

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes, Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   No Bid 0.108 5,184.000 0.154 7,392.000 0.740 35,520.000
Each Manufacturer

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   - ALTERNATE
Each Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers No Bid 0.720 8,640.000 0.630 7,560.000 3.630 43,560.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers - ALTERNATE 0.700 8,400.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-14 6,000 Coloring Markers - Scented No Bid 0.650 3,900.000 0.630 3,780.000 8.250 49,500.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-18 14,400 Colored Pencils - 12/Assorted Colors No Bid 0.520 7,488.000 0.618 8,899.200 1.840 26,496.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-20 480 Colored Drawing Chalk No Bid 0.880 422.400 0.700 336.000 2.650 1,272.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set No Bid 1.010 2,424.000 1.000 2,400.000 1.790 4,296.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set - ALTERNATE
Sets Manufacturer

AS-24 240 Tempera Color Blocks No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.150 2,916.000
Sets Manufacturer

Status Plus 67-473

Sargent 22-1550

Sargent 22-1580

Liqui Mark 63012

Sargent 22-1432

Sargent 22-8424

Universal UNV75749

Sanford San 22678

Crayola 752210

Quartet QRT428003

Fooly San 05012

Crayola 510403

Crayola 531508

Dixon Prang 15083

Sargent 22-1550/8colors

Sargent 22-1580/10 colors

Sargent 22-1580/10 colors

Sargent 22-7212

Sargent 22-4132

Sargent 22-8424



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bye MO"r, Inc.
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
800-847-9219877-321-2787

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Artist Brushstrokes
14545 J. Military Trail #154

Delray Beach, FL 33484

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 813-490-5790

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes, Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

AS-16 240 Quart Jars - Orange No Bid 1.630 391.200 1.450 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-17 240 Quart Jars - Brown No Bid 1.630 391.200 1.450 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-25 240 Red No Bid 1.630 391.200 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-26 120 Blue No Bid 1.630 195.600 174.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-27 240 Yellow No Bid 1.630 391.200 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-28 600 White No Bid 1.630 489.000 435.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-29 120 Black No Bid 1.630 195.600 174.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-30 240 Green No Bid 1.630 391.200 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-31 240 Purple No Bid 1.630 391.200 348.000 No Bid
Quarts Manufacturer

TOTAL "ALL OR NONE" ITEMS AS-16,17 & AS-25/31 No Bid 3,227.400 2,871.000 No Bid

Prang RTU 232XX

Sargent 22-6414

Prang RTU 232XX

Prang RTU 232XX

Sargent 22-6442

Sargent 22-6488

Sargent 22-6420

Sargent 22-6450

Sargent 22-6402

Sargent 22-6496

Sargent 22-6485

Prang RTU 232XX

Sargent 22-6466

Prang RTU 232XX

Prang RTU 232XX

Prang RTU 232XX

Prang RTU 232XX

Prang RTU 232XX

LIQUID TEMPERA PAINT - "ALL OR NONE"



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bye MO"r, Inc.
P.O. Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
800-847-9219877-321-2787

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Artist Brushstrokes
14545 J. Military Trail #154

Delray Beach, FL 33484

AFP Industries
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 813-490-5790

MG Office Products
1644 Land O' Lakes, Blvd.

Lutz, FL 33549

Black Bristle School Easel Brushes
AS-51 1,200 1/4" 0.160 192.000 No Bid No Bid 2.750 3,300.000

Each Manufacturer

AS-52 1200 1/2" 0.210 252.000 No Bid No Bid 4.390 5,268.000
Each Manufacturer

AS-53 1,500 3/4" 0.330 495.000 No Bid No Bid 6.210 9,315.000
Each Manufacturer

AS-54 1,200 1" 0.410 492.000 No Bid No Bid 8.460 10,152.000
Each Manufacturer CLI Leo 

1,431.000 No Bid No Bid 28,035.000

AS-63 120 Paper Mache Art Paste No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.500 420.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-72 1,200 Oil Pastel - 16 Color Set No Bid 0.730 876.000 .637 764.400 2.660 3,192.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-82 1,200 Overwriter Markers No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.300 6,360.000
Sets Manufacturer

AS-83 2,400 Changeable Markers: No Bid 1.780 4,272.000 No Bid 5.310 12,744.000
Manufacturer

AS-84 360 Crayons, Multicultural  No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.660 237.600
Sets Manufacturer

Dynasty 270-B

Dynasty 270B

Dynasty 270B

Dynasty 270B

Crayola 58-8105

Crayola BIN 52008W

Liqui Mark 88003

CLI Leo 73525

CLI Leo 73550

Sargent 22-2019

CLI Leo 73575

Pentel Pen-PHN-16Sargent 22-2019

Crayola BIN 588139

Elmer's 24003-1003

TOTAL ALL OR NONE FOR AS-51 AND AS-54



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION
AS-03 360 Blades, X-Acto  

Packages Manufacturer

AS-04 1,200 Kneaded Erasers
Each Manufacturer

AS-05 360 Student Economy Water Color Sets
Sets Manufacturer

CRAYONS:
AS-06 1,200 8-Small Assorted

Dozen Manufacturer

AS-07 1,800 16-Small Assorted 
Dozen Manufacturer

AS-10 1,200 Watercolor Pencil Set  - 12 Colors/Set 
Sets Manufacturer

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1.620 583.200 No Bid 1.390 500.400 1.050 378.000

0.630 756.000 No Bid 0.200 240.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.790 2,148.000 2.290 2,748.000 1.820 2,184.000 No Bid
nds on Fun 56-60

2.980 5,364.000 3.970 7,146.000 3.270 5,886.000 No Bid
nds on Fun 56-70

2.280 2,736.000 0.880 1,056.000 1.620 1,944.000 No Bid
d s on Fun 56-5007

General 140E Leonard 71585

X-Acto 2A (X232)

Dixon Prang 00000

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Dixon Prang 00100

General 700A-12

Oriental Trading Company
5455 S. 90th Street

Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Crayola 8

Crayola 16

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

X-Acto BIDX11Boston X-Acto X202

Crayola 4302



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   
Each Manufacturer

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   - ALTERNATE
Each Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers
Sets Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers - ALTERNATE
Sets Manufacturer

AS-14 6,000 Coloring Markers - Scented 
Sets Manufacturer

AS-18 14,400 Colored Pencils - 12/Assorted Colors
Sets Manufacturer

AS-20 480 Colored Drawing Chalk
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set 
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set - ALTERNATE
Sets Manufacturer

AS-24 240 Tempera Color Blocks
Sets Manufacturer

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Oriental Trading Company
5455 S. 90th Street

Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

0.149 7,152.000 0.100 4,800.000 0.107 5,136.000 No Bid
d s on Fun 57-50080

1.137 13,644.000 0.850 10,200.000 1.010 12,120.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.610 9,660.000 No Bid

0.795 11,448.000 0.710 10,224.000 0.860 12,384.000 1.490 21,456.000

No Bid No Bid 1.010 484.800 No Bid

1.360 3,264.000 0.500 1,200.000 1.060 2,544.000 1.420 3,408.000

No Bid No Bid 3.290 789.600 No Bid

STX 67473

Crayola 7708

Dixon 15083/28 oz.

Dixon Prang 80128

Dixon Prang 22120

Dixon 08000 Hands on Fun 56-1301

Crayola 684012

Crayola 530525

Hands on Fun 56-4006

Hands on Fun 56-5001

Richeson 101260

Crayola 403

Crayola 08

Crayola 4012

Sanfod 03610



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

AS-16 240 Quart Jars - Orange
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-17 240 Quart Jars - Brown
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-25 240 Red 
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-26 120 Blue
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-27 240 Yellow
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-28 600 White
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-29 120 Black
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-30 240 Green 
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-31 240 Purple
Quarts Manufacturer

TOTAL "ALL OR NONE" ITEMS AS-16,17 & AS-25/31

LIQUID TEMPERA PAINT - "ALL OR NONE"
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Oriental Trading Company
5455 S. 90th Street

Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 229.200 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 573.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 229.200 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 1.910 458.400 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 3,781.800 No Bid

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132

Crayola 3132



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Black Bristle School Easel Brushes
AS-51 1,200 1/4"

Each Manufacturer

AS-52 1200 1/2"
Each Manufacturer

AS-53 1,500 3/4"
Each Manufacturer

AS-54 1,200 1"
Each Manufacturer

AS-63 120 Paper Mache Art Paste
Sets Manufacturer

AS-72 1,200 Oil Pastel - 16 Color Set
Sets Manufacturer

AS-82 1,200 Overwriter Markers
Sets Manufacturer

AS-83 2,400 Changeable Markers:
Manufacturer

AS-84 360 Crayons, Multicultural  
Sets Manufacturer

TOTAL ALL OR NONE FOR AS-51 AND AS-54

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Elgin School Supply Co.
260 Ryan Ave.

Chico, CA 95973
530-894-6338

Oriental Trading Company
5455 S. 90th Street

Omaha, NE 68127-3501
402-596-1212

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

813-621-6446

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Road

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

0.150 180.000 No Bid 0.113 135.600 No Bid

0.240 288.000 No Bid 0.147 176.400 No Bid

0.330 495.000 No Bid 0.180 270.000 No Bid

0.450 1,503.000 No Bid 0.240 288.000 No Bid

2,466.000 No Bid 870.000 No Bid

1.470 176.400 No Bid 1.210 145.200 No Bid

1.080 1,296.000 No Bid 1.080 1,296.000 No Bid

0.250 90.000 No Bid 2.060 2,472.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 2.060 4,944.000 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 0.260 93.600 No Bid

Order over $200 free freight
$200 pre-paid added

Crayola 8139

Crayola 8105

Leonard 73525

Leoanrd 73550

Leonard 73575

Leonard 73599

Pentel PHN-16

Dixon Prang 38018

Elmers 99000

Crayola 008W

Elmers Ross 99000

Pentel PHN-16

Status Plus 579-3

Status Plus 579-8

Status Plus 579-10

Status Plus 579-12



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION
AS-03 360 Blades, X-Acto  

Packages Manufacturer

AS-04 1,200 Kneaded Erasers
Each Manufacturer

AS-05 360 Student Economy Water Color Sets
Sets Manufacturer

CRAYONS:
AS-06 1,200 8-Small Assorted

Dozen Manufacturer

AS-07 1,800 16-Small Assorted 
Dozen Manufacturer

AS-10 1,200 Watercolor Pencil Set  - 12 Colors/Set 
Sets Manufacturer

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1.480 532.800 No Bid No Bid

*1.71/dozen 171.000 No Bid 0.132 158.400

2.410 867.600 No Bid No Bid

1.920 2,304.000 6.440 7,728.000 1.770 2,124.000

3.480 6,264.000 6.590 11,862.000 2.950 5,310.000

1.670 2,004.000 No Bid 0.944 1,132.800
Crayola 684302

X-Acto X202

.15each/$180
Easy Erase 1222

Dixon Prang 00000

Dixon Prnag 00100

Sax Arts & Crafts
P.O. Box 510710

New Berlin, WI 53151
800-362-4729

Crayola 52008

Crayola 520016

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

Crayola SC4

Sargent SC411

Standard Stationery Supply Co.
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

Sargent Art 22-7204

Sax Tru Flow 558493250

School Smart 077358 (1-3/4x13/16)



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   
Each Manufacturer

AS-12 48,000 Glue Sticks   - ALTERNATE
Each Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers
Sets Manufacturer

AS-13 12,000 Coloring Markers - ALTERNATE
Sets Manufacturer

AS-14 6,000 Coloring Markers - Scented 
Sets Manufacturer

AS-18 14,400 Colored Pencils - 12/Assorted Colors
Sets Manufacturer

AS-20 480 Colored Drawing Chalk
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set 
Sets Manufacturer

AS-23 2,400 Water Color Sets - 8 Color/Set - ALTERNATE
Sets Manufacturer

AS-24 240 Tempera Color Blocks
Sets Manufacturer

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Sax Arts & Crafts
P.O. Box 510710

New Berlin, WI 53151
800-362-4729

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

Standard Stationery Supply Co.
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

1.320 5,280.000 0.100 4,800.000 0.082 3,936.000

0.109 5,232.000

1.030 12,360.000 No Bid 1.130 13,560.000

0.863 10,356.000

1.970 11,820.000 No Bid 1.590 9,540.000

0.800 11,520.000 No Bid 0.452 6,508.080

1.070 513.600 1.730 830.400 0.619 297.120

1.150 2,760.000 1.410 3,384.000 0.995 2,388.000

0.440 1,056.000

4.150 996.000 No Bid 6.100 1,464.000

Crayola 530008

Crayola 510403

Dixon Prang 80128

Sargent 224132

Sargent 22-8424

Caitong 1008

Standards S32

Bontec ES32School Smart GT08 (28 oz./4000 doz)

Crayola 587708

Mr. Sketch 03610

School Smart 57212

Color Splash GL560

Prang PT 207

Crayola SC791

Liqui Mark 21008P

Sanford Hills 03610

Jack Richardson 101361

Rainbow Riter 5012

Dixon Prang 80900



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

AS-16 240 Quart Jars - Orange
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-17 240 Quart Jars - Brown
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-25 240 Red 
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-26 120 Blue
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-27 240 Yellow
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-28 600 White
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-29 120 Black
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-30 240 Green 
Quarts Manufacturer

AS-31 240 Purple
Quarts Manufacturer

TOTAL "ALL OR NONE" ITEMS AS-16,17 & AS-25/31

LIQUID TEMPERA PAINT - "ALL OR NONE"
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Sax Arts & Crafts
P.O. Box 510710

New Berlin, WI 53151
800-362-4729

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

Standard Stationery Supply Co.
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

2.110 253.200 No Bid 1.340 160.800

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

2.110 633.000 No Bid 1.340 402.000

2.110 253.200 No Bid 1.340 160.800

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

2.110 506.400 No Bid 1.340 321.600

4,177.800 No Bid 2,653.200

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Artist 2 3132

Dixon Prang 23202

Dixon Prang 23207

Dixon Prang 23208

Dixon Prang 23204

Dixon Prang 23206

Dixon Prang 23201

Dixon Prang 23205

Dixon Prang 23203

Dixon Prang 23209



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# Units DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: February 7, 2006, 10:00 a.m.
BID TITLE: ART SUPPLIES/WAREHOUSE
BID #07-002-MK

Black Bristle School Easel Brushes
AS-51 1,200 1/4"

Each Manufacturer

AS-52 1200 1/2"
Each Manufacturer

AS-53 1,500 3/4"
Each Manufacturer

AS-54 1,200 1"
Each Manufacturer

AS-63 120 Paper Mache Art Paste
Sets Manufacturer

AS-72 1,200 Oil Pastel - 16 Color Set
Sets Manufacturer

AS-82 1,200 Overwriter Markers
Sets Manufacturer

AS-83 2,400 Changeable Markers:
Manufacturer

AS-84 360 Crayons, Multicultural  
Sets Manufacturer

TOTAL ALL OR NONE FOR AS-51 AND AS-54

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Sax Arts & Crafts
P.O. Box 510710

New Berlin, WI 53151
800-362-4729

S & S Worldwide
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

Standard Stationery Supply Co.
2251 Foster Ave.

Wheeling, IL 60090
800-870-1315

0.170 204.000 No Bid 0.104 124.800

0.220 264.000 No Bid 0.138 165.600

0.360 540.000 No Bid 0.190 285.000

0.440 528.000 No Bid 0.230 276.000

1,536.000 No Bid 851.400

0.700 84.000 No Bid 1.470 176.400

0.990 1,188.000 1.370 1,644.000 0.599 718.800

2.280 2,736.000 3.100 3,720.000 No Bid

2.280 5,472.000 No Bid 1.600 3,840.000

0.270 97.200 0.550 198.000 0.197 70.920

Dynasty 270B

Dynasty 270B

Dynasty 270B

Dynasty 270B

Dixon Prang 

Crayola SC989

Pentel SC683

Crayola 58008N

Crayola 588105

Crayola 588139

Pentel PHN 16

Crayola SC470

School Smart APG 056

Liqui Mark 88001

Standard 579C025

Elmers 99000

Sargent 222019

Standard 579C050

Standard 579-C075

Standard 579-C100


