District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Charter Bus Service Number of Vendors 24
Notified
Bid Number 06-126-MK Number of Bids 10
Distributed
Date 03/01/2006 Number of Vendors 4
Solicited Bidding
Date Opened 4/20/06 Number of Formal “No 0
Bid” Responses
Date Board 06/06/06 Funding Source 101
Presentation
Total Savings Estimate Grand Total of Bid “As Needed”
$25,900.00 Basis-
Estimated
$250,000.00

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet.

Term of Contract:

This bid is for District charter bus service on an “as needed” to be used throughout the District.
This is a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual agreement of all parties. The first
year of the contract will commence on July 1, 2006 through June 5, 2007.

Notations and Exceptions:

This is a multiple award bid to a maximum of eight vendors based upon written specifications.
Schools will be free to choose the vendors of their choice based upon availability. Total dollars
were calculated based on past historical usage, including the six new schools. Total savings were based on
average price minus estimated dollar value.

Bid from E-Z Bus, Inc. is still being evaluated and will be forwarded to a later Board meeting.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified
opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are
hereby rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:
Tom Callahan, Supervisor of Transportation
Sherry Wooten, Buyer Assistant

Bids Prepared By:
Mina Kaeding Buyer, Purchasing Department

Reviewed and Authorized By:
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

DATE/TIME: May 31, 2006 09:31:00




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 5, 2006 @ 2:30 PM Annette Bus Lines Astro Bus Service Escot Bus Lines E-Z Bus Inc.
BID TITLE: Charter Bus Services 130 Madrid Drive 875 Cypress St. 6890 142nd Avenue 1150 Jetport Dr. Suite 200
BID # 06-126-MK Sebring, FL 33876 Tarpon Springs, FL 34689 Largo, FL 33771 Orlando, FL 32809
800-282-3655 727-938-5778 727-545-2088 407-857-1007
ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Item1  Dead Head Per Daily Trip $50.00

47 Passenger $70.00 $90.00 $120.00 Included in bus price

55 Passenger No Bid $105.00 $140.00 Included in bus price

29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $105.00 No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $105.00 No Bid No Bid
Item 2  Per Hour (4-Hour Minimum) Flat Rate No Bid

47 Passenger $72.50/8-hour minimum $340.00 $500.00

55 Passenger $94.50/8-minimum $385.00 $600.00

29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $340.00 No Bid

65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $385.00 No Bid

88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $385.00 No Bid

Item 3  Per Hour (Trip over 4, less than 10)

47 Passenger *$72.50/8-minimum or $3 per mile $58.00 $83./7-hour minimum $450. 1st 4 hrs/$85. ea hr after
55 Passenger *$94.50/8-minimum or $3.89 per mile $65.00 $96./7-hour minimum $450. 1st 4 hrs/$95. ea hr after
29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $58.00 No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 5, 2006 @ 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: Charter Bus Services
BID # 06-126-MK

Annette Bus Lines

130 Madrid Drive

Sebring, FL 33876
800-282-3655

Astro Bus Service
875 Cypress St.
Tarpon Springs, FL 34689
727-938-5778

Escot Bus Lines
6890 142nd Avenue
Largo, FL 33771
727-545-2088

E-Z Bus Inc.
1150 Jetport Dr. Suite 200
Orlando, FL 32809
407-857-1007

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Item 4 Per Hour (Trip over 10, less than 15)
47 Passenger *$60.83/$3. per mile $53.00 $78.00 $450. 1st 4 hrs/$85. ea hr after
55 Passenger *$80.41/$3.89 per mile $60.00 $88.00 $450. 1st 4 hrs/$95. ea hr after
29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $53.00 No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid

Item5  Daily Rate-Capped 15 or More $800.00 No Bid
47 Passenger $950.00 $1,350.00 $1,200.00
55 Passenger No Bid $1,600.00 $1,500.00
29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 6  Daily Rate for Multiple Days/Overnight No Bid
47 Passenger $615.00 $950./500 miles max per day $1,200.00
55 Passenger $790.00 $1075./500 miles max per day $1,500.00
29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 5, 2006 @ 2:30 PM Annette Bus Lines Astro Bus Service Escot Bus Lines E-Z Bus Inc.
BID TITLE: Charter Bus Services 130 Madrid Drive 875 Cypress St. 6890 142nd Avenue 1150 Jetport Dr. Suite 200
BID # 06-126-MK Sebring, FL 33876 Tarpon Springs, FL 34689 Largo, FL 33771 Orlando, FL 32809
800-282-3655 727-938-5778 727-545-2088 407-857-1007
ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Item 7  Premium Flate Rate for Designated Days No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger $1,500.00 $2,200.00

55 Passenger $1,650.00 $2,500.00

29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid
Item 9  Trips over 250 miles one way per mile No Bid

47 Passenger $3.00 $3.15 $3.00

55 Passenger $3.89 $3.62 $3.25

29 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

65 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 Passenger Non-Yellow Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item 10  Flat Cancellation Rate less than 72 Hours $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $800.00

*Whichever price is greater




