
DATE/TIME:May 31, 2006 10:15:00 

 
 
 
 

Bid Title Televisions & CD Players   Number of Vendors 
Notified 

188 

Bid Number 06-139-MK  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

50 

Date 
Solicited 

03/27/06  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

5 

Date Opened 04/19/06  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

2 

Date Board 
Presentation 

06//04/06  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

5 

Total Savings Estimated Savings 
$6,682.00 

 Grand Total of Bid Estimated 
Total 

$103,000.00 

Recommendation: 
Recommend rejection of all bids due to the ability to obtain better pricing from State Contract 
 # 880-001-06-1 for Audio Visual Equipment.  State contract price for a Toshiba 27A45 
television is currently $228.75.  The best price obtained by the District for a Toshiba 27A45 
television was $243.46.  The District anticipates purchasing 450 televisions the next fiscal year.  
The total reflects the purchase of 450 TV’s, this total may vary depending on District needs. 
 
Additionally it is recommended to reject all bids received for CD Players at this time.  District 
Media feels they will be able to obtain quotes for approximately 150 CD Players at less then 
$25.00 per CD player.   The lowest bid price received meeting all specifications was $48.95 ea. 
 
Term of Contract: 
This bid is for televisions and CD players on an “as needed” to be used by students throughout 
the District.  This is a three-year bid renewable annually based upon mutual agreement of both 
parties. 
Notations and Exceptions: 
Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified 
opening date and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are 
hereby rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By:  
Roger Kaminski, Supervisor of DIMC 
Bids Prepared By: 
Mina Kaeding Buyer, Purchasing Department 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

AFP Industries BES Industries Long's Electronics MDM Commercial TB&A Hospital Television
P.O. Box 43-0747 3948 Third St. S 2630 5th Ave. South 2320 s. 3rd St. #15 20 Pineview Dr.

Suite 284
South Miami, FL 33243 Jacksonville, FL 32250 Irondale, AL 35210 Jacksonville, FL 32250 Amherst, NY 14228

305-663-8300 888-527-6288 800-633-4984 904-241-2340 800-288-7351
ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Item 1 25" Television List Price No Bid $279.95 Each No Bid No Bid $585.00 Each

Discount 5% / $265.95 Each 56.41% / $255.00 Each
Brand 24AF46 H24F36DT 24"
Manufacturer Toshiba Zenith

Item 2 27" Television List Price No Bid $329.95 Each $269.95 Each $259.00 Each $715.00 Each
Discount 6% / $310.15 Each 0% / $269.95 Each 6% / $243.46 Each 48.95% / $365.00 Each
Brand 27AF46 TVS2746 27A45/Analog H27H38DT
Manufacturer Toshiba Orion Sansui Toshiba Zenith

Item 2 27" Television List Price - ALTERNATE $395.00 Each
Discount 25% / $296.25
Brand C27J28B/Digital
Manufacturer Zenith

Item 3 CD Player Emerson PD11B1 List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount

Or Equal List Price Less Discount $102.00 Each $36.00 Each $48.95 Each No Bid No Bid
Discount 45% / $56.10 Each 14% / $30.96 Each 0% / $48.95 Each
Brand #1776 Spirit CXCD241 CLF1776
Manufacturer Califone Coby Califone

REJECT REJECT REJECT REJECT REJECT

DATE OF OPENING: April 19, 2006 @ 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: Televisions and CD Players

BID #06-139-MK


