District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Trophies & Awards — Number of Vendors 283
School System Notified
Bid Number 06-080-SW Number of Bids 31
Distributed
Date September 6, 2005 Number of Vendors 5
Solicited Responding
Date Opened October 20, 2005 Number of Vendors 0
Not Bidding
Date Board November 22, 2005 Number of Vendors 5
Presentation Bidding
Total Savings Estimated Savings - Grand Total of Bid “As Needed” Basis
$2,700.00 Estimated
$25,000.00

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet.

Term of Contract: This is the first year of a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual
agreement of all parties. The first year of the contract will commence on December 4, 2005 and expire on
December 3, 2006.

Notations and Exceptions: This is a total “all or none” bid, awarded to two vendors per region.
Award was based upon a weighted point system. Total price was based upon the sum of all categories.
Criteria for the weighted points system was based upon the following weights: Price (9); Vendor Location
(5); References (2); and Past Service (2). This is an “as needed” contract; therefore, estimated annual
expenditures may vary. Prices and discounts will remain firm and in effect throughout the term of the
contract; however, catalogs may be updated on a quarterly basis.

Bids from Trophy Land, and Unique Awards and Engraving were disqualified due to bid being an “all or
none” and vendors failed to bid on all categories. Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only
offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in
response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:
Sherry Wooten, Buyer Assistant

Bids Prepared By:
Mina Kaeding, Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized By:
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

Date/Time: November 16, 2005 08:40:00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m. Gulf Coast Graphics Gulf Side Trophies, Inc. Landmark Awards
BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards 8902 State Road 52 3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104 |311 N. Safford Ave.
BID #06-080-SW Hudson, FL 34667 Holiday, FL 34690 Tarpon Springs, FL 34689
727-861-1770 727-847-4884 727-938-1191
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
T-1 TROPHIES
T-la |13-inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $7.25 No Bid $7.40
Region 2: $7.25 No Bid $7.40
Region 3: $7.25 $6.50 $7.40
Region 4: $7.25 $6.50 $7.40
Region 5: $7.25 $6.50 $7.40
Region 6: $7.25 $6.50 $7.40
T-1b  |14-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $7.50 No Bid $7.80
Region 2: $7.50 No Bid $7.80
Region 3: $7.50 $6.75 $7.80
Region 4: $7.50 $6.75 $7.80
Region 5: $7.50 $6.75 $7.80
Region 6: $7.50 $6.75 $7.80
T-1c  |15-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $7.75 No Bid $8.20
Region 2: $7.75 No Bid $8.20
Region 3: $7.75 $7.00 $8.20
Region 4: $7.75 $7.00 $8.20
Region 5: $7.75 $7.00 $8.20
Region 6: $7.75 $7.00 $8.20




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
T-1d  |16-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $8.00 No Bid $8.60
Region 2: $8.00 No Bid $8.60
Region 3: $8.00 $7.25 $8.60
Region 4: $8.00 $7.25 $8.60
Region 5: $8.00 $7.25 $8.60
Region 6: $8.00 $7.25 $8.60
T-le |17-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $8.25 No Bid $9.00
Region 2: $8.25 No Bid $9.00
Region 3: $8.25 $7.50 $9.00
Region 4: $8.25 $7.50 $9.00
Region 5: $8.25 $7.50 $9.00
Region 6: $8.25 $7.50 $9.00
T-1f 18-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $8.50 No Bid $9.40
Region 2: $8.50 No Bid $9.40
Region 3: $8.50 $7.75 $9.40
Region 4: $8.50 $7.75 $9.40
Region 5: $8.50 $7.75 $9.40
Region 6: $8.50 $7.75 $9.40
T-1g |19-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Engraving
Region 1: $8.75 No Bid $9.80
Region 2: $8.75 No Bid $9.80
Region 3: $8.75 $8.00 $9.80
Region 4: $8.75 $8.00 $9.80
Region 5: $8.75 $8.00 $9.80
Region 6: $8.75 $8.00 $9.80




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

Total ""All or None" Bid Price Items T1a-T1g

Region 1: $56.00 No Bid $60.20
Region 2: $56.00 No Bid $60.20
Region 3: $56.00 $50.57 $60.20
Region 4: $56.00 $50.57 $60.20
Region 5: $56.00 $50.57 $60.20
Region 6: $56.00 $50.57 $60.20
Flat Service Charge under $50. No charge No Charge No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) 15% 10%-20% 20%

Catalog Name

Rising Stars

Reward The Drive

Ach Deserves Recognition

Ach. Deserves Recognition

Ach Deserves Recongition

Standard Number of Days Delivery - Trophies

Region 1: 3 No Bid 3
Region 2: 3 No Bid 3
Region 3: 3 3-5 3
Region 4: 3 3-5 3
Region 5: 3 3-5 3
Region 6: 3 3-5 3
T-2 PLAQUES
T-2a |5 x 7 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $13.00 No Bid $14.95
Region 2: $13.00 No Bid $14.95
Region 3: $13.00 $14.95 $14.95
Region 4: $13.00 $14.95 $14.95
Region 5: $13.00 $14.95 $14.95
Region 6: $13.00 $14.95 $14.95




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m. Gulf Coast Graphics Gulf Side Trophies, Inc. Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards 8902 State Road 52 3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104 |311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW Hudson, FL 34667 Holiday, FL 34690 Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770 727-847-4884 727-938-1191
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

T-2b |6 x 8 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $16.00 No Bid $16.95
Region 2: $16.00 No Bid $16.95
Region 3: $16.00 $16.95 $16.95
Region 4: $16.00 $16.95 $16.95
Region 5: $16.00 $16.95 $16.95
Region 6: $16.00 $16.95 $16.95

T-2¢ |7 x9 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $20.00 No Bid $18.95
Region 2: $20.00 No Bid $18.95
Region 3: $20.00 $18.95 $18.95
Region 4: $20.00 $18.95 $18.95
Region 5: $20.00 $18.95 $18.95
Region 6: $20.00 $18.95 $18.95

T-2d |8 x 10 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $26.00 No Bid $22.95
Region 2: $26.00 No Bid $22.95
Region 3: $26.00 $22.95 $22.95
Region 4: $26.00 $22.95 $22.95
Region 5: $26.00 $22.95 $22.95
Region 6: $26.00 $22.95 $22.95

T-2e |9 x 12 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $30.00 No Bid $24.95
Region 2: $30.00 No Bid $24.95
Region 3: $30.00 $24.95 $24.95
Region 4: $30.00 $24.95 $24.95
Region 5: $30.00 $24.95 $24.95
Region 6: $30.00 $24.95 $24.95




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
T-2f 10 x 14 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $35.00 No Bid $34.95
Region 2: $35.00 No Bid $34.95
Region 3: $35.00 $26.95 $34.95
Region 4: $35.00 $26.95 $34.95
Region 5: $35.00 $26.95 $34.95
Region 6: $35.00 $26.95 $34.95
T-2g |12 x 15 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving
Region 1: $40.00 No Bid $44.95
Region 2: $40.00 No Bid $44.95
Region 3: $40.00 $30.95 $44.95
Region 4: $40.00 $30.95 $44.95
Region 5: $40.00 $30.95 $44.95
Region 6: $40.00 $30.95 $44.95
T-2h  |Extra Lettering Over 75 Characters
Region 1: No charge No Bid No Charge
Region 2: No charge No Bid No Charge
Region 3: No charge $0.15 No Charge
Region 4: No charge $0.15 No Charge
Region 5: No charge $0.15 No Charge
Region 6: No charge $0.15 No Charge




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

Total ""All or None" Bid Price Items T2a-T2h

Region 1: $180.00 No Bid $178.65
Region 2: $180.00 No Bid $178.65
Region 3: $180.00 $156.80 $178.65
Region 4: $180.00 $156.80 $178.65
Region 5: $180.00 $156.80 $178.65
Region 6: $180.00 $156.80 $178.65
Flat Service Charge under $50. No charge No Charge No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%) 10% 10% to 25% 20%
Catalog Name Rising Star Corporate Awards Ach Deserves Recognition

Ach Deserves Recognition

Corporate Awards

Standard Number of Days Delivery - Plaques

Region 1: 3 No Bid 3
Region 2: 3 No Bid 3
Region 3: 3 3 3
Region 4: 3 3 3
Region 5: 3 3 3
Region 6: 3 3 3
T-2 PLAQUES/ALTERNATE

5 x 7 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid

Region 2: No Bid

Region 3: $9.95

Region 4: $9.95

Region 5: $9.95

Region 6: $9.95




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

6 x 8 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $12.95
Region 4: $12.95
Region 5: $12.95
Region 6: $12.95
7 x 9 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $14.95
Region 4: $14.95
Region 5: $14.95
Region 6: $14.95
8 x 10 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $16.95
Region 4: $16.95
Region 5: $16.95
Region 6: $16.95




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

9 x 12 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $19.95
Region 4: $19.95
Region 5: $19.95
Region 6: $19.95
10 x 14 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $21.95
Region 4: $21.95
Region 5: $21.95
Region 6: $21.95
12 x 15 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including Engraving

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $24.95
Region 4: $24.95
Region 5: $24.95
Region 6: $24.95




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
Extra Lettering Over 75 Characters
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $0.15
Region 4: $0.15
Region 5: $0.15
Region 6: $0.15
Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: $121.80
Region 4: $121.80
Region 5: $121.80
Region 6: $121.80
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%) 10% to 25%
Catalog Name Corporate Awards
Standard Number of Days Delivery - Plaques
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: 3
Region 4: 3
Region 5: 3
Region 6: 3




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
T-3ROSETTES
T3-a |10-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: $4.75 No Bid $4.75
Region 2: $4.75 No Bid $4.75
Region 3: $4.75 $4.10 $4.75
Region 4: $4.75 $4.10 $4.75
Region 5: $4.75 $4.10 $4.75
Region 6: $4.75 $4.10 $4.75
T3-b  |12-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: $4.95 No Bid $4.95
Region 2: $4.95 No Bid $4.95
Region 3: $4.95 $4.25 $4.95
Region 4: $4.95 $4.25 $4.95
Region 5: $4.95 $4.25 $4.95
Region 6: $4.95 $4.25 $4.95
T3-c  |14-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: $5.15 No Bid $5.15
Region 2: $5.15 No Bid $5.15
Region 3: $5.15 $4.50 $5.15
Region 4: $5.15 $4.50 $5.15
Region 5: $5.15 $4.50 $5.15
Region 6: $5.15 $4.50 $5.15
Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h
Region 1: $14.85 No Bid $14.85
Region 2: $14.85 No Bid $14.85
Region 3: $14.85 $12.85 $14.85
Region 4: $14.85 $12.85 $14.85
Region 5: $14.85 $12.85 $14.85
Region 6: $14.85 $12.85 $14.85
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Charge No Charge No Charge

10




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) 10% 5% to 15% 0% to 10%
Catalog Name Tower Ach. Deserves Rec Award O Ribbon Line

Ach Deserves Recognition

Champ Line

Rising Star

Tower Grand Champion Line

Optional Printing on Vertical Ribbon Per Letter/Space No charge No Charge No Charge
Standard Number of Days Delivery - Rosettes
Region 1: 7 No Bid 7
Region 2: 7 No Bid 7
Region 3: 7 7 7
Region 4: 7 7 7
Region 5: 7 7 7
Region 6: 7 7 7
T-4 MEDALS
1-3/4 Inch Medal
Region 1: $4.00 No Bid $2.80
T-4b  |Region 2: $4.00 No Bid $2.80
Region 3: $4.00 $3.95 $2.80
Region 4: $4.00 $3.95 $2.80
Region 5: $4.00 $3.95 $2.80
Region 6: $4.00 $3.95 $2.80
2-1/2 Inch Medal
Region 1: $5.00 No Bid $3.80
T-4b  |Region 2: $5.00 No Bid $3.80
Region 3: $5.00 $4.25 $3.80
Region 4: $5.00 $4.25 $3.80
Region 5: $5.00 $4.25 $3.80
Region 6: $5.00 $4.25 $3.80

11




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Gulf Coast Graphics

Gulf Side Trophies, Inc.

Landmark Awards

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

8902 State Road 52

3336 Grand Blvd. Suite 104

311 N. Safford Ave.

BID #06-080-SW

Hudson, FL 34667

Holiday, FL 34690

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

727-861-1770

727-847-4884

727-938-1191

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM# Regions 1, 2,3,4,5 &6 |Regions3,4,5&6 Regions 1, 2

Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h

Region 1: $9.00 No Bid $6.60
Region 2: $9.00 No Bid $6.60
Region 3: $9.00 $8.20 $6.60
Region 4: $9.00 $8.20 $6.60
Region 5: $9.00 $8.20 $6.60
Region 6: $9.00 $8.20 $6.60
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) 10% 10% to 25% 10% to 20%

Catalog Name

Rising Star

Reward The Drive

Ach Deserves Recognition

Ach Deserves Recognition

Flat service Charge for Orders Under $50.00

No Charge

No Charge

No Charge

Optional Printing per Letter/Space

$0.10

*$0

Per quote

Standard Number of Days Delivery - Medals

Region 1:

No Bid

Region 2:

No Bid

Region 3:

3

Region 4:

Region 5:

Region 6:

WlWlWlw|w|w

3
3
3

Wl W|Ww|w|w|w

Total Points

Region 1

63

No Bid

55

Region 2

63

No Bid

55

Region 3

68

83

55

Region 4

73

78

55

Region 5

68

83

55

Region 6

63

88

55

12




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
T-1 TROPHIES
T-la |13-inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng!
Region 1: $11.50 No Bid
Region 2: $11.50 No Bid
Region 3: $11.50 No Bid
Region 4: $11.50 No Bid
Region 5: $11.50 $7.40
Region 6: $11.50 $7.40
T-1b  |14-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $12.00 No Bid
Region 2: $12.00 No Bid
Region 3: $12.00 No Bid
Region 4: $12.00 No Bid
Region 5: $12.00 $7.75
Region 6: $12.00 $7.75
T-1c  |15-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $12.50 No Bid
Region 2: $12.50 No Bid
Region 3: $12.50 No Bid
Region 4: $12.50 No Bid
Region 5: $12.50 $8.15
Region 6: $12.50 $8.15

13




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
T-1d  |16-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $13.00 No Bid
Region 2: $13.00 No Bid
Region 3: $13.00 No Bid
Region 4: $13.00 No Bid
Region 5: $13.00 $8.50
Region 6: $13.00 $8.50
T-1le  |17-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $13.50 No Bid
Region 2: $13.50 No Bid
Region 3: $13.50 No Bid
Region 4: $13.50 No Bid
Region 5: $13.50 $8.75
Region 6: $13.50 $8.75
T-1f 18-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $14.00 No Bid
Region 2: $14.00 No Bid
Region 3: $14.00 No Bid
Region 4: $14.00 No Bid
Region 5: $14.00 $9.25
Region 6: $14.00 $9.25
T-1g |19-Inch w/Single Column, Base, Top and 5" Figure Including Eng
Region 1: $14.50 No Bid
Region 2: $14.50 No Bid
Region 3: $14.50 No Bid
Region 4: $14.50 No Bid
Region 5: $14.50 $9.75
Region 6: $14.50 $9.75
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
Total ""All or None" Bid Price Items T1la-T1g
Region 1: $91.00 No Bid
Region 2: $91.00 No Bid
Region 3: $91.00 No Bid
Region 4: $91.00 No Bid
Region 5: $91.00 $59.55
Region 6: $91.00 $59.55
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Charge No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) *0% 5%
Catalog Name Trophy Land Reward The Drive
Quantity Discount
Standard Number of Days Delivery - Trophies
Region 1: 3 No Bid
Region 2: 4 No Bid
Region 3: 4 No Bid
Region 4: 5 No Bid
Region 5: 5 3
Region 6: 5 3
T-2 PLAQUES
T-2a |5 x 7 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E
Region 1: $15.00 No Bid
Region 2: $15.00 No Bid
Region 3: $15.00 No Bid
Region 4: $15.00 No Bid
Region 5: $15.00 $14.50
Region 6: $15.00 $14.50
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
T-2b |6 x 8 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E
Region 1: $20.00 No Bid
Region 2: $20.00 No Bid
Region 3: $20.00 No Bid
Region 4: $20.00 No Bid
Region 5: $20.00 $16.50
Region 6: $20.00 $16.50
T-2c |7 x 9 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E
Region 1: $25.00 No Bid
Region 2: $25.00 No Bid
Region 3: $25.00 No Bid
Region 4: $25.00 No Bid
Region 5: $25.00 $19.00
Region 6: $25.00 $19.00
T-2d |8 x 10 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including |
Region 1: $31.00 No Bid
Region 2: $31.00 No Bid
Region 3: $31.00 No Bid
Region 4: $31.00 No Bid
Region 5: $31.00 $25.00
Region 6: $31.00 $25.00
T-2e |9 x 12 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including |
Region 1: $44.00 No Bid
Region 2: $44.00 No Bid
Region 3: $44.00 No Bid
Region 4: $44.00 No Bid
Region 5: $44.00 $30.00
Region 6: $44.00 $30.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m. Trophy Land, Inc. Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards 4821 Allen Rd. 5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW Zephyrhills, FL 33541 | New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347 727-846-0992
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM#

T-2f 10 x 14 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including
Region 1: *57.00 No Bid
Region 2: *57.00 No Bid
Region 3: *57.00 No Bid
Region 4: *57.00 No Bid
Region 5: *57.00 $35.00
Region 6: *57.00 $35.00

*10.5 x 13

T-2g |12 x 15 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Includin
Region 1: $70.00 No Bid
Region 2: $70.00 No Bid
Region 3: $70.00 No Bid
Region 4: $70.00 No Bid
Region 5: $70.00 $39.00
Region 6: $70.00 $39.00

T-2h  |Extra Lettering Over 75 Characters
Region 1: No Charge No Bid
Region 2: No Charge No Bid
Region 3: No Charge No Bid
Region 4: No Charge No Bid
Region 5: No Charge No Charge
Region 6: No Charge No Charge
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#

Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h

Region 1: $262.00 No Bid
Region 2: $262.00 No Bid
Region 3: $262.00 No Bid
Region 4: $262.00 No Bid
Region 5: $262.00 $179.00
Region 6: $262.00 $179.00
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Charge No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) 0% 0%
Catalog Name Trophy Land Air Flyte, Barhill

Standard Number of Days Delivery - Plaques

Region 1: 3 No Bid
Region 2: 4 No Bid
Region 3: 4 No Bid
Region 4: 5 No Bid
Region 5: 5 3
Region 6: 5 3
T-2 PLAQUES/ALTERNATE

5 x 7 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $10.00
Region 6: $10.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#

6 x 8 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $13.00
Region 6: $13.00
7 x 9 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including E

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $15.00
Region 6: $15.00
8 x 10 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including |

Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $21.00
Region 6: $21.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m. Trophy Land, Inc. Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards 4821 Allen Rd. 5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW Zephyrhills, FL 33541 | New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347 727-846-0992
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM#
9 x 12 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including |
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $25.00
Region 6: $25.00
10 x 14 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Including
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $30.00
Region 6: $30.00
12 x 15 w/Metal Plate, Figure (or Art) and Walnut Base, Includin
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $37.50
Region 6: $37.50

20



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
Extra Lettering Over 75 Characters
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: No Charge
Region 6: No Charge
Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: $151.50
Region 6: $151.50
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Charge
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) 5%
Catalog Name Air Flyte
Barhill
Standard Number of Days Delivery - Plaques
Region 1: No Bid
Region 2: No Bid
Region 3: No Bid
Region 4: No Bid
Region 5: 3
Region 6: 3
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#
T-3 ROSETTES
T3-a |10-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: Not Available No Bid
Region 2: Not Available No Bid
Region 3: Not Available No Bid
Region 4: Not Available No Bid
Region 5: Not Available No Bid
Region 6: Not Available No Bid
T3-b  |12-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: Not Available No Bid
Region 2: Not Available No Bid
Region 3: Not Available No Bid
Region 4: Not Available No Bid
Region 5: Not Available No Bid
Region 6: Not Available No Bid
T3-c  |14-1/2 Inch Rosette
Region 1: Not Available No Bid
Region 2: Not Available No Bid
Region 3: Not Available No Bid
Region 4: Not Available No Bid
Region 5: Not Available No Bid
Region 6: Not Available No Bid
Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h
Region 1: No Bid No Bid
Region 2: No Bid No Bid
Region 3: No Bid No Bid
Region 4: No Bid No Bid
Region 5: No Bid No Bid
Region 6: No Bid No Bid
Flat Service Charge under $50. No Bid No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM#

Discount off Balance of Line (%0) No Bid No Bid

Catalog Name

Optional Printing on Vertical Ribbon Per Letter/Space No Bid No Bid

Standard Number of Days Delivery - Rosettes

Region 1: No Bid No Bid

Region 2: No Bid No Bid

Region 3: No Bid No Bid

Region 4: No Bid No Bid

Region 5: No Bid No Bid

Region 6: No Bid No Bid

T-4 MEDALS

1-3/4 Inch Medal

Region 1: Not Available No Bid
T-4b  |Region 2: Not Available No Bid

Region 3: Not Available No Bid

Region 4: Not Available No Bid

Region 5: Not Available $4.50

Region 6: Not Available $4.50

2-1/2 Inch Medal

Region 1: Not Available No Bid
T-4b  |Region 2: Not Available No Bid

Region 3: Not Available No Bid

Region 4: Not Available No Bid

Region 5: Not Available $5.00

Region 6: Not Available $5.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: October 20, 2005, @ 2:30 p.m.

Trophy Land, Inc.

Unique Awards & Engraving

BID TITLE: Trophies and Awards

4821 Allen Rd.

5641 Main Street

BID #06-080-SW

Zephyrhills, FL 33541

New Port Richey, FL 34652

813-783-1347

727-846-0992

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM#

Total ""All or None' Bid Price Items T2a-T2h
Region 1: No Bid No Bid
Region 2: No Bid No Bid
Region 3: No Bid No Bid
Region 4: No Bid No Bid
Region 5: No Bid $9.50
Region 6: No Bid $9.50
Discount off Balance of Line (%0) No Bid 5%
Catalog Name Reward The Drive
Flat service Charge for Orders Under $50.00 No Bid No Charge
Optional Printing per Letter/Space No Bid Not Applicable
Standard Number of Days Delivery - Medals
Region 1: No Bid No Bid
Region 2: No Bid No Bid
Region 3: No Bid No Bid
Region 4: No Bid No Bid
Region 5: No Bid 3
Region 6: No Bid 3
Total Points Disqualified Disqualified

Region 1

Region 2

Region 3

Region 4

Region 5

Region 6
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