
Date/Time: December 14, 2005 09:55:00 

 
 
 

Bid Title Musical Instruments - 
Elementary 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

65 

Bid Number 06-101-MK  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

19 

Date 
Solicited 

October 25, 2005  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

8 

Date Opened November 16, 2005  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

2 

Date Board 
Presentation 

December 20, 2005  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

6 

Total Savings Estimated Savings 
$ 11,290.12 

 Grand Total of Bid Estimated Total 
$ 35,517.48 

Recommendation:   Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as 
lowest and best bid meeting written specifications. 
 
Term of Contract:   This is a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual agreement of both 
parties.  The first year of the contract will commence on January 19, 2006 through January 18, 2007. 
 
Notations and Exceptions:   
M-5 and M-5a:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Interstate Music as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications.  Lower bid from Rhythm Band Instruments did not meet bid specifications, 
(i.e., item is made of polyfiber skin). 
 
M-7 through M-10:  Reject. Items are listed as total “all or none”. Items M-9 and M-10 are 
discontinued.  New specifications will be developed.  Request permission to obtain quotes and 
purchase on the open market.    
 
Bids Evaluated By: 
Kathy Sanz, Supervisor, Curriculum and Instructional Services  
 
Bids Prepared By: 
Mina Kaeding, Buyer 
 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 
 



Date/Time: 

Page 2 
06-101-MK Musical Instruments - Elementary 
Recommendation 
 
M-16:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Rhythm Band Instruments as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from Peripole-Bergerault did not meet bid specifications, (i.e., no built-in 
thumb rest and no neck strap). 
 
M-28 through M-31c:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World as best bid meeting 
written specifications.  Lower bid from Interstate Music did not supply cut sheets and complete 
specifications as required in the bid documents for alternate items bid. 
 
M-55:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from Interstate Music did not supply cut sheets and complete specifications 
as required in the bid documents for alternate items bid. 
 
M-57:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from Interstate Music did not supply cut sheets and complete specifications 
as required in the bid documents for alternate items bid. 
 
M-81:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from TEI Electronics did not supply cut sheets and complete specifications 
as required in the bid documents for alternate items bid. 
 
Unit costs will remain firm throughout the contract period.  Estimated total cost was based upon four 
new Elementary schools anticipated requirements. 
 
Two “No Bids” were received from NEMC and West Music.  Offers from the vendors listed herein are 
the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.  All other offers submitted in 
response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE
HAND DRUMS

M-1 8" Hand Drums: $11.30 $12.50 $13.80 $14.00 $12.95 $18.50
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8508 As Specified As Specified PB4908N As Specified As Specified As Specified

M-2 10" Hand Drums: $12.09 $13.25 $16.25 $15.50 $13.95 $19.93
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8510 As Specified As Specified PB 4910N As Specified As Specified As Specified

M-3 12" Hand Drums: $14.43 $15.70 $19.00 $19.00 $17.25 $24.65
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8512 As Specified As Specified PB4912N As Specified As Specified As Specified

M-4 14" Hand Drums: $16.32 $17.75 $23.00 $22.00 $18.95 $28.50
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8514 As Specified As Specified PB4914N As Specified As Specified As Specified
Total "all or none" M-1 Through M-4 $54.14 $59.20 $72.05 $70.00 $63.10 $91.58

M-5 10" Pre-Tuned Tambourine: $12.62 $13.60 $15.75 $12.90 $10.45 $14.93
Manufacturer: Remo TARES511070 As Specified As Specified PB 4610 As Specified RB TAM10 RB TAM10

M-5a 8" Single Row Jingles Tamourine: $11.48 $12.50 $11.99 $12.00 $8.80 $12.58
Manufacturer: Remo TARES510870 As Specified As Specified PB4607 As Specified RB TAM8 RB TAM8

M-6 Tuneable Bongo Drum: $99.54 $44.10 $104.45 No Bid $57.00 $81.43
Manufacturer: CP Matadoe PA532 LP Matidor M201 As Specified PB230N RB 1306 RB RBI36

ROTO TOMS
M-7 12" Roto Toms: $102.88 $111.90 No Bid No Bid $66.00 $74.29/$27.58

Mfg: Remo ER-0012-03RT, ST-2000-00, P92 Remo Self Sub 3f Malle As Specified
RB ST12 w/space tom, 
stand, and P92 mallets RBI ST12/P92

BID: 06-101-MK



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-8 14" Roto Toms: $110.47 $120.90 No Bid No Bid $73.00 $84.29/$28.58

Mfg: Remo ER-0014-03RT, ST2000-00, P92 Remo Self Sub 3f malletAs Specified
RB ST14 w/space tom, 
stand, and P92 mallets RBI ST14/P92

M-9 16" Roto Toms: Discontinued Not Available No Bid No Bid $81.00 $95.72/$28.58

Mfg: Remo ER0016-03T, ST2000-00, P92
RB ST16 w/space tom, 
stand, and P92 mallets RBI ST16/P92

M-10 18" Roto Toms: Discontinued Not Available No Bid No Bid $84.00 $101.43/$28.58

Mfg: Remo ER0018-03RT, ST2000-00, P92
RB ST18 w/space tom, 
stand, and P92 mallets RBIST18/P92

Total "all or none" M-7 Through M-10 $213.35 $232.80 Disqualified No Bid $304.00 $281.44/$85.74
M-11 Autoharp: $142.55 $114.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00 $131.43/$35.72

Mfg: Rhythm Band RB1545, RB1509 As Specified As Specified As Specified RBI1545/RBI1509

TONE CHIMES HAND BELLS
M-12 Tone  Chimes Hand Bells: Range G4-G6 $688.05 $656.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Suzuki HB-25 As Specified As Specified

M-13 Tone Chimes Hand Bells: G6-C7 $531.83 $506.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Suzuki HB-12A As Specified As Specified

M-14 Tone Chime Hand Bells: C7-G7 $615.35 $572.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Suzuki HB-12B As Specified As Specified
Total "all or none" M-12 Through M-14 $1,835.23 $1,734.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-15 25-Resonator Bells: $247.75 $229.50 $558.10 No Bid $205.00 $131.43
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB2122 As Specified As Specified PB2125 As Specified As Specified

M-16 Soprano Recorders Aulos: $6.42 $6.30 $2.30 No Bid $5.75 $7.86
Manufacturer: Auolos or Equal Aulos A103N No Strap Aulos A103N PB6101 Aulos A103N Aulos A103N
 

M-17 Soprano Recorders; $1.36 $2.64 $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Angel REAN101
bag & cleaning rod 
only As Specified PB6000

BLOCKS
M-18 Sand Blocks (Pairs): $1.99 $3.40 $6.70 No Bid $1.75 $2.50

Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB753 As Specified As Specified PB5301 As Specified As Specified

M-19 Small Rosewood Blocks w/Mallet $18.51 $18.00 $9.95 No Bid $21.25 $35.72
Manufacturer: Sonor WOSOV220 Sonor V2200 As Specified PB5205 Sonor LWB1 Sonor LWB1

M-20 Large Rosewood Blcoks w/Mallet $23.34 $23.00 $9.95 No Bid $29.75 $50.00
Manufacturer: Sonor WOSOV2202 Sonor V2202 As Specified PB5205 Sonor LWB2 Sonor LWB2

M-21 Guiro Tone Blocks: $2.30 $2.55 $5.25 No Bid $2.00 $2.95
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB756 As Specified As Specified PB5203 As Specified RBI756

M-22 Stir Xylophone Woodblock: Not available $10.12 No Bid No Bid $9.25 $12.95
Manufacturer: West XYWM39 As Specified RB RB1065 RBI1065
Total "all or none" M-18 Through M-22 $46.14 $57.07 Disqualified No Bid $64.00 $104.12



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

TRIANGLES
M-23 4" Triangles: Steel $13.51 $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Studio TRSTT10 Studio 49T10 As Specified

M-24 4" Triangles: Chrome Steel $11.06 $13.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2350 Sonor V2350 As Specified

M-25 6" Triangles: Chrome Steel $16.90 $17.10 $5.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2352 Sonor V2352 As Specified PB3201/PB3201

M-26 7" Triangles: Chrome Steel $17.71 $19.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2353 Sonor V2353 As Specified

M-27 Finger Cymbals: $11.12 $10.45 $6.75/Pair No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Zildjian or Equal CYMPO771  Zildjian 0771 PB3507
Total "all or none" M-23 Through M-27 $70.30 $73.55 Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid

M-28 Rhythm Sticks Set: $9.77 $14.20 $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB802 As Specified As Specified PB5001A

M-29 18" Hardwood Slapsticks: $9.81 $28.50 $19.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West SLDWM62 Grover PA094 As Specified PB5207



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-30 13" Hardwood Slapstick: $9.02 $15.50 $19.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West SLBLM63 Grover 15PAO9415 As Specified PB5207

M-31 Scarf Set:
A. 27" $63.25 $70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: West SCID27 As Specified As Specified
B. 36" $86.25 $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: West SCID36 As Specified As Specified
C. 54" $126.50 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: West SCID54 As Specified As Specified
Total "all or none" M-28 Through M-31C $304.60 $348.20 Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid

M-32 Cabasa: Small Size $18.97 $16.90 $25.90 No Bid $16.00 $22.86
Manufacturer: West CALP234 LP234A As Specified PB5404 RBRB663 RBI663

M-33 Maracas: Large, Colored Wood $7.08 $7.90 $12.50 No Bid $6.00 $8.58
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB1201 As Specified As Specified PB5502 As Specified RBI1201

M-34 Maracas: Deluxe Professional $6.68 $8.10 No Bid No Bid Discontinued $13.50

Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB100X
Universal Precussion 
PA096 As Specified LP281 

Total "all or none" M-32 Through M-34 $32.73 $32.90 Disqualified No Bid $22.00 $44.94



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.

New Berlin, WI 53151 Holicong, PA 18928 Salem, OR 97309 Apollo Beach, FL 33572 Ft. Worth, TX 76101 Hialeah, FL 33010
800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-35 Ratchet: $13.30 $16.50 $25.99 No Bid $14.00 $20.00
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB701 Union PA087 As Specified PB5208 As Specified As Specified

M-36 Claves: $1.65 $8.20 $12.95 No Bid $9.50 $12.50
Manufacturer: Sonor CLS02602 HOHNER S2603 As Specified PB5102 RB724 RBI724 (USA)

M-37 Deep Bass Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $127.00 $109.74 $250.07 No Bid $116.25 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sonor KS50PO As Specified As Specified PB1408C KS50Po-C

M-38 Bass Xylophones: $934.00 $909.74 $908.55 No Bid $1,111.35 $965.00
Manufacturer: Sonor GBKX100 As Specified As Specified PB1121C As Specified RBI8662

M-39 Tenor-Alto Xylophones: $410.00 $399.74 $477.44 No Bid $488.25 $594.15
Manufacturer: Sonor TAKX100 As Specified As Specified PB1131C As Specified RBI 9665 22 bars

M-40 Soprano Xylophones: $247.00 $270.74 $305.55 No Bid $330.15 $335.10
Manufacturer: Sonor SKX100 As Specified As Specified PB1101C As Specified RBI9669

M-41 Bass Metallophone: $820.00 $773.74 $855.10 No Bid $976.50 $725.29
Manufacturer: Sonor GBKM10 As Specified As Specified PB1321 As Specified RBI 9773

M-42 Tenor-Alto Metallophone: $399.00 $394.74 $449.36 No Bid $478.95 $519.10
Manufacturer: Sonor TAKM10 As Specified As Specified PB1331 As Specified RBI 9775 22 bars

M-43 Soprano Metallophone: $274.00 $267.74 $287.57 No Bid $325.50 $225.72
Manufacturer: Sonor SKM10 As Specified As Specified PB1301 As Specified RBI 9779



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.
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ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-44 Alto Glockenspiels: $123.00 $121.74 $136.36 No Bid $148.80 $223.43
Manufacturer: Sonor TAGL1 As Specified As Specified PB1231 As Specified RBI 9554 22 bars

M-45 Deep Bass C-F# Palisono Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $199.00 $109.74 $266.91 No Bid $940.73 No Bid

Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS50PO
Sonor 
KS50POCTOF#/7 bars As Specified

PB1408C Octave 
C/PB2510 Sonor KS50PO/SCH11

 
M-46 Conta Bass Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $212.00 $173.74 $302.12 No Bid $1,411.80 No Bid

Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS60PO Sonor KS60PO F-P# As Specified

,
PB1405C-G, 
PB1406C-A, 
PB1407C-B, 
PB13C-F#, KS60PO/SCH100

 
M-47 Sub-Contra Bass C-E w/Yarn Mallet: $311.00 $270.74 $341.95 No Bid $1,757.75 No Bid

Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS100PO Sonor KS100PO As Specified

,
PB1402C-D, 
PB1403C-E, 
PB1412C-D#, 
PB250 Mallet Sonor KS100PO/SCH100

 
M-48 Soprano Glockenspiels: $117.00 $115.74 $101.16 No Bid $139.50 $215.29

Manufacturer: Sonor SGL1 Sonor SGL1 As Specified PB1201 As Specified RBI 9557 22 bars

Total "all or none" M-35 Through M-48 $7,076.00 $3,917.88 $4,682.13 No Bid $8,225.53 Disqualified



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  November 16, 2005 @ 10:00 A.M. Intersate Music Keyboard World Peripole-Bergerault Pianorama Rhythm Band Instruments TEI Electronics, Inc
BID TITLE: Musical Instruments - Elementary 13819 W. National Ave P.O. Box 709 P.O. Box 12909 118C Flamingo Dr. P.O. Box 126 750 W. 18th St.
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800-982-2263 x114 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 813-645-1774 800-424-4724 305-888-3980

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

BID: 06-101-MK

M-49 Storage Cart: $295.65 $249.00 No Bid No Bid $240.00 $335.00
Manufacturer: Rhytm Band RB39 As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified 

M-50 Axatse: No Bid $89.50 $19.25 No Bid No Bid Not Available
Manufacturer: West CAWMCA2 As Specified PB5407

M-51 Temple Blocks: $159.05 $170.00 $247.38 No Bid No Bid Not Available

Manufacturer: West TEBLAR
Wood Crafted PERC 
PA290 As Specified PB4560

M-52 Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 12' $24.25 $33.00 No Bid No Bid $26.35 $39.63
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE021200 Remo ETO21200 As Specified Remo ET021200 Remo ET021200

M-53 Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 16" $30.32 $41.00 No Bid No Bid $34.00 $51.15
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE021600 Remo ETO21600 As Specified Remo ET021600 ET021600

M-54 Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 22" $41.32 $56.00 No Bid No Bid $47.50 $72.50
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE022200 Remo ETO22200 As Specified Remo ET022200 ET022200
Total "all or none" M-52 through M-54" $95.89 $130.00 No Bid No Bid $107.85 $163.28

M-55 18" Hand-Hammered Gongs: $91.22 $170.00 $186.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: West GOWM18
WUHAN 
CYMWU00718 As Specified PB3920

M-56 Rainstick: $21.99 $16.50 $31.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: RAWM1130 LP WB292 32" As Specified PB5515
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BID: 06-101-MK

M-57 Slide Whistle: $5.72 $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West WHAMC219 Grover PA115 Metal As Specified

COWBELL
M-58 5" Cowbell: $15.52 $16.00 $14.99 $23.40 No Bid $16.50

Manufacturer: Latin Percussion COLP204A LP LP204A As Specified PB3305 As Specified LP 140LP204A

M-59 8" Cowbell: $19.83 $20.50 $16.99 $29.00 No Bid $21.10
Manufacturer: Latin Percussion COLP229 LP LP229 As Specified PB3307 As Specified LP 140LP229
Total "all or none "M-58 through M-59 $35.35 $36.50 $31.98 $51.00 No Bid $37.60

M-60 Vibra-Slap $21.56 $23.40 $21.95 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:Latin Percussion LP208 As Specified As Specified PB5210 As Specified

M-61 Chime Tree: No Bid $65.00 $82.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West M166 As Specified PB3900

M-62 Keyboard: $207.44 $116.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00
Manufacturer:Yamaha PSR282 Yamaha PSR293KIT Yamaha PSRE203 Casio CTK100

M-63 Duck Guiro Rhythm Instrument: No Bid No Bid $23.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:Peripole PB7020 As Specified

M-64 Billfrog Guiro Rhythm Instrument: No Bid No Bid $28.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB0722 As Specified
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BID: 06-101-MK

M-65 Sound Bench Board Play: No Bid No Bid $42.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB0730 As Specified

M-66 Sound Bench Play: No Bid No Bid $40.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB7006 As Specified

M-67 Resonator Bell Block Play: No Bid No Bid $117.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB7001 As Specified

M-68 Paddle Drums:
a. 8" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $26.84 $27.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo w/ Mattet PARE10080 Remo PD100800 As Specified
b. 10" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $29.37 $29.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo w/ Mattet PARE101000 Remo PS101000 As Specified
c. 12" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $33.28 $33.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo w/Mallet PARE101200 Remo PD101200 As Specified
d. 14" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $35.92 $36.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo w/Mallet PARE101400 Remo PD101400 As Specified
e. 16" Paddle Drum w/Mallet Discontinued $49.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Eemo w/Mallet PARE101600 As Specified
Total "all or none" M-68a Through M-68e $125.41 $177.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

M-69 Paddle Drum Set: $99.54 $105.00 No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Remo PARE481400 Remo PD481400 As Specified As Specified
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BID: 06-101-MK

M-70 Pretuned Tubanos:
a. Small 10 X 26" $85.74 $93.53 $132.84 $111.60 No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo TURE051009 As Specified As Specified PB4150 As Specified
b. Medium 12 X 26" $94.94 $109.53 $141.64 $125.60 No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo TURE051209 As Specified As Specified PB4151 As Specified
c. Large 14 X 26" $108.74 $141.53 $150.44 $146.70 No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer: Remo TURE051409 As Specified As Specified PB4152 As Specified
Total "all or none" M-70a Through M-70c $289.42 $344.59 $424.92 $375.00 No Bid No Bid

M-71 Kid's Tubano: $62.58 $79.40 $51.51 $70.00 $112.95
Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion TURE001001 Remo KD001001 As Specified PB4104S $86.00 Remo KD001001 Remo KD001001

As Specified
M-72 Kid's Djembe: $45.18 $57.40 No Bid $59.00 $48.50 $79.95

Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion DJRE060801 Remo KD060801 As Specified As Specified Remo KD060801 Remo KD06801

M-73 Kid's Floor Tom w/Mallet: $30.38 $38.40 $48.35 $38.00 $30.50 $49.15
Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion w/Mallet 508001 Remo KD508001 As Specified PB4103S As Specified Remo KD508001 Remo KD508001

M-74 Gathering Drums:
a. Kid's Gathering Deum: 21 X 22" $111.04 $135.00 No Bid $160.00 $127.50 $208.75

Manufacturer: Remo GARE522201 Remo KD 522201 As Specified As Specified Remo KD522201 Remo KD522201
b. Kid's Gathering Drum: 8 X 22" $69.87 $79.00 $138.00 $85.60 $76.55 $112.21

Manufacturer: Remo GARE582201 Remo KD582201 Remo Gare522201 PB4100L As Specified Remo KD582201 RBI KD582201
Total "all or none" M-74a Through M-74b $180.91 $214.00 Disqualified $240.00 $204.05 $563.01
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M-75 Guiro: Fish Shaped $13.73 $8.00 $13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:West GUWM4340 Union PD875 As Specified PB5400
 

M-76 Bullfrog Guiro: Small $29.61 $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:West GUDW250 As Specified As Specified

M-77 Bullfrog Guiro: Large $32.14 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West GUDW300 As Specified As Specified

M-78 Wooden Frog Rasps: $14.72 $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG1 As Specified As Specified
 

M-79 Medium Frog Rasps: $22.08 $29.00 $17.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG2 As Specified As Specified PB5209
 

M-80 Large Frog Rasps: $29.44 $36.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG3 As Specified As Specified No Bid
Total "all or none" M-75 Through M-80 $141.72 $171.00 Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid

M-81 Keyboard: $207.44 $166.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00
Manufacturer:Yamaha PSR273 Yamaha PSR293KIT As Specified Casio CTK800
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF ALTERNATE
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M-82 Kid's Percussion: $62.58 $117.80 $94.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:Remo or Equal Remo KD001001 KD0010TKD5080 PB4104S, PB4103S

M-83a Kid's Konga: $34.98 $46.90 $51.15 $45.00 $35.90 $56.75
Manufacturer: Remo CORE150601 Remo KD150601 As Specified PB4104S As Specified Remo KD150601 Remo KD150601

M-83b Kid's Bongos: $29.00 $36.10 $49.31 $35.00 $28.50 $41.10
Manufacturer: Remo BORE54001 Remo KD540001 As Specified PB4220S As Specified Remo KD540001 Remo KD540001
Total "all or none" M-83a Through M-83b $63.98 $83.00 $100.46 $80.00 $64.40 $97.85

M-84 Sleigh Bells: 13 Bells $5.70 $7.80 $10.50 No Bid $4.75 $7.25
Manufacturer Rhythm Band RB808 West SB13 PB3005 RB 808 RBI 808 

M-85 Sleigh Bells: 25 Bells $9.00 $15.80 $18.75 No Bid $7.50 $11.95
Manufacturer Rhythm Band 809 West SB25 PB3004 RB 809 RBI 809

M-86 Mini Plastic Maracas: $6.61 $8.50 $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West MAWMFMM or Equal As Specified As Specified PB5504

M-87 Ndjuka Walking Stick: 48 X 1" No Bid Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Remo or Equal

Delivery 15-30 Delivery 15-30bid documents on all


