District School Board of Pasco County Bid Recommendation

Bid Title	Classroom Retrofit Supplies	Number of Vendors Notified	367
Bid Number	11-062-AF	Number of Bids Distributed	69
Date Solicited	November 17, 2010	Number of Vendors Bidding	14
Date Opened	December 13, 2010	Number of Formal "No Bid" Responses	0
Date Board Presentation	February 1, 2011	Funding Source	*See below
Total Savings	Estimated \$11,800	Grand Total of Bid	Estimated \$144,000

Recommendation:

Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on attached bid tabulation sheet, as lowest and best, responsive and responsible bids meeting written specifications.

Term of Contract:

This is a one-year contract for a firm-fixed price on an "as-needed" basis for various classroom retrofit supplies. This contract will commence on February 2, 2011 and be effective through February 1, 2012.

Notations and Exceptions:

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Awards for line items CR-01 and CR-06 through CR-20 were based upon the lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid for categories of (11-50). Awards for line items CR-02 through CR-05 were based upon the lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid price as outlined in the bid specifications.

*Various funding sources: Capital, General, and Internal

Bids Evaluated By:

Dave Beals, Crew Chief, Maintenance and Facilities Services

Bids Prepared By:

Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant, Purchasing Department

Reviewed and Authorized By:

Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

rg2

Date/Time: January 26, 2011 08:17:00

DATEC	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.	B & H Photo Video Pro-Audio	BES Industries, Inc.
BID TI	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies		6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11	BID#11-062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				***************************************
ITEM#					***************************************
CR-01	Amplifier: (Paso DMA 2015 or equal)			No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model	Paso / DMA 2015	Paso / DMA 2015B		TOA / BG-1015
	Deliver Date (aro)	7 - 21 Days	30 Days		15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$168.00	\$227.50		\$163,54
	Each: 11-50	\$165.00	221.50		\$160.43
	Each: 50-100	\$152.00	\$221,50		66.6518
	Each: 101+	\$152.00	\$220.00		\$157.99
CR-02	Classroom Sound Equipment				
Α.	Speakers: (Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		Atlas / GD87W	Atlas / GD87W	Atlas Sound / GD87W
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days	7-10 Days	15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$28.95	\$28.00	\$30.29
	Each: 11-50		\$27.20	\$28.00	\$29.72
	Each: 50-100		\$27.20	\$28.00	\$28.99
	Each: 101+		\$27.20	\$28.00	\$27.99
	Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: (Atlas Sound model 81-8Ror equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model	**************************************	Atlas / 81-8R	Atlas / 818R	Atlas Sound / 81-8R
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days	7-10 Days	15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$7.20	\$7.00	66.8\$
	Each: 11-50		\$9.98	87.00	\$8.53
	Each: 50-100		\$6.55	00.78	\$8,39
	Each: 101+		\$6.35	\$7.00	\$7.99
ن	Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: (Atlas Sound model #95-8 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		Atlas / CS95-8	Atlas / BMT95-8	Atlas Sound / 95-8
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days	7-10 Days	15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$13.80	17.00 * Sold only in multiples of 2: \$34	\$16.25
	Each: 11-50		\$13,25	17.00 * Sold only in multiples of 2: \$34	\$15,99
	Each: 50-100		\$13,25	17.00 * Sold only in multiples of 2: \$34	\$15.75
	Each: 101+		\$13.20	17.00 * Sold only in multiples of 2; \$34	\$15.49
	CR-02 (A THROUGH C) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11-50	No Bid	\$15.70	\$23.00	\$18.08
	The state of the s				

DATE (DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Camcor, Inc.	Intellis Media	Jersey Jim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
BID TT.	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2273 S. Church St., P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave, TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11	BID #11-062-AF	Burlington, NC 27215	Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM#	U# DESCRIPTION				
CR-01	Amplifier: (Paso DMA 2015 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	TOA / BG115	AudioGear / 70167
	[Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$148,00	\$150.00
	Each: 11-50		\$167.00	\$148.00	\$146.34
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$148.00	\$142.86
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$148,00	\$139.53
CR-02	Classroom Sound Equipment				
Α.	Speakers: (Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Atlas Sound / GD87W	AudioGear / 70173
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$31.50	\$84,64
	Each: 11-50		\$29.00	\$31.50	\$82.57
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$31.50	\$80.61
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$31.50	\$78.73
<u> </u>	Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: (Atlas Sound model 81-8Ror equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Atias Sound / 81-8R	Included w/speakers
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$8.90	Included w/speakers
	Each: 11-50		89.00	\$8,90	Included w/speakers
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$8.90	Included w/speakers
	Each; 101+		No Bíd	\$8.90	Included w/speakers
ť	Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: (Atlas Sound model #95-8 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Atlas Sound / 95-8	Included w/speakers
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Day	15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$15.80	Included w/speakers
	Each: 11-50		\$14.00	\$15.80	Included w/speakers
	Each; 50-100		No Bid	\$15.80	Included w/speakers
	Each; 101+		No Bid	\$15.80	Included w/speakers
	CR-02 (A THROUGH C) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11-50	No Bid	\$17.33	\$18.73	\$82.52

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Long's Electronics, Inc.	Smiley's Audio-Visual, Inc.	Xerox Audio Visual Solutions
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls Pl., Bldg C
BID #11.	BID #11-062-AF	Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#				
CR-01	Amplifier: (Paso DMA 2015 or equal)		No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model	Paso / DMA 2015		
	Deliver Date (aro)	7.30 Days		
	Each: 1-10	\$179.99		***************************************
	Each: 11-50	\$179.99		
	Each: 50-100	\$179.99		
	Each: 101+	\$179.99		
CR-02	Classroom Sound Equipment			
Α.	Speakers: (Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal)		No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas / GD87W		
	Deliver Date (aro)	7-30 Days		
	Each: 1-10	\$34.29		
	Each: 11-50	\$34.29		
	Each: 50-100	\$34.29		
	Each: 101+	\$34.29		
<u> </u>	Sneaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: (Atlas Sunnd model 81-8Ror equal)		Pi de CN	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas / 81-8R		
	Deliver Date (aro)	7-30 Days		***************************************
	Each: 1-10	\$8.09		
	Each: 11-50	\$8.09		
	Each: 50-100	\$8.09		
	Each: 101+	\$8.09		
ij	Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: (Atlas Sound model #95-8 or equal)		No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas / 95-8		
	Deliver Date (aro)	7-30 Days		
	Each: 1-10	\$15.86		
	Each: 11-50	\$15.86		
	Each: 50-100	\$15,86		
	Each: 101+	\$15.86		
	CR-02 (A THROUGH C) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11-50	\$19.41	No Bid	No Bid
			Ţ	

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	VSA, Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lumsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID #11-062-AF	-062-AF	Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	**Bc			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION			
CR-01	Amplifier: (Paso DMA 2015 or equal)			No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model	Paso / DMA2015	Paso / DMA2015	
	Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	7-14 Days	
	Each: 1-10	\$162.90	\$132.45	
	Each: 11-50	\$154.52	\$129.20	
	Each: 50-100	\$127.75	\$122.20	
	Each 101+	\$120.42	\$121.28	
CR-02	Classroom Sound Equipment			
A.	Speakers: (Atlas Sound model GD97W or equal)			
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas Sound / GD87W	Atlas / GD87W	Atlas / GD87W
	Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	10-20 Days	10 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$42.16	\$34.90	\$32.22
	Each: 11-50	\$33.03	\$30.50	\$31.10
	Each: 50-100	\$32.52	\$29.50	\$31.10
	Each: 101+	\$35.52	\$28.20	\$31.10
m	Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: (Atlas Sound model 81-8Ror equal)			
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas Sound / 818R	Atlas / 81-8R	Atlas / 81-8R
	Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	10-20 Days	10 Days
	Each; 1-10	\$12.93	\$12.19	\$7.25
	Each: 11-50	\$11.79	88.90	\$7.11
	Each: 50-100	\$11.61	65'1\$	\$7.11
	Each: 101+	\$11.61	\$7.19	\$7.11
<u>.</u>	Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: (Atlas Sound model #95-8 or equal)			
	Manufacturer / Model	Atlas Sound / 958	Atlas / 95-8	Atlas / 95-8
	Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	10-20 Days	10 Days
	Each; 1-10	\$26.89	\$19.90	\$14.74
	Each: 11-50	\$18.90	\$15.50	\$14.06
	Each: 50-100	\$18.61	\$14.70	\$14.06
	Each: 101+	\$18.61	\$14.13	\$14.06
	CK-02 (A THROUGH C) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE I1-50	\$21.24	\$18.30	\$17.42

DAIRO	DATE OF BIJ OPENING: December 13, 2010 (a) 2:30 p.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.	B & H Photo Video Pro-Audio	DES MOUSUNES, INC.
	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11-062-AF	062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION				
CR-03	Multimedia Projector Ceiling Mounting Hardware:				
A.	Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount: (Chief model RPA-U or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / RPA-U	Not Provided	Chief/RPA-U
	(Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days	7-10 days	15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$116,00	\$119,40	\$111.99
	Each: 11-50		\$105.00	\$119,40	894.99
	Each: 50-100		\$110.00	\$119.40	\$94.62
	Each: 101+		\$100.00	\$119.40	\$89.78
	Suspended Ceiling Plate for LCD Universal Mount:				
8	(Chief model CMA 440 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / CMS 440	Not Provided	Chief / CMA-440
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days	7-10 Days	15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$69.45	\$68.50	69.78
	Each: 11-50		861.00	\$68.50	\$64.81
	Each: 50-100		\$65.00	\$68.50	\$62.87
	Each: 101+		\$65.00	\$68.50	\$59.79
	Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount:				
Ü	(Chief model CMA-003 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / CMS003		Chief / CMA003
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Davs		15-30 days
	Each; 1-10		\$6.50		\$7.49
	Each: 11-50		86.00		\$6.79
	Each: 50-100		\$6.50		\$5.96
	Each: 101+		\$6.50		\$5.29
	12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief				
9	model CMA-012 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
-	Manufacturer / Model		Chief/CMS012		Chief / CMA012
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days		15-30 Days
	Each; 1-10		\$20.75		\$19.99
	Each: 11-50		\$17.90		\$18.99
	Each: 50-100		\$18.25		\$17.99
	Each: 101+		\$18.25		\$17.49
	18" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount: (Chief				
æ	model CMA-018 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / CMS018		Chief / CMA018
	Deliver Date (aro)		30 Days		15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$23.40		\$24.99
	Each; 11-50		\$22.40		\$21.99
	Each: 50-100		\$23.40		\$18.99
	Each: 101+		\$23.40		\$18.49
	CR-03 (A LANCOGR E) AYERAGE LOLAE FRICE COING LIBE EACH PRICE 11-50	N. 201	7 6 6	\$0 cc6	***************************************
		DIG ON	07.770	373.73	041.01

DATEC	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.		Intellis Media	Jersey Jim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
BID III	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2273 S. Church St., P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave, TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11.	BID #11-062-AF	Burlington, NC 27215	Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
	**B				
ITEM#					
CR-03	Multimedia Projector Ceiling				
Ą.	Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount: (Chief model RPA-U or equal)				
	Manufacturer / Model	Chief/RPA-U	As Specified	Chief/RPA-U	Chief/RPA-U
	Deliver Date (aro)	3-30 Days	14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$117.86	No Bid	\$141.00	\$147.20
	Each: 11-50	\$116,19	\$150.00	\$141.00	\$143.61
	Each: 30-100	\$114.53	No Bid	\$141.00	\$140.19
	Each; 101+	\$113.96	No Bid	\$141.00	\$136.93
<u> </u>	Suspended Ceiling Plate for LCD Universal Mount: (Chief model CMA 440 or equal)				
	Manufacturer / Model	Chief / CMA440	As Specified	Chief / CMA440	Chief / CMA440
	Deliver Date (aro)	3-30 Days	14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$68.11	No Bid	\$84.00	\$85.06
	Each: 11-50	\$67.14	\$87.00	\$84.00	\$82.99
	Each: 50-100	\$66.18	No Bid	\$84.00	\$81.01
	Each; 101+	\$65.86	No Bid	\$84.00	\$79.13
	Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount:				
ပ	(Chief model CMA-003 or equal)				
	Manufacturer / Model	Chief / CMS003	As Specified	Chief / CMA003	Chief / CMS003
	(Deliver Date (aro)	3-30 Days	14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$6.50	No Bid	\$7.15	\$7.68
	Each: 11-50	\$6.30	\$8.00	\$7.15	\$7.49
	Each: 50-100	\$6.18	No Bid	\$7.15	\$7.31
	Each; 101+	\$6.12	No Bid	\$7.15	\$7.14

Ω	12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief model CMA-012 or equal)				
	Manufacturer / Model	Chief / CMS012	As Specified	Chief / CMA012	Chief / CMS012
	(Deliver Date (aro)	3-30 Days	14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$18.63	No Bid	\$22.65	\$22.93
	Each: 11-50	\$18.37	\$24.00	\$22.65	\$22.37
	Each: 50-100	01.81\$	No Bid	\$22.65	\$21.83
	Each: 101+	\$18.02	No Bid	\$22.65	\$21.33
<u> </u>	18" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount: (Chief model CMA-018 or equal)				
	Manufacturer / Model	Chief / CMS018	As Specified	Chief/CMA018	Chief/CMS018
	Deliver Date (and)	3-30 Davs	14 Days	15 Davs	15 Davs
	Each: 1-10	\$20.93	No Bid	\$25.60	\$26.64
	Each: 11-50	\$20.64	\$27.00	\$25.60	\$25.99
	Each: 50-100	\$20.34	No Bid	\$25.60	\$25.37
	Each: 101+	\$20.24	No Bid	\$25.60	\$24.78
	CR-03 (A THROUGH E) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11-50	8.45.73	\$59.20	\$56.08	\$56.49

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Long's Electronics, Inc.	Smiley's Audio-Visual, Inc.	Xerox Audio Visual Solutions
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls PI., Bidg C
BID #11-062-AF		Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION			
CR-03	Multimedia Projector Ceiling Mounting Hardware:			
			······································	
¥.	Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount: (Chief model RPA-U or equal)	No Bid		
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief/RPA-U	Chief/RPA-U
	Deliver Date (aro)		5-15 Days	Not Provided
	Each: 1-10		\$102.00	No Bid
	Each: 11-50		\$89.75	\$95.65
	Each: 50-100		\$83.80	No Bid
	Each; 101+		\$78.70	No Bid
	Suspended Ceiling Plate for LCD Universal Mount:			
<u>a</u>	(Chief model CMA 440 or equal)	No Bid		
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / CMA 440 / CMS 440	Chief / CMS440
	Deliver Date (aro)		5-15 Days	10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$57.15	\$53.80
	Each: 11-50		850.60	\$53.80
	Each: 50-100		\$46.00	\$53.80
	Each: 101+		\$42.94	\$53.80
	Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount:			
ပ	103 or equal)	No Bid		
	Manufacturer / Model		Chief / CMA 003 / CMS 003	Chief / CMS 003
	Deliver Date (aro)		5-15 Days	10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10		\$5.25	\$5.00
	Each: 11-50		\$4.70	\$5.00
	Each; 50-100		\$4.25	\$5.00
	Each: 101+		\$4.00	\$5,00

	12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief			
1	model Civia-Via Via Via Via Via Via Via Via Via Via	DIG ON	200 20 20 2 20 2 20 20 10 1EO	3 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2
	Manufacturer / Modes		Cniet / CMA U12 / CMS U12	Chiet / CMS 012
	Deliver Date (aro)		S-IS Days	10-13 Days
	Each 1-10		\$16.80	\$15.76
		***************************************	\$[4,83	\$15.76
	Each: 50-100		\$12.75	\$15.76
	Each: 101+		\$11.75	\$15.76
Ĺ	18" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief	No Did		
4	Monthsoftrar / Model	DEC DE	Chief (CM A 0.19 / CM 4 C0.19	Chicf/CM(S019
	Transacture () would		CHECK CAPACION CHASSIS	Cuert Calloure
	LOCITACI (ALO)		J-1.3 L/dys	10-13 Days
	Each: [*IU		\$18.90	\$17.39
	Each: 11-50		\$16.36	\$17.39
	Each: 50-100		\$14.30	\$17.39
	Each: 101+		\$12.78	\$17.39
	CR-03 (A THRUUGH E) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11.50	1700 TW	ur urc	64 E66
	I MCD II-30	No Bid	935.25	357.52

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies BID #11-062-AF	1971 W. Lumsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	*** Y F ****** Y Y Y Y
3ID #11-062-AF	7 1 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	6929 Seward Ave
	Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
Board Meeting 2/1/11			-
ITEM# DESCRIPTION			
CR-03 Multimedia Projector Ceiling Mounting Hardware:			
Iniversal ICD Projector Celling Mount: (Chief model RPA-1) or equal)			
A, Chiresan Low A topicion Criming from the fact and the fact of t	Silver Control of the	Daarlace / DPC-11	Chinf / P.D. 11
Manufacturer / Mode	regies/ radoiny	TO 15 Deep	10 Day
Deliver Date (arg)	14-30 Days	Syba Cirol	AV Days
Each: 1-10	286.50	\$109,00	\$125.09
Each: 11-50	\$86.50	\$104.00	\$122.39
Each: 50-100	05:98\$	\$97.30	\$122.39
Each; 101+	05'98\$	\$96.12	\$122.39
Suspended Ceiling Plate for LCD Universal Mount:			
	Peerless / CM1500R1	Peerless / CMJ-455	Chief / CMA440
Deliner Date (and)	20 Page 14.30 Page	10-15 Days	10 Davs
Double Land (and)	CLP55	\$55.50	\$71.06
Vach, 11.50	E1 E25	\$52.70	\$70.70
Back: 50,100	\$57.85	\$51.20	\$70.70
Havh: 1014	\$52.58	\$50.37	\$70.70
Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount:			
C (Chief model CMA-003 or equal)			
Manufacturer / Model	Peerless / EXT002	Peerless / EXT006	Chief / CMS 003
Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	10-15 Days	10 Days
Each; 1-10	\$2.77	\$24,25	\$6,25
Each: 11-50	\$2.68	\$23.50	\$6.22
Each: 50-100	\$2.66	\$22.25	\$6.22
Each: 101+	\$2.66	\$21,25	\$6.22
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief model CMA-012 or senal)			
	Peerless / EXT101	Peerless / EXT101	Chief / CMS 012
Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	Not Provided	10 Days
Each: 1-10	\$14.13	\$21.80	\$19.13
Each: 11-50	893818	\$18.50	\$19.06
Each: 50-100	\$13.54	\$18.00	\$19.06
Each: 101+	\$13.54	\$17.31	\$19.06
18" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector Ceiling Mount : (Chief model CMA-018 or equal)			
Manufacturer / Model	Pearless / EXT018	Peerless / EXT018	Chief / CMS018
Deliver Date (aro)	14-30 Days	Not Provided	10 Days
Each: 1-10	\$15.22	\$22.56	\$21.73
Each: 11-50	S14.74	\$20.50	\$21.59
Each: 50-100	\$14.58	\$19.50	\$21.59
	\$14.58	\$18.56	\$21.59
CR-03 (A THROUGH E) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE 11-50	24.15	243 84	647 99

DATE	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems Inc	Andio Visual Innovations Inc	B & H Photo Video Pro. Andio	BFS Industries Inc
BID TI	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11	BID #11-062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	**B				
ITEM#					
CR-04	Surface Mount Boxes, Faceplates, Connector Modules:				
Ą.	Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300185 or equal)	No Bid	big oN	7.60	
	Manufacturer / Model				
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 30-100				
	Each; 101+				
ggi	Double Gane Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300186 or eemal)	3.00	tig or N	2000	Eg CN
	Manufacturer / Model	*****		777 (1)	277 AV
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: [0]+				
ن	Extension Plate for Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300010 or equal)	P. B. C.N.	THE CAN	ä	No Ber
	Manuacturer / Model	MA ON	AND LOKE	THE THE PERSON NAMED IN COLUMN TWO IS NOT THE PERSON NAMED IN COLUMN TWO IS NAMED IN COLUMN	MAC ON
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
ď	Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300011 or equal)	2	3000	TO A	30
	Manufacturer / Model		110 O.1	217 017	TO FIG
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				***************************************
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
Ĺ	Facepiate for Double Gailg Cutter Box:	L;U -).K	E.M IN	7 6 	F. C
	Manufacturer / Model	MG ON	DIG ON	pig ovi	DIG ON
	(Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
Œ.	Three RCA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900316 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model				
	Deliver Date (aro)				*************************************
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+			The state of the s	

12. TE OF BIN OBENING. B 13 1010 @ 1.20	Comer Inc	Intellis Media	Iersev Iim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
DATE OF BID OF ENANCY. Determined 125, 2010 (tg. 4.33) p.m [RID TITLE: Classroom Refrofit Sumplies	2273 S. Church St., P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave, TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11-062-4 F		Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM# DESCRIPTION				
CR-04 Surface Mount Boxes, Faceplates, Connector Modules:				
	ria V		No Bid	
A. Sugar Cong Juliane Mount Court Const (Citi Citics Cit. 1900/202 of Equal)	TO OUT	As Specified		Panduit / 70228
(Manufacture: / intouch		Id Dave		Syst State
Deliver Date (aro)		No Bid		\$5.31
Edul: 3.10		00'98		\$5,18
Hack (1.10)		No Bid		\$5.06
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$4.94
			3 . 5.4 . 3.5	
B. Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300186 or equal)	No Sid		DIG ON	COOCE
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Liberty / /0090
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		L2 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$26.66
Each: 11-50		\$7.00		\$26.01
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$25.39
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$24.80
	7.0		Più CIN	
C. (Ortronics UK-40300019 or equal)	No Bia		DIG ON	CONTRACTOR AND
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		OTHORIO CONTROL O
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15.048
Each; 1-10		No Bid		00.000 miles
Each: 11-50		35.00		65.25
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$5,25
Each: 101+		No Bid		93.1 .7
Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300011 or possess)	No Bid		No Bid	
		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-40300011
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Hach: 1-10		No Bid		\$8.31
Each: 11-50		\$7.00		\$8.11
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$7.92
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$7.73
Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box:	N. Did		No Bid	
E. Manufacturer / Model	200	As Specified		Ortronic/OR-40300175
Deliver Date (arc)		14 days	**************************************	15 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$11.59
Each: 11-50		\$10.00		\$11.30
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$11.04
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$10.78
F. Three RCA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900316 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-60900316
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each 1-10		No Bid		\$30.13
Each: 11-50		\$42.00		\$29.39
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$28.69
Each: 101+		No Bid		70.87%

BID TITLE: Cla BID #11-062-AF ITEM# CR-04 Surfac A. Single	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South Irondale, AI, 35210	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls PI., Bidg C
*		Irondale AJ 35210	I alcaland El 22907	
#		ALUXIONE ALCENTANTON AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AN	Lakeiaiu, FL 33607	Tampa, FL 33619
#	**Board Meeting 2/1/11**			
	DESCRIPTION			
	Surface Mount Boxes, Faceplates, Connector Modules:			
N.	Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300185 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
1	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
The state of the s	Each: 101+			
a	Double Cong Surface Mount Outlet Boy (Ortronice OP 40300196 or some)	No Did	Fig vIV	NI Dis
	Manufacturer / Model	DIG ON	nig oxi	DIG ON
Ω	Deliver Date (aro)			
m	Each: 1-10			
3	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
n jé	Each 101+ Detended Plate for State Cont.			
ے نے	Extension flate for Single Gang Sufface Mount United Box: (Offennics OR-4030010 of sense)	žá	Z	rid on
	Manufacturer / Model	THE THE	AV DIL	IVO DAG
Ω	Deliver Date (aro)			
E E	Each: 1-10			
3	Each: 11-50			
田	Each: 50-100			
山	Each: 101+			
	Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300011 or emis)	Fig CN	N.c. Did	F 00 - 3 V
	Mamifacturer / Model	DIG ON	DIG ON	DIG ON
10	Deliver Date (aro)			
TE TE	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
五	Each: 50-100			
Ĭ	Each: 101+			
	Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box:			
(E	(Orfronics Series II Dual gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NA S	Wanuracurer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
ŭ F	10. 1 ± 10			***************************************
31	Each: 11-59	***************************************		
άĬ	Each: 50-100		***************************************	
띠	sch; (0]+	***************************************		
F. T	Three RCA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900316 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
M				
Ā	Deliver Date (aro)		***************************************	
ŭ	Each: 1-10			***************************************
A.	Each: 11-50			
Ĕ	Each: 50-100			
亞	Each: 101+			

DATEO	DATE OF RID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	VSA, Inc.
BID TITI	JE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lunsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID#11-(BID #11-062-AF	Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION			
	Surface Mount Boxes, Faceplates, Connector Modules:			
_ <	Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300185 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each; 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each; 101+			
	Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: (Ortronics OR-40300186 or equal)	No Bio	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Extension Plate for Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box:			
ن	(Ortronics OR-40300010 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each; 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300011 or	ig cy	S S S	No Bid
	Orleans	200 000	207 017	
	Define Date (ma)			
	Denver Date (arc)			
	Each: 1:10 Fach: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box:			
Z.	(Ortronics Series II Dual gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			***************************************
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	15261: 30-103			
	Each: 101+			
Œ	Three RCA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900316 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Live in the supplier of the su			

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems Inc	Andio Visual Innovations Inc	B & H Photo Video Pro-Audio	RRS Industries Inc
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11-062-AF	-062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	¥*B(
ITEM#	-				
	Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:				
5	(Urtroncs Series II OK-60900212 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manuacturer / Modes				
	Deliver Date (aro) Each: 1.10		***************************************		
	Each: 11-50				
	Each; 50-100				
	Bach 101+				
	Two RCA Connector Module Female/Solder:				
H	(Ortronics Series II OR-60900315 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model				
	Deliver Date (aro)	***************************************	***************************************		
	Exch. 11-60				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each; 101+				
I.	15-Pin VGA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900270 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model				
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
-	C - 47 - C - C - C - C - C - C - C - C - C -			: 1	
•	Manufacturar / Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
ĸ	S-Video Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900074 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model				
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	E-1. 50 100				
	Each: 30-100				
	Blank Modules: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300191 or gone)	P.B.VN	No Bid	No Bid	FF DIA
	Manufacturer / Model		WC OI	MA ON	nid Ori
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+ CR Jd /A THROLIGH I) AVERACE TOTAL BBICE ISING THE FACH				
	PRICE II-50	No Bid		T. C.	7 S
	The state of the s	1		1	A CO

	2272 & Church & D O Boy 1800	4245 East Daniba Arra 77110 100	17777 ITS HILLY 10N	1065 Decompose Circles
FILE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	LACTOR CHIEFELDIC, L.C. DON 1077	4202 East rowlet Ave, LOD 100	11/66 00 1111 1/11	104.) FIGBRESS CHOIC
BID #11-062-AF	Burlington, NC 27215	Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
8		*************************************		
ITEM# DESCRIPTION				
Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:			;	
(Ortronics Series II OR-60900212 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-60900212
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$38,69
Each: 11-50		\$33.00		\$37.74
Each; 50-100		No Bid		\$36.85
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$35.99
Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Solder:				
(Ortronics Series II OR-60900315 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-60900315
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$7.10
Each: 11-50		\$27.00		\$6.93
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$6.76
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$6.60
15-Pin VGA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900270 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-60900270
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$33.01
Each: 11-50		\$45.00		\$3.21
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$31.44
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$30.71
			3	
One "F" Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OK-60900017 or equal)	No Bid	* 2. · · · ·	DIG ON	\$10000X-0C)
Manutacturer / Model		As Specified		Oluoline / Oxfordout
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		13.Days
RACH L-10		nic ovi		THE CONTRACT OF THE PARTY OF TH
Each; 11-50		87.00		89.74
Each; 50-100		DIG ON		05.00
Each: IVI+		DIG ON		67.73
S-Video Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900074 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-60900074
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each: 1-10		No Bid		\$50.11
Each: 11-50		\$43.00		\$48.89
Each; 50-100		No Bid		\$47.73
Each: 101+		No Bid		\$46.62
Blank Modules: (Ortronics Series II OR-40300191 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid	
Manufacturer / Model		As Specified		Ortronic / OR-40300191
Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days		15 Days
Each; 1-10		No Bid		\$5.5%
Each: 11-50		\$6.00		\$5.45
Each: 50-100		No Bid		\$5.32
Each: 101+		No Bid		07'C\$
PRICE 11-50	30 (2	29618	7.00 N	07.813

In arra	DATE OF BID OPENING, December 13, 2016 @ 3:30	Towns Classical Sec	Considerate Aurelia Minural Yan	Variation Andia Winnel Collection
RIDITION	R. Classroom Retroft Sunnites	2630 5th Avenue South	P O Box 6925	A542 Eagles Falls DI Bilder
BID #11-	BID #11-062-AF	Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION			
	Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:			
ن	(Ortronics Series II OR-60900212 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each; 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100		-	
	Each; 101+			
	Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Solder:			
Ë	(Ortronics Series II OR-60900315 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)	***************************************		
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each; 50-100			
	Each; 101+			
	15. Din VCA Connector Module (Ortexanics Savies II OD 6000079 as sound)	rig VIV	730 ~ 10	, co. 7.v.
	Manifacturer / Model	NG OV	Did Oil	nid on
	Deliver Date (ero)			
	Each: 1.10	***************************************		
	Each: 11.50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
'n	One "F" Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900017 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each; 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
ï.	S-Video Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900074 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each; 50-100			
Į.				
ij	Blank Modules: (Ortronics Series 11 OK-40300191 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	EACH, 101+ CRAIM (A THROTIGHT) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE IISING THE RACH			
	PRICE 11-50	ž	N. S.	

DATEO	DATE OF RID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	VSA, Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lumsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID #11-062-AF	962-AF	Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	**B			
ITEM#				***************************************
	Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:		ì	
ای	(Ortronics Series II OR-60900212 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Two RCA Connector Module - Female/Solder:	1	i	;
H	(Ortronics Series II OR-60900315 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each; 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	15-Pin VGA Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900270 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
ĭ.	One "F" Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900017 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
			1	:
;날	S-Video Connector Module: (Ortronics Series II OR-60900074 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: JU-1UU Each: 101_			
-	The Ortronice Series II OD 40300101	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
•	Manufacturer (Mode)			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Fach: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	CR-04 (A THROUGH I) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH	**	i i	TO TA
		No Bid	No Bid	ive big

DATE (DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.	B & H Photo Video Pro-Audio	BES Industries. Inc.
BID TT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11	BID #11-062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	18**				
ITEM#	# DESCRIPTION				
20	N. MALES V. P. L. P. C.				
CR-63	Non incialic Latching Kaceway & Cening Cap				
Α.	Non metallic Latching Raceway: (Panduit LD 10WH6-A or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	S. B.c.
	Manufacturer / Model			117 717	11. 11. 11. 11. 11. 11. 11. 11. 11. 11.
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each: 101+				
<u>od</u>	Non metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non metallic Raceway: (Panduit ceiling entry can #1125 or equal)	N. B.S.	No Bid	P: B VN	NA BH
i	Manufacturer / Model	TYT OLY	110 Dis	ng Ari	mg OM
	Deliver Date (aro)				
	Each: 1-10				
	Each: 11-50				
	Each: 50-100				
	Each; 101+				
-	CK-05 (A and B) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE IT-	,			
	Audio Cable - 1 Smm Steres Male to Dual RCA Male - 14:-	DIS ON	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CR-06	(MCM #24-6280 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / 2100AM15FF
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$3,99
	Each: 11-50				\$2.99
	Each: 50-100				\$2.89
	Each: 101+				\$2.79
CR-07	Audio Cable - 2KCA Male to 2KCA Male - 3": [MCM-24-2500 ar equal]	3.0	N. D. D.	7.4	
	Manifacturer / Model	NG ON	MG ON	DIG ON	Titothandict
	Deliver Date (ato)				15-30 Dave
	Each; 1-10				\$2.99
	Each: 11-50				8.199
	Each: 50-100				\$1.95
	Each: 101+				\$1.90
CR-08	Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3': (MCM -24-2485 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / 2100AM15FT
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$3.99
	Each: 11-50				\$2,99
	Each: 50-100				\$2.95
	Each: 101+				\$2.89

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Cameor Inc.	Intellis Media	Jersev Jim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
RID TIT	I.S. Classraam Retrafit Sunnlies	2273 S. Church St. P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave. TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11-	BID #11-062-AF		Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM#					
CR-05	Non Metallic Latching Raceway & Ceiling Cap				
	More and the I state of the December Of the Aut I D 10MILE A or the Indian	Lio Tr	rigorik.	No Bid	
Ą.	NOD INCIALIC LACCING NACEWAY: (FABRUIL LD TOWNO-A OF Equal)	NO ISIG	BIGONY	DICT ON	11.11
	Manutacturer / Model				Telleminian / 70233
	Deliver Date (aro)				D.Days
	Each: 1-10				\$0.88
	Each: 11-50				\$0.85
	Each: 50-100				\$0.83
	Each; 101+				\$0.81
۵	Non metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non metallic Raceway: (Panduit ceiling	Pia V	ria c	No Rid	
á	Manifacturer / Model	PICT ON	200		Hellerman / 70292
	Deliver Date (aro)				15 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$1.15
	Each: 11-50				\$1.12
	Each: 50-100				\$1.10
	Each 101+				\$1:07
	CR-05 (A and B) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE II-				
	20	Ne Bid	No Bid	No Bid	S0.99
CR-96	Audio Cable 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male 15: [MCM #24-6280 or equal]	No Bid	·····		
-	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-6280	Cables To Go / 40236
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each; 1-10		No Bid	\$3.40	\$6.13
	Each: 11-50		\$12.00	\$3.40	\$5.98
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$3.40	\$5.83
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$3.40	\$5.70
CR-07	Audio Cable 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male 3': (MCM-24-2500 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-2500	Cables To Go / 40463
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$1.40	\$1.19
	Each: 11-50		\$41.00	\$1.40	\$1.16
	Each; 50-100		No Bid	\$1.40	\$1.13
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$1.40	\$1.10
CR-08	Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3': (MCM -24-2485 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-2485	Cables To Go / 40447
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$1.80	\$2.20
	Each: 11-50		875.00	\$1.80	\$2.15
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$1.80	\$2.10
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$1.80	\$2.05

BID TIT			the family of the family	
	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls Pl., Bldg C
BID #11.	BID #11-062-AF	Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#			3	
CR-05	Non Metallic Latching Raceway & Ceiling Cap			
	The state of the s			
¥.	Non metallic Latching Raceway: (Panduit L.D 10WH6-A or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	(Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			AND SECURE AND
	Each: 101+		•	
	Non metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non metallic Raceway: (Panduit ceiling			
œ.	entry cap #1125 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each; 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
		***************************************	***************************************	***************************************
	CR-05 (A and B) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE III			
	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male - 157:		**************************************	
CR-06	(MCM #24-6280 or equal)		No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model	MCM / 246280		Cables To Go / 40615
	(Deliver Date (aro)	7-30 Days		10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10	\$11.99		\$5.65
	Each: 11-50	811.99		\$5.65
	Each: 50-100	\$11.99		\$5.65
	Each; 101+	\$11.99		\$5.65
	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male 37;			
CR-07	(MCM-24-2500 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 40463
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$1.02
	Each; 11-50			\$1.02
	Each: 50-100			\$1.02
	Each: 101+			\$1.02
CR-08	Audio Cable 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male 3': (MCM -24-2485 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 40447
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Davs
	Each: 1-10			\$1.85
	Each: 11-50		***************************************	58.18
	Each: 50-103			\$1.85
	Each: 101+			\$1.83
	TOOLOGY A C. T.	**************************************		MANAGAMAMAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAA

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 n.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	VSA, Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lumsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID #11-062-AF		Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#				
3				
CK-63	Non Metallic Latching Kaceway & Celling Cap			
₹	Non metallic Latching Raceway: (Panduit LD 10WH6-A or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
L	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	Non metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non metallic Raceway: (Panduit ceiling	7. O V.V.	No Bid	No Bid
ė .	entry cap #1125 of equal) Manufachtrar / Model	mg on	TAN DAY	TYPE COLUMN
	Deliver Date (arc)			
	Fach 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
	Each: 101+			
	CR-05 (A and B) AVERAGE TOTAL PRICE USING THE EACH PRICE III			
	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male - 15':			:
CR-06	(MCM #24-6280 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / MPS-2PP-25ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$5.99	
	Each: 11-50		\$4.49	
	Each: 50-100		\$3.79	
	Each; 101+		\$3.49	
6	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Mate - 5:	S S S S		No Bid
CWA	Manufacturer (Model	ALC LANGE	Valiant / 2PP-3ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$3.49	
	Each: 11-50		\$2.06	
	Each: 50-100		\$1.76	
	Each; 101+		\$1.46	
CR-08	Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3': (MCM -24-2485 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / 3RCA-3RCA-3ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$3.49	
	Each: 11-50		\$2.49	
	Each: 50-100		\$1.96	
	Each: 101+		\$1.76	

DATEC	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.	B & H Photo Video Pro-Audio	BES Industries, Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11	BID #11-062-AF	Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tampa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM#					
CR-69	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 25': (MCM #24-1470 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / 2100AV25FT
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each; 1-10				\$15.99
	Each: 11-50				\$14.82
	Each: 50-100		THERMINE TO THE		\$14.75
	Each: 101+				\$14.49
GB-10	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 50: (MCM #24-1475 or equal)	No Bid	No Rid	r.a ox	
	Manufacturer / Model		The same of the sa		Liberty / E-2RCAM-M-50
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each; 1-10				\$29.49
	Each: 11-50				\$26.99
	Each: 50-100				\$26.49
	Each: 101+				\$26.25
CR-11	Audio Cable – 2 RCA Male to bare wire – 3'; (MCM 28-580 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / 2100A3FT
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$2.99
	Each: 11-50				\$1.99
	Each; 50-100				\$1.95
1	Each: 101+				\$1.90
CK-12	Video Cable - "F" to "F"; (MCM #33-544 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / E-brr-3
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	E2CH: 1-10				\$2.79
	Fach: \$6-100				\$1.84
	Each: 101+				\$1.79
CR-13	Video Cable - "F" to "F": (MCM #33-548 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / E-6FF-6
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$4.89
	Each: 11-50				\$4.19
	Each: 50-100				\$4.12
	Each: 101+				\$4.09
CR-14	Video Cable RCA to RCA 25': (MCM #32-4555 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				, Liberty / 20SD-RCAM-M-25
	Deiiver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$18.79
	Each: 11-50				\$15.89
	Each; 50-100				\$15.75
	Each: 101+				\$15.49

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 (@ 2:30 n.m.	Cameor, Inc.	Intellis Media	Jersey Jim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2273 S. Church St., P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave, TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11-062-AF		Burlington, NC 27215	Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION				
CR-09	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 25": (MCM #24-1470 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-1470	Cables To Go / 40466
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$4.88	\$3.86
	Each: 11-50		89.00	\$4.88	\$3.77
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$4.88	\$3.68
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$4.88	\$3.59
CR-10	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 50°; (MCM #24-1475 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-1475	Cables To Go / 40467
	(Deiver Date (aro)		14 Day	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$7.93	\$7.04
	Fach: 11-50		\$15.00	\$7.93	\$6.87
	Each; 50-100	***************************************	No Bid	\$7.93	\$6.70
	Each; 101+		No Bid	\$7.93	\$6.55
CR-11	Audio Cable - 2 RCA Male to bare wire - 3: (MCM 28-580 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 28-580	MCM / 25-580
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$1.50	\$1.86
	Each: 11-50		\$2.00	\$1.50	\$1.82
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$1.50	\$1.77
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$1.50	\$1.73
CR-12	Video Cable "F" to "F": (MCM #33-544 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 33-544	Cables To Go / 29131
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$1.35	\$3.95
	Each: 11-50		\$2.00	81.35	35.83
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$1.35	\$3.70
CD-13	Vidao Cabla 487 to 487 to 487 (MCM #32.548 or annel)	No Bid	27.		
2	Manufacturer / Model	***************************************	As Specified	MCM / 33-548	Cables To Go / 29132
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each; 1-10		No Bid	\$1.90	\$5.71
	Each: 11-50		\$2.00	\$1.90	\$5.57
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$1.90	\$5.44
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$1.90	\$5.31
CR-14	Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 25: (MCM #32-4555 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 32-4555	Cables To Go / 40455
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$3.40	\$5.74
	Each: 11-50		\$5.00	\$3.40	\$5.60
	Each; 50-100		No Bid	\$3.40	\$5.46
	Bach: 101+		No Bid	\$3:4U	\$5.34

DATE 0	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Long's Electronics, Inc.	Smiley's Audio-Visual, Inc.	Xerox Audio Visual Solutions
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls Pf., Bldg C
BID #11-062-AF		Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	**B(
ITEM#	***************************************			
CR-69	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 25: (MCM #24-1470 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model		**************************************	Cables To Go / 40466
	Deliver Date (aro)			10.15 Date
	Each: 1-10			\$3.71
	Each; 11-50		***************************************	C3.71
	Each: 50-100			\$3.21
	Each: 101+			\$3.21
CR-10	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male 50": (MCM #24-1475 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model		***************************************	Cables To Go JAOAK?
	Deliver Date (aro)		***************************************	10,15 Days
	Each; 1-10			\$5.71
	Each: 11-50			12.58
	Each; 50-100			\$5.71
	Each: 101+		***************************************	\$5.71
	Audio Cable - 2 RCA Male to bare wire - 3':			
CR-11	(MCM 28-580 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	******
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 27029
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$1.91
	Each: 11-50			1678
	Each: 50-100			\$1.91
4	Each; 101+			\$1.91
CK-12	Video Cable - "f" to "f": (MCM #33-544 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 27030
	Deliver Date (aro)		-	10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$2.55
	Each: 11-50			\$2.55
	Each: 50-100	-		\$2.55
	Each: 101+			\$2.55
CR-13	Video Cable "F" to "F": (MCM #33-548 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 27030
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$2.55
	Each: 11-50			\$2.55
	Each: 50-100			\$2,55
	Each: 101+			No Bid
CR-14	Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 25: (MCM #32-4555 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 40455
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$3.70
	Each: 11-50		***************************************	\$3.70
	Each: 50-100		19 Puly (4) 19 11.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1.1	\$3.70
	Each: (Ul+		ATTACAMA ANAMANA ANAMA	\$3.70

DATEOF	F BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	VSA, IIIC.
BID TITL	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lumsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID #11-062-AF	162-AF	Brandon, FL 33511	So, Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION			
CR-09	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 25': (MCM #241470 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
Т	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / 2PP-2PP-25ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$6.00	
	Each: 11-50		\$5.19	
	Each: 50-100		\$4.16	
	Each: 101+		\$3.56	
CR-10	Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male 50': (MCM #24-1475 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
Т	Manifacturer / Model		Valiant / 2Pp. 2Pp. 50ST	
	Deiver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Fact: 1-10		\$8.49	
	Each: 11-50		\$7.49	
	Each: 50-100		\$6.49	-
	Each: 101+		\$5.99	
	Audio Cable - 2 RCA Male to bare wire - 3':			;
CR-11	(MCM 28-580 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each; 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			
**	Lach: 101+	M. 1973		FFG PK
T	Video Cable - "r" to "r"; (MCM #35-544 or equal)	מום סאו	1000	DIG ON
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / X-FF-C-3S1	
	(Deliver Date (aro)		IV-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$3.90	
	Each: 11-50		\$2.70	
	Each: 50-100		\$1.70	
┪	ESCH. TUIT	No Bis	N7.14	NA Bid
CK-13	VIOCO CADIC T (U T : (INC.INT #55-540 UT equal)	DIG ON	Volimet / V TT / Agr	200
	Manuacurer / Model		10 15 Dece	
	Denver Date (arc)		10-13 Days	
	Roch. (1.5)		83.00	
	Fach: 50-100		\$2.00	
	Each: 101+		\$1.40	
CR-14	Video Cable RCA to RCA - 25"; (MCM #32-4555 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
T			Valiant / RCA-RCA-V-25ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$4.40	
	Each: 11-50		\$3.50	
	Each: 50-100		\$2.30	
	Each; 101+		\$1.90	

DATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Aves Audio Visual Systems. Inc.	Audio Visual Innovations. Inc.	B & H Photo Video Pro-Andio	BES Industries Inc.
BID TIT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	P.O. Box 500	6301 Benjamin Rd Suite 101	420 Ninth Ave	11512 Lake Mead Ave #406
BID #11-062-AF		Sugar Land, TX 77487	Tanpa, FL 33634	New York, NY 10001	Jacksonville, FL 32256
TEM#	VICTOR DELICITION DESCRIPTION	21 - 75 3	27. D.4	7. T. T.	
CI-NO	Viete Cable - R.A. (0 R.A - 30 : (INCIN #32-4360 or equal)	DIS ON	DIG ON	No Bid	CO S TO S COOK COOK S TO S
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty /20SD-RCAM-M-50
	Porty Late (alo)				15-50 Days
	Each: 11-50				\$22.99
	Each: 50-100				\$22.49
	Each: 101+				\$22.25
CR-16	S-Video Cable50'; MCM #24-7335; [MCM # 24-7335 or equal)	r:a vN	ria six	r:q vy	
CTATA	Manifecturer / Model	mrg OAT	DIG ON	DIG ON	Tiberty / E SVM M 50
	Deliver Date (aro)				15.30 Dave
	Each: 1-10				\$35.49
	Each: 11-50				\$31.49
	Each; 50-100				\$30.89
	Each: 101+ VCA Calle 15 min DB16 Majo to Majo 15.				\$29,99
CR-17	(Calrad 55-612-15 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / E-VGAM-M-15
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each; 1-10				\$25.99
	Each: 11-50				\$23.49
	Each; 50-100				\$23.25
	Each: 101+				\$22.99
CR-18	(Calrad 55-612-25 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / E-VGAM-M-25
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$35.99
	Each: 11-50				\$32.75
	Each: 50-100				\$32.49
	VCA C-kk 1# -: ND: F M-1: MA: 2 27.				\$32.25
CR-19	Von Came, 15 pm, DDAS mare 10 mare - 55 ; (Calrad 55-612-35 or equal)	No Bid	No Big.	Piacy	
	Manufacturer / Model				Liberty / E-VGAM-M-35
	Deliver Date (aro)		***************************************		15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$44.99
	Each: 11-50				\$41.99
	Each: 50-100				\$41,49
	Each: 101+				\$41.25
CR-20	Speaker Cable: (Belden BEL-5100UE or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model		***************************************		West Penn / 226
	Deliver Date (aro)				15-30 Days
	Each: 1-10				\$239.00
	Each: 11-50			***************************************	\$222.00
	Each. 1014				\$220.00
					00,0226

DATE	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Camcor, inc.	Intellis Media	Jersey Jim Towers TV	Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
BID TT	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2273 S. Church St., P.O. Box 1899	4202 East Fowler Ave, TUB 100	17722 US HWY 19N	1045 Progress Circle
BID #11	BID #11-062-AF	Burlington, NC 27215	Tampa, FL 33620	Clearwater, FL 33764	Lawrenceville, GA 30043
	Board Meeting 2/1/11				
ITEM					
CR-15	Video Cable - RCA to RCA -	No Bid			
	_		As Specified	MCM / 32-4560	Cables To Go / 40456
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Fach: 1-10		No Bid	\$6.35	\$8.69
	Each: 11.50		89.00	\$6.35	\$8.48
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$6.35	\$8.27
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$6.35	\$8.08
	S-Video Cable -507: MCM #24-7335:				
CR-16	(MCM # 24-7335 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	MCM / 24-7335	Cables To Go / 27967
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$12.90	\$23.18
	Each: 11-50		\$20.00	\$12.90	\$22.61
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$12.90	\$22.07
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$12.90	\$21,56
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male 15':				
CR-17	(Calrad 55-612-15 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Calrad / 55-612-15	Cables To Go / 09618
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Davs	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$9.90	\$4.69
	Each: 11-50		\$14.00	\$9.90	84.57
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	06.68	\$4.46
	Each: 101+		No Bid	06.68	\$4.36
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 25':				
CR-18	(Calrad 55-612-25 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Calrad / 55-612-25	Cables To Go / 09461
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Davs	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$14.90	\$21.43
	Each: 11-50		\$23.00	\$14.90	\$20.90
	Each: 50-100	**************************************	No Bid	\$14.90	\$20.40
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$14.90	\$19.93
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 35':				
CR-19	(Calrad 55-612-35 or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Calrad / 55-612-35	Cables To Go / 28015
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each: 1-10		No Bid	\$19.90	\$32.20
	Each: 11-50		830.00	819.90	\$31.41
	Each: 50-100		No Bid	\$19.90	\$30.67
	Each: 101+		No Bíd	\$19.90	\$29.95
CR-20	Speaker Cable: (Belden BEL-5100UE or equal)	No Bid			
	Manufacturer / Model		As Specified	Belden / BEL-5100UE	Anixter / AL-1602C-2-2N-01
	Deliver Date (aro)		14 Days	15 Days	15 Days
	Each; 1-10		No Bid	\$224.00	\$200.00
	Each: 11-50		\$267.00	\$224.00	\$195.12
	Each: 50-100		No Bíd	\$224.00	\$190.48
	Each: 101+		No Bid	\$224.00	\$186.05

DATEC	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 @ 2:30 p.m.	Long's Electronics, Inc.	Smiley's Audio-Visual, Inc.	Xerox Audio Visual Solutions
BID TH	BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	2630 5th Avenue South	P. O. Box 6925	4542 Eagles Falls PI., Bidg C
BID #11-062-AF		Irondale, AL 35210	Lakeland, FL 33807	Tampa, FL 33619
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#		***************************************		
CR-15	Video Cable RCA to RCA 50: (MCM #32-4560 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 40456
	Deliver Date (aro)			10.215.Dave
	Each: 1-10			84.38
	Each: 11-50			65.48
	Each: 50-100			64.38
	Each: 101+			\$4.38
	S-Video Cable50'; MCM #24-7335:			
CR-16	(MCM # 24-7335 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 40138
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each; I-10			\$23.91
	Each: 11-50			\$23.91
	Each: 50-100			\$23.91
	Each: 101+			\$23.91
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15':			
CR-17	(Cairad 55-612-15 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 28013
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Davs
	Each; 1-10			\$10.87
	Each: 11-50			\$10.87
	Each: 50-100			\$10.87
	Each: 101+			\$10.87
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 25':			
8 8 8	(Cairad 55-612-25 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	-Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 28014
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10		**************************************	\$15.33
	Each: 11-50		TT	\$15,33
	Each: 50-100			\$15.33
	Each: 101+			\$15.33
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male 357:			
CR-19	(Cairad 55-612-35 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 28015
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$22.82
	Each: 11-50			\$22.82
	Each: 50-100			\$22.82
	Each: 101+			\$22.82
CR-20	Speaker Cable: (Belden BEL-5100UE or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	
	Manufacturer / Model			Cables To Go / 43090
	Deliver Date (aro)			10-15 Days
	Each: 1-10			\$269.57
	Each: 11-50			\$269.57
	Each: 50-100			\$269.57
	Each: 101+			\$269.57

ATEO	DATE OF BID OPENING: December 13, 2010 (2) 2:30 p.m.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	Valiant IMC	V 3.PL, 1II.C.
TIL OIL	BD TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies	1971 W. Lunsden Rd., PMB 148	55 Ruta Court	6929 Seward Ave
BID #11-062-AF	962.AF	Brandon, FL 33511	So. Hackensack, NJ 07606	Lincoln, NE 68507
	Board Meeting 2/1/11			
ITEM#			ì	
CR-15	Video Cable RCA to RCA	No Bid		No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / RCA-RCA-V-505	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$8.40	
	Each: 11-50		\$7.40	
	Each: 50-100		\$6.40	
	Each: 101+		\$5.90	
	S-Video Cable -50': MCM #24-7335:		-	
CR-16	(MCM # 24-7335 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / RCA-RCA-V-50ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	***************************************
	Each: 1-10		\$8.40	
	Each: 11-50		S7.40	
	Each: 50-100		\$6.40	
	Each: 101+		\$5.90	
Ş	VGA Cable, 15 pm, UBI5 Male to Male - 15?	1,0 -1x		No Bid
ريد ريد	(Call at 22-014-12 01 equal)	NG OV.	THE MARK STATE CO. TO SEE	PG 01
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / HD-15F-F-15-S1	
	Deliver Date (aro)		sken ci-ni	
	Each; 1-10		38,90	
	Each: 11-50		37.43	
	Each; 50-100		\$6.93	***************************************
	Each; 101+		\$6.43	
9	VGA Cable, 15 pm, DB15 Male to Male ~ 25:	300		No Rid
CK-10	(Cati at 37012/2) of equal)	DIG ON	The State of the Car Charles Car	THE CLY
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant/ HUISK-K2351	
-	Deliver Date (aro)		IU-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		\$12.90	
	Each: 11-50		\$11.90	
	Each: 50-100		\$10.90	
	Each: 101+		\$10,20	
	VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 35":			;
CR-19	(Calrad 55-612-35 or equal)	No Bid		No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model		Valiant / HD15P-P35ST	
	Deliver Date (aro)		10-15 Days	
	Each: 1-10		813.90	
	Each: 11-50		812.90	
	Each: 50-100		\$11.90	
	Each: 101+		\$10.90	
CR-20	Speaker Cable: (Belden BEL-5100UE or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer / Model			
	[Deliver Date (aro)			
	Each: 1-10			
	Each: 11-50			
	Each: 50-100			