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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware:

SJO 001
Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: 
Peerless model CMJ 500RI or equal

Manufacturer AVM - PRO Peerless Peerless
Model UNV / 202 CMJ500R1 CMJ500R1

Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 14-21 Days 10-15 Days

Each: 1-10 $45.00 $50.00 $59.67

Each:  11-50 $45.00 $49.08 $59.50

Each:  50-100 $45.00 $49.08 $56.70

Each: 101+ $45.00 $49.08 $55.08

SJO 002
Universal LCD Projector Celing Mount: Peerless model 
PRG UNV or equal
Manufacturer AVM - PRO Peerless Peerless
Model UNV / 202 PRGUNV PRGUNV
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $45.00 $72.92 $104.13
Each:  11-50 $45.00 $71.57 $102.04

Each:  50-100 $45.00 $71.57 $97.50
Each: 101+ $45.00 $71.57 $96.12

SJO 007
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector 
Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal

Manufacturer AVM - PRO Peerless Chief
Model EXT / 5012 ECT101 CMA012
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each:  1-10 $15.00 $13.54 $22.50
Each: 11-50 $15.00 $13.29 $22.00
Each: 50-100 $15.00 $13.29 $21.00
Each: 101+ $15.00 $13.29 $20.50

SJO 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price 
Using the Each Price 11-50 $35.00 $44.65 $61.18

Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 010 Amplifier: Paso DMA 2015 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Paso Paso
Model DMA2015 DMA2015
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $162.55 $135.48
Each:  11-50 $145.72 $128.48
Each:  50-100 $124.74 $125.48
Each: 101+ $124.74 $123.48

CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT
SJO 015 Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal NO BID

Manufacturer Atlas Atlas
Model GD87W GD87W
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $39.50 $34.74
Each:  11-50 $28.82 $32.04
Each:  50-100 $28.82 $29.70
Each: 101+ $23.71 $28.04

SJO 016
Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: Atlas Sound model 81-8R or 
equal NO BID
Manufacturer Atlas Atlas
Model 81-8R 81-8R
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $15.82 $8.48
Each:  11-50 $8.48 $7.48
Each:  50-100 $8.48 $7.18
Each: 101+ $8.48 $6.68

SJO 017
Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound 
model 95-8 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Atlas Atlas
Model 95-8 95-8
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $21.18 $16.50
Each:  11-50 $14.53 $15.50
Each:  50-100 $14.53 $14.20
Each: 101+ $14.53 $14.00

SJO 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price 
Using the Each Price 11-50 N/A $17.28 $18.34



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 020
Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics        
OR-40300185 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 021
Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics       
OR-40300186 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 022
Extension Plate for Single Gang Surface Mounty Outlet 
Box: Ortronics OR-40300010 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 023
Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series II 
OR-40300011 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 024
Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series 
II Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 030
Three RCA Connector Module: Ortronics Series II              
OR-60900316 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 031
Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female: 
Ortronics Series II OR-60900212 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 033
15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series II            
OR-60900270 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 034
One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series II                  
OR-60900017 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 035
Blank Modules: Ortronics Series II OR-40300191               
(1 unit = pkg. of 10) or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 020-024, SJO 030-031 & SJO 033-035: Average 
Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50 N/A N/A N/A

SJO 040
Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male - 
15': MCM #24-6280 or equal NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer Valiant
Model MPS-2PP-15-ST
Deliver Date (aro) 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $6.90
Each:  11-50 $5.90
Each:  50-100 $5.40
Each: 101+ $4.93

SJO 041
Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 3':                      
MCM #24-2500 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model 255-120 2PP-3ST
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $1.25 $4.48
Each:  11-50 $1.25 $3.48
Each:  50-100 $1.25 $2.96
Each: 101+ $1.25 $2.48



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 047
Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50': Cables to Go 40456 or 
equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model 254-130 PP-CV-50
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $8.00 $9.98
Each:  11-50 $8.00 $9.20
Each:  50-100 $8.00 $8.48
Each: 101+ $8.00 $7.98

SJO 048
Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3':                   
MCM-24-2485 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model Not Listed 3RCA - 3ST
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $2.50 $4.99
Each:  11-50 $2.50 $4.69
Each:  50-100 $2.50 $3.99
Each: 101+ $2.50 $3.67

SJO 051 Video Cable - "F" to "F": MCM #33-548 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model 205-915 X-FF-C-6ST
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $2.25 $4.49
Each:  11-50 $2.25 $3.59
Each:  50-100 $2.25 $2.99
Each: 101+ $2.25 $2.49

SJO 055
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15':                  
Calrad 55-612-15 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model 253-315 HD15P-P-15ST
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $9.00 $9.59
Each:  11-50 $9.00 $8.99
Each:  50-100 $9.00 $8.56
Each: 101+ $9.00 $7.96



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 057
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 35':                  
Calrad 55-612-35 or equal NO BID
Manufacturer Steren Valiant
Model 250-350 HD15P-P-35ST
Deliver Date (aro) 2 Days 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $18.00 $13.20
Each:  11-50 $18.00 $12.69
Each:  50-100 $18.00 $12.13
Each: 101+ $18.00 $11.63

**NOTE: 50' not 35'

SJO 058
VGA Cable, Plenum rated, DB15 Male to Male - 35':           
Cables to Go or equal NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer Valiant
Model VGA15P-P-35HRP
Deliver Date (aro) 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $36.95
Each:  11-50 $35.50
Each:  50-100 $34.95
Each: 101+ $34.50

SJO 060 Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer Valiant
Model S14-2EXF
Deliver Date (aro) 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $289.50
Each:  11-50 $282.50
Each:  50-100 $279.50
Each: 101+ $274.85

NON-METALLIC LATCHING RACEWAY & CEILING 
CAP

SJO 065
Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD 10WH6-A     
or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Classroom Technology Solutions Troxell Communications, Inc. Valiant National AV Supply

4909 Victor Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road #148 55 Ruta Court

Jacksonville, FL 32207 Brandon, FL 33511 South Hackensack, NJ 07606

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 066
Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallic 
Raceway: Panduit Ceiling Entry Cap #1125 or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the 
Each Price 11-50 N/A N/A N/A

SJW 023
Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated:                                                
Anixter #AL-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer Valiant
Model S14-2 / PEXF-1000
Deliver Date (aro) 10-15 Days
Each: 1-10 $260.50
Each:  11-50 $255.90
Each:  50-100 $252.50
Each: 101+ $247.55



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware:

SJO 001
Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: 
Peerless model CMJ 500RI or equal

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each:  11-50

Each:  50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 002
Universal LCD Projector Celing Mount: Peerless model 
PRG UNV or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50

Each:  50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 007
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector 
Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)
Each:  1-10
Each: 11-50
Each: 50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price 
Using the Each Price 11-50

Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

Peerless Peerless
CMJ500R1 CMJ500R1

10 Days 30 Days

$55.44 $79.00

$55.13 $75.00

$54.95 $71.00

$54.60 $71.00

Peerless Peerless
PRGUNV PRGUNV
10 Days 30 Days
$94.68 $149.00
$94.47 $138.00

$93.96 $132.00
$93.71 $128.00

Chief Chief
CMS012 CMA012
10 Days 30 Days
$21.06 $29.00
$20.88 $27.00
$20.66 $25.00
$20.48 $25.00

$56.83 $80.00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 010 Amplifier: Paso DMA 2015 or equal

Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT
SJO 015 Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal

Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 016
Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: Atlas Sound model 81-8R or 
equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 017
Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound 
model 95-8 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price 
Using the Each Price 11-50

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID NO BID

Atlas Atlas
GD87W GD87W
15 Days 30 Days
$36.22 $39.00
$35.10 $35.00
$34.81 $30.00
$33.90 $29.00

Atlas Atlas
81-8R 81-8R

15 Days 30 Days
$12.22 $9.50
$12.12 $9.00
$11.90 $8.50
$11.10 $8.00

Atlas Atlas
95-8 95-8

15 Days 30 Days
$19.51 $17.00
$19.10 $16.00
$18.77 $15.50
$18.21 $15.00

$22.11 $20.00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 020
Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics        
OR-40300185 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 021
Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics       
OR-40300186 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 022
Extension Plate for Single Gang Surface Mounty Outlet 
Box: Ortronics OR-40300010 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 023
Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series II 
OR-40300011 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 024
Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series 
II Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 030
Three RCA Connector Module: Ortronics Series II              
OR-60900316 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 031
Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female: 
Ortronics Series II OR-60900212 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 033
15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series II            
OR-60900270 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 034
One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series II                  
OR-60900017 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 035
Blank Modules: Ortronics Series II OR-40300191               
(1 unit = pkg. of 10) or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 020-024, SJO 030-031 & SJO 033-035: Average 
Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50

SJO 040
Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male - 
15': MCM #24-6280 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 041
Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male - 3':                      
MCM #24-2500 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

N/A N/A

NO BID
Hosa

CMR215
30 Days
$6.50
$6.25
$6.00
$6.00

NO BID
Hosa

CRA201
30 Days
$4.00
$3.75
$3.50
$3.50



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 047
Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50': Cables to Go 40456 or 
equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 048
Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3':                   
MCM-24-2485 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 051 Video Cable - "F" to "F": MCM #33-548 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 055
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15':                  
Calrad 55-612-15 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID
Hosa

HRR050
30 Days
$18.00
$17.00
$16.50
$16.00

NO BID
Hosa

VRA301
30 Days
$5.00
$4.50
$4.00
$4.00

NO BID
Hosa

UDF105
30 Days
$4.50
$4.00
$3.50
$3.50

NO BID
Hosa

VGA515
30 Days
$19.00
$18.00
$17.00
$16.50



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 057
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 35':                  
Calrad 55-612-35 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 058
VGA Cable, Plenum rated, DB15 Male to Male - 35':           
Cables to Go or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 060 Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

NON-METALLIC LATCHING RACEWAY & CEILING 
CAP

SJO 065
Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD 10WH6-A     
or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID
Comprehensive
VGA15P-P-35

30 Days
$40.00
$38.00
$35.00
$35.00

NO BID
Cables to Go

40683.00
30 Days
$150.00
$142.00
$140.00
$138.00

NO BID
Beldon

Bel-5100UE
30 Days
$388.00
$378.00
$374.00
$370.00

NO BID NO BID



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Board "3/6/12"

DATE OF OPENING: February 3, 2012 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE:  Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #12-066-AF

SJO 066
Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallic 
Raceway: Panduit Ceiling Entry Cap #1125 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

SJO 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the 
Each Price 11-50

SJW 023
Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated:                                                
Anixter #AL-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal
Manufacturer
Model
Deliver Date (aro)
Each: 1-10
Each:  11-50
Each:  50-100
Each: 101+

VSA, Inc. Washington Professional Systems

6929 Seward Avenue 11242 Grandview Avenue

Lincoln, NE 68507 Wheaton, MD 20902

NO BID NO BID

N/A N/A

NO BID NO BID




