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Qty Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Project A:
38 Mowing, Weeding  & String Trimming  $200.00 $7,600.00 Included Included $461.00 $17,518.00
38 Edging             Included Included Included Included No Charge No Charge

1 Hedge Trimming (annual basis) $14,808.00 $14,808.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,200.00
$2,400.00* / 
$1,200.00**

2 Pruning (Palms) $200.00 $400.00 Included Included $900.00 $1,800.00

1 Pruning (non-Palms) $100.00 $100.00 Included Included $675.00
$1,350.00* / 
$675.00**

2 Mulching                       $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00
4 Bush Hog $500.00 $2,000.00 $450.00 $1,800.00 $200.00 $800.00

 Grand Total For Project A: 

Additional Mulch, Per Cubic Yard Price:

Cost for 10' x 10' Bedding Area:

Project B:
38 Mowing, Weeding  & String Trimming  $158.00 $6,004.00 Included Included $550.00 $20,900.00
38 Edging             Included Included Included Included No Charge No Charge 
1 Hedge Trimming (annual basis) $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
2 Pruning (Palms) $1,500.00 $3,000.00 Included Included $1,250.00 $2,500.00
1 Pruning (non-Palms) $1,000.00 $1,000.00 Included Included $3,000.00 $3,000.00

2 Mulching                       $3,900.00 $7,800.00 Included Included $4,000.00 $4,000.00

 Grand Total For Project B: 

Additional Mulch, Per Cubic Yard Price:

Cost for 10' x 10' Bedding Area:

* Vendor Math Error
**Corrected price calcuated by Purchasing

$50.00 $100.00 $55.00

$50.00 $100.00 $55.00

$41,804.00 $60,000.00 $36,400.00

Evolve Professional Landscape 
Management, LLC

14105 Hibiscus Drive
Bartow, FL 33830

The Leaf Man, LLC
PO Box 4386

Tampa, FL 33677

Date of Opening: August 23, 2011 @ 2:30 PM
Bid Title: Grounds Maintenance - CLMS & D.O.
Bid #: 12-022-AF

**Board Meeting September 13, 2011**

A Team Lawn Service, Inc.
8610 Jolly Roger Drive

Hudson, FL 34667

27,308.00 $29,800.00 $27,868.00* / $25,993.00**

50.00

50.00

$50.00

$50.00

$55.00

$50.00
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Qty Description

Project A:
38 Mowing, Weeding  & String Trimming  
38 Edging             

1 Hedge Trimming (annual basis)
2 Pruning (Palms)

1 Pruning (non-Palms)
2 Mulching                       
4 Bush Hog 

 Grand Total For Project A: 

Additional Mulch, Per Cubic Yard Price:

Cost for 10' x 10' Bedding Area:

Project B:
38 Mowing, Weeding  & String Trimming  
38 Edging             
1 Hedge Trimming (annual basis)
2 Pruning (Palms)
1 Pruning (non-Palms)

2 Mulching                       

 Grand Total For Project B: 

Additional Mulch, Per Cubic Yard Price:

Cost for 10' x 10' Bedding Area:

* Vendor Math Error
**Corrected price calcuated by Purchasing

Date of Opening: August 23, 2011 @ 2:30 PM
Bid Title: Grounds Maintenance - CLMS & D.O.
Bid #: 12-022-AF

**Board Meeting September 13, 2011**
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

No Bid No Bid $900.00 $34,200.00
No Bid No Bid $85.00 $3,230.00

No Bid No Bid $1,200.00 $1,200.00
No Bid No Bid $200.00 $400.00

No Bid No Bid $200.00 $200.00
No Bid No Bid $1,350.00 $2,700.00
No Bid No Bid $600.00 $2,400.00

$1,200.00 $45,600.00 No Bid No Bid
$150.00 $5,700.00 No Bid No Bid

$2,500.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,500.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid
$3,400.00 $3,400.00 No Bid No Bid

$2,000.00
$2000.00* / 
$4,000.00** No Bid No Bid

$50.00

$50.00

$64,200.00* / $66,200.00** No Bid

North American Maintenance 
Co., Inc.

1600. - 10th St. S. #408
Safety Harbor, FL 34695

Pine Lake Services
2122 Henley Road

Lutz, FL 33548

No Bid $44,330.00

$45.00

$75.00
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