District School Board of Pasco County
7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard ® Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638 » 813/794-2000

Pasco Bounty Scheols

Heather Fiorentino, Superintendent wiwt. pasco.k12 flus

Department of Purchasing

Kendra Goodman, CPPQ, CPPB, Purchasing Agent
813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2111

727/ 774.2221  TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 624-2221 e-mail; kgoodman@pasco.ki2.ilus

December 20, 2011

MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent%

RE: Bid #11-042-AF Purchase and Installation of Storage Sheds “As-Needed” / FEPC

Second Year Renewal of a Three-Year Contract
Factory Direct Buildings, LLC
Superior Sheds, Inc.

On December 20, 2010, official action (attached) was taken to award the above-referenced bid
for the purchase and installation of Storage Sheds to Factory Direct Buildings, LLC and
Superior Sheds, Inc. This bid is a three-year contract, renewable annually based upon mutual
consent of the parties. The first year of the agreement will expire on December 31, 2011.

Considering services have been satisfactory, Andrew Pasko, Managing Member, Factory
Direct Buildings, LLC and Alex Martens, President, Superior Sheds, Inc., were contacted to
determine their willingness to enter into the second year of the agreement. As such, they
have agreed in writing (attached) to enter into the second year of the agreement.

It is my recommendation at this time to enter into the second year of the agreement with the
vendors noted above. The second year of the contract will cover the period of January 1,

2012 through December 31, 2012. Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if
I can be of further assistance, please feel free to contact me at your earliest convenience.

KDG/act
Attachments

Date/Time: December 14, 2011 08:33:00

District Wide Accrediration * Southern Association of Colleges and Schools


Lora B. Lester
Typewritten Text
Date/Time:  December 14, 2011  08:33:00
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Kendra Goodman, CPRO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent
813/ 794-2221 Fax 813/ 794-2111

7271 774-2221  TDD: 813/ 794-2484
382/ 524-2221  e-mail; kgoodman@pasco.ki2 fus

October 14, 2011
BID RENEWAL REQUEST
BYD #: 11-042-AF
BID TYTLE: Purchase & Installation of Storage Sheds

W'jiu,w___\’es, I agree to renew for the second year of a three year agreement for 11-042-AF under the same terms and conditions
_for the period of January 1, 2012 and expire.on December. 30, 2002, oo oo i i e

No, I do not agree lo renew 11-042-AF.

Company Name: Factory Direct Buildings, LL.C

. P L
Signaturer 7 g Jile el Date: /.t f 7/ llis

Typed Name and Title: N g e LA Do A iind AL o o
-
Telephone (w/area code): &7, 3. F5 /- 25 Rax Number (w/arca code): floridasheds@comeast.net
R s
AORHEE G Rt

[ J
DATE DUE: PLEASE FAX TO PURCHASING NO LATER THAN TUESDAY, 10/17/11.

By agreeing to renew, vendor acknowledges and agrees o be in compliance with the “Jessica Lunsford Act”, Vendors
conducting business, with the District School Board of Pasco County, whe will (1) be at the school when students are present, or
(2) bave direct contact with students, or (3) have access to or control of school funds must be Level 2 fingerprinted by Human
Resources. 1f any of the above applies to this contract, you must have those individuals Level 2 fingerprinted and screened by the
Districts Human Resource Department prior to commencement of services or work and must provide a list of employees with
renewal. Please contact 813/794-2521 to arrange for an appointment. Costs associated with this background screening are to
borne by the vendor, You may access information regarding this law through the internet link:
hitpflelection, dos.state. fLus/laws/03 Laws/ch_2005-028.pdf, This law became effective September 1, 2005,

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that neither it nor its principals are
wrosently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this
transaction per the provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a).

PLEASE RETURN TO: DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
ATTN: Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 7942227 (PHONE) (813) 794-2111 (FAX)

District Wide Accreditation @ Southem Agsodiation of Colleges and Schools
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October 14, 2011
PID RENEWAL REQUEST
BI0 #: LIS Al

2ILARe Shw

Yes, T xgros to yonsw for tho sooond Yot nf n thres yerr agresmsak for 11-042-A¥ imder the sams terms s cendition:
for the pariod of Jeuuery 3. 2012 sné expire on Dregmber 31, 2014,

i Nu, 1 do not ngres to reasw 31-042-AF.

Compmrry Nems: . n

Sigrarure: o] Date: fU/(S'?C'/f(
Typed Neme sad Tide: J’qf E X MART & M A1 gear—
Telophans (oares codu): Fax Nosntber (winras onde): cxlllla@oupetiarehads oomn,

By agrenlng & renew, vendor sckapwicdges and agrecs to be in complianoe with the “Jemsicx Lanstord Act™. Veaders
blisitresd, with the Distriet Sotiool Baxrd of Punen County, who will (1) be ut 2y sehnol when sudents s predznt, or

(2) have direcs contacl with suwdants, or (3) havw rosera to or comwol of schoo! funds mast b Leve] 2 Singesprintad by Ehumen
Resemucys, IEamy of the shove applies 1o 1his comtracy, you muat have thoas mdividuels Lovel 2 fsgerprmted and gereennd by the
Districts Himesn Resourcs Departmem prior w0 commencement of servicas of work and souxt provide n it of employess with
repotval, Please contact B153/7842421 te sivangs fiw an mppolntrent. Ceots sssosiuted with this beckgyoimd asrooming ere fa
boms by the vendor. You may stces inSmutin reparding this lrw throsgh the mtmmet ok

[tz eotion. Jou eo. flogefaws/OR [aafich 2005-028 pdf. Thia law becsms affectlva Sopteribker 1, 2003,

The prospactive bidder cartiBies, by submisslon wnd sipoature of this bld renewal fonm, that velther it bor it principels wre
preseatty debarred, susperudsd, proposst Sor debarmant, doclized Inolfgibls, of volumarily cxcluded fhom participation in this
frangaction prr the grovistone of Floclda Statfo 287.123(2Xa).

PLBASERETLIRAN TO: DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
ATEN: Db Maten, Buyer Assigtunt
PFURCHASTNG DEPARMENT
430 GATOR LANE
LAND O' LAKHS, FL. 34638
(E13) 7942227 (PHONE) (S13) 734-2111 (FAX)
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District School Board of Pasco County
Bid Recommendatlon

Bid Titie . Purchase & Installatxon of

Number of Vendors T 145 |
Storage Sheds — Netified
o “As-Needed” / FEPC o . .
Bid Number 11-042-AF Number of Bids 35
| BDistributed _
Date October 20, 2010 Number of Vendors 2
Solicited Bidding

Date Opencd | November 30, 2010 "Number of Formal “No 0

Bid” Responses

Date Board December 21, 2010 Funding Source | | *See below
Presentation | . o :
Total Savings | Estimated for DSBPC Grand Total of Bid Estimated for
1 $13,869.50 DSBPC :
: $20,600

| Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on attached b1d tabulatlon sheet as
| lowest and best, responsive and responsible “all-or-none” bid meeting written specifications for
| each region/group.

[ Term of Contract: This bid is for the purchase and installation of storage sheds “as needed” for
'| use throughout the District. This is a three-year bid renewable annually based upon mutual

agreement of both parties. The first year of this contract shall be effective from January 1, 2011
through December 31, 2011. The bid prices are firm and fixed for the first year of the contract

| and may be adjusted annually based on changes in the Producer Price Index of #WPU10250105.

Notations and Exceptions: This bid was solicited on behalf of the Florida Education Purchasmg

.1 Consortium with the following school districts actively participating: Lake, Madison, and Pasco.

The grand total for the bid and the savings provided above are for the District School Board of
Pasco County only and do not include the other participating school districts.

| Savings were determined by averaging all bids submitted for the Central region and deducting the
"I recommended awarded vendor’s bid. The bid savings are based on a quantity of 1 unit of each
.| size.

| Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified
.| opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are
‘| hereby rejected as late.

‘i *Various funding sources: Capital, Federal, General, and Internal

Bids Evaluated By: Joe Scudiero, Chief Building Official, Construction Services and Code
-} Compliance

Bids Prepared Bv Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant, Purchasmg Department “

' Reviewed and Authorized By: Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agentﬁ@. (\)

District Sehoo! Board
of Pasco County

DEC 21 2010

Board Approved




DISTRICT SCHCOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF QPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Superior Sheds, Inc.

BiD TITLE: Storage Sheds

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

2323 8. Volusia Ave,

BiD: # 11-042-AF

Palm City, FL 34990-0770

QOrange City, FL. 32763

**Board Meeting 12/21/10*

ITEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTICN TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | 1OTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | FOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed style" wilh aluminum lap siding
sides and roof with no overhang

1 1 6x8 1326, e $1348:00 1,366.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1 6x 10 {561, 5158100 $1,601:00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
3 1 3x8 66 $1,665:00 $1,705.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 8x 10 002! $2:022.00" By Z$2-;042;OO : No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
[ 1 Bx12 2451 $2:265.00° 7 L §RRB500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
& 1 18 x10 422, $2,442:00 5000 2 82.462.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
7 1 10x12 $2,683.00 "o Z$2,703.00° 7 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
g 3 10x14 301 $3,421.00° i No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 1 10x16 439, $3459.00:° No Bid MNo Bid No Bid
10 1 10 x 20 004 %4, ' No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 1 12x12 233, 2530 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
12 i 12x14 16 $3,536.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 1 12x16 $3,986.007 -$4:006.00° No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
14 1 12x20 4, 736.007 94,756.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 1 12 %24 $5,685.00° $5,705.00" No Bid Na Bid Ng Bid
16 1 12 x 30 $6,960.00 :$6,970.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 1 14 x 20 $6,089:00 - ; No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 1 14 x 24 $7,261:0¢ No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 1 14 x 30 $9,024.00° No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 1 14 x 40 $12,150.00.. No Bid Mo Bid No Bid

Totai Bid Price for Western Region, Group 1

Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1

through 20 lisfed above for "Shed Style™) No Bid
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DiSTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY 8i0 TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, 1LLC Superior Sheds, inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: #11-042-AF Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Crange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10™
ITEME | QTY SiZE/DESCRIPTION TG 1AL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed siyle™ with aluminum fap siding
sides and roof with no overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,108.00 $1,128.00 $1,148.00
2 1 6x10 $1,354.00 $1,374.00 $1.394.00
3 1 8x8 $1.455.00 $1,465.00 $1,485.00
4 1 8x10 $1,738.00 $1,758.00 $1,778.00
5 1 8§x12 $1,951.60 $1,971.00 $1.991.00
6 1 10 x 10 $2.104.00 $2,124.00 $2.144.G0
7 1 10x12 $2,313.60 $2,333.00 $2,353.00
8 1 10x 14 $2,733.00 $2,753.00 $2.773.00
9 1 10x18 $2,888.00 $3,018.00 $3,038.GC I !
10 ¢ 1 10x 20 $3,478.00 $3,498.00 $3,518.00 CNoBid i T g2i885.00 T
11 1 12x12 $2.820.00 $2,830.00 2,850.00 ENo Bid - 0 $2,185100 )
12 1 12 x 14 $3,0586.00 $3,076.00 $3.086.00 TNOBId T 2,400,000
i3 1 1 12x18 $3,468.00 $3,488.00 $3,518.00 NoBid o 82800007 1
14 1 1 12x20 54,105.00 $4,125.00 $4,745.00 CONOBIdTT T 831400000
15 1 N 12x24 $4,045.00 $4,965.00 $4,985.00 NoBid e B3 47500
16 1 12%30 $6,046.00 $6,066.00 $6,086.00 : LU SA140,00 0
17 1 14x20 $5,086.00 $5,106.00 $5,126.00 o 53,840.00
18 1 14x24 $6,090.00 $6,110.00 $6,130.00 4,320.00
19 1 14x 30 $7,576.00 $7,596.00 $7,618.00 {0
20 1 14 x 40 510,260.00 $10,280.00 $10,300.00
Total Bid Price for Northern Redion, Group 1
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1 e 0
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style”) $225,222 .00 15:00%1$55:740.007

panciddy pizoy
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DISTRICT SCHOGOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LEC Superior Sheds, lnc.
BID TITLE; Storage Sheds Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF Palm City, FL. 34890-0770 Orange City, FL 32783
*Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITEME | OTY SIZEMESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Stanidard "shéd stylé™ with aluminum fap siding
sides and roof with no overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,039.00 $1,059,00 $1,079.00
2 1 6x10 $1,223.00 $1,243.00 51.263.00
3 1 8x8 $1,306.60 $1,326.00 $1,346.00
4 1 8x10 $1.561.¢0 $1,581.00 $1,611.00
5 1 8x12 $1,764.00 $1,784.00 51,804.00
8 1 10x10 $1,903.00 51,923.00 $1,943.00
7 1 10x12 $2,093.00 $2,113.00 $2,133.00
8 1 10x14 $2.443.00 b2,463.00 $2.483.00
9 1 10x16 $2,711.00 2,731.00 $2,751.00
10 1 10x20 $3,231.00 $3,251.00 $3,211.00
11 1 12x12 $2,540.00 2,560.00 $2,580.00
12 1 12x14 $2,760.00 $2,780.00 $2,800.00
13 1 12x16 53,161.00 $3,181.00 $3,211.00
14 1 12x20 $3,723.00 $3,743.00 $3,763.00
15 1 12x24 54,478.00 $4,498.00 $4,518.00
18 1 12x 30 $5,470.00 $5,490.00 $5,510.00
17 1 5 14x 20 $4,715.00 54,735.00 $4.755.00
18 1 14 x24 $5,610.00 $5,630.00 $5,650.00
19 1 14 x 30 5,948.00 $6,968.00 $6,988.00
20 1 14 x40 $9,343.00 $9,363.00 $9,383.00
Total Bid Price for Central Region, Group 1
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $214,146.00% [ $205,226.00%

peacsddy pisog

002 T 2 340

AWUN0D 0088g JO
DIBOY 1O0U0S 10HISIO

Page 3of9



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD QF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:36 PM

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Superior Sheds, inc.

BID TITLE: Storage Sheds

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

2323 5. Volusia Ave,

8ID: # 11-042-AF

Palm City, FL 34990-0770

Orange City, FL 32763

*Board Meeting 12121110™
ITEME | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH_| TOTAL FRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed style™ with aluminum lap siding
sides and roof with no overhang
1 1 §x8 $1.063.00 $1,083.00 51,103.00 Z§1070.00 00 0
2 1 E§x10 $1,3C0.00 $1,320.00 $1,340.00 .00
3 1 8x8 $1,387.00 $1,407.00 51.427.00
4 1 8x10 1,738.00 $1,758.00 $1,778.00
5 1 8x12 $1,863.00 $1,883.00 $1,913.00
6 1 10x10 2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2.060.00
7 1 10x12 §2,222 .00 $2,242.00 $2,262.00 $1.895.00
8 1 10x14 $2,538.00 $2,608.00 $2,628.00 = 205000
9 1 10x16 32,861.00 $2,881.00 $2.911.00 S 8228500
10 1 10x 20 $3,341.00 $3,361.00 $3,381.00 L 8269500
19 1 12x12 $2,699.00 $2,719.00 $2,739.00 Ve v$2:488.000
12 1 12x 14 $2,955.00 $2,975.00 $2.975.00 82,400,000
13 1 12 x 16 $3,341.00 $3,361.00 $3,381.00 < $2,600:00
14 1 12x20 $3,956.00 $3,976.00 $3,998.00 U0r83,140.00 ¢
15 1 12x24 $4,726.00 $4,746.00 $4.766.00 0 83,475.00
16 1 12x30 $5,5808.00 $5,828.00 $5,848.00 ST SA40000
17 1 14 x 20 $5,247.00 55,267.00 $5,287.00 S o$3,840000 0
18 1 14x24 $6,077.00 $6,097.00 $6,117.00 $4,320.00
19 1 14 x30 $7,637.00 $7,657.00 $7,.877.00 $5,400.00-
20 1 14 x 40 $10,199.00 $10,219.00 $10,238.00 -$6,610.00° 0
Total Bid Price for Southern Region, Group
1 Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $220,284.00
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BISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, 1.1.C Superior Sheds, inc.

BID TITLE: Storage Sheds Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 5. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FE 32763
“Board Meeting 12/21110™
ITEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 146MPH | TOTAL PRICE « 150MPH_ TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRIGE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
"Eave style” with aluminum lap siding sides and
roof with 4" overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,367.00. 7 $1,387.00 . $1,407,00.; No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1 §x10 -$1,609.00 -$1:629.00 1:649.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 1 8x8 $1716.00 +$1,736.00. 1.756.0( No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 2x10 '$2,063.00 '$2,083.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 1 8x12 = 52,813,600 $2,333.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
6 1 10 x 16 . $2,495.00; 515. No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 10x12 $2,744.00 2,764.00 _ No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 10x 14 $3,195.00: $3,215.00 °$3:235.00 No Bid No Bid No Hid
9 1 10x18 :%2,513.00. $2:533.00 $2:553.00; No Bid ] No Bid No Bid
10 1 10x 20 - 84,122,00 34, 0 : No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 1 12x12 8333100 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 1 12x14 St 8382200 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 1 12x16 L 54,106.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 1 12 x 20 U $489100 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 1 12 x 24 185,856,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 1 12 x 30 e 8T159.00° No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 1 14 x 20 8627300 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 1 14 x 24 00 B7,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 1 14 x 30 *$9,285.00. No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 1 14 x 40 '$125,515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Bid Price for Western Region, Group 2
Total (Adding ali prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style™) No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD QF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

Page 6 of 9

DATE OF QPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 8. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/121/10*
TEM# { QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRIGE - 140MPH [ TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOIAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - t50MPH
"Eave styie” with aluminum lap siding sides and
roof with 4” gverhang
1 1 Bx8 $1,142.00 51,162.00 $1,182.00
2 1 6x10 $1,396.00 $1.416.00 $1,436.00
3 1 §x8 $1,490.00 $1,510.00 $1,530.00
4 1 8x10 $1,791.00 $1.811.00 $1,831.00
5 1 8x12 $2,011.00 $2,031.00 $2,051.00
[§ 1 10x10 $2,168.00 $2,188.00 $2.208.00
7 1 10x12 $2,384.00 $2,404.00 $2,424.00
8 i 10x 14 $2,901.00 $2,921.00 $2.941.00
9 1 0x16 $3,089.00 $3,109.00 $3,129.00 i 000
1€ 1 10 x20 $3,584.00 $3,604.00 $3,624.00 - $2,§_00.00’ i
11 1 i2x12 $3,895.00 $2,915.60 $2,935.00 L82,275.00 0
12 1 12 x14 $3,149.00 $3,165.00 $3,188.00 i $2,495.00 - o
13 1 12x16 $3,583.00 $3,603.00 $3,623.00 - $2,700.00
14 | 1 1220 $4,229.00 $4,249.00 $4,269.00 U $3,26500
15 1 12 x24 $5 248.00 $5,268.00 $5,288.00 LETU88,505.00
16 1 12x30 $6,228.00 36,248.00 $6,268.00 1 :34,300.00 -
17 1 14 x20 $5,239.00 $5,259.00 $5,279.00 j'_$3_,995'.00 :
18 1 14 x 24 $6,273.00 $6,203.00 $6,313.00 “$4,495.00
19 1 14x30 $7,804.00 $7,824.00 $7,844.00 - $5,620.00-
20 1 14 x 40 $10,569.00 $10,584.00 $10,609.00 ©.$6:875.00:0 7
Totai Bid Price for Northern Region, Group 2
Total {Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style™) $232,869.00* / $233,715.00**
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 & 2:30 PM

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Superior Sheds, Inc.

BID TITLE: Storage Sheds

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

2323 S. Volusia Ave.

BID: # 11-042-AF

Paim City, FL 349800770

Orange Cily, FL 32763

**Board Meeting 12/21/10*
TEME | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | 1O 1AL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
“Eave style” with aluminum lap siding sides and
roof with 4" overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,074.00 $1,094.00 $1,114.00 CarNOBId st
Pl 1 6% 10 $1,261.00 $1,281.00 $1,301.00 NoBid o
3 1 8x8 $1,346.00 $1,366.00 $1,386.00 No Bid
4 1 8x10 $1,619.00 $1,839.00 $1,659.00 =:No'Bid
5 1 8x12 $1.818.00 51,838.00 $1.858.00 =NoBid -
3 1. 16x 10 $1,961.00 $1,981.60 $2,001.00 = NoBid 1
7 1 106x12 $2,156.00 $2,176.00 $2,196.00 CiNoBidy
8 1 10x 14 $2,517.00 $2 537 00 $2,557 .00 Mo Big
9 1 16 x 16 $2,793.00 $2,813.00 $2,833.00 i No Big
10 1 10x%20 $3,267.00 $3,287.00 $3,307.00 N SO NG Bid $2,67
1 1 12x12 $2,617.00 $2,637.00 $2,657.00 SN BT N B $2:195.00.
12 1 12x14 $2,.844.00 $2,864.00 $2,884.00 TUNoBid T e N Bid © $2,410.00
13 1 12x16 $3,262.00 §3,282.00 $3,307.00 ~CUNeBid s o Ne Bid v -2 $2,930:00.
14 1 12 x 20 $3,835.00 $3,855.00 $3,875.00 CNoBid T N Bid 7$3,450.00
15 1 12x24 $4,614.00 $4,634.00 $4,654.00 CNOBId N Bid e 083,550,007
16 1 12 % 30 $5,635.00 $5,655.00 $5.675.00 { e L No Bid L $4,185.00 7
17 1 14 %20 $4,858.00 $4,878.00 $4,898.00 SoNeBid o 83,885,000
18 1 14 x 24 $5,179.00 $5,759.00 5.819.00 NoBid - L $4,375.000 0
19 1 14 x 30 $7,157.00 $7.177.00 7,197.00 ' ~$5,500.00 .7
20 1 14 x 40 $9,624.00 $9,644.00 $9,664.00 :$6,605.00. -
Total Bid Price for Central Region, Group 2
Total {Adding all prices for 60 items, 1 .
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style") $211,326.00" / $210,716.00*
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OFPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Superior Sheds, Inc.

BID TITLE: Storage Sheds

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

2323 S. Volusia Ave.

BiD: # 11-042-AF

Palm City, FL 34990-0770

Orange City, FL 32763

**Board Meeting 12/21/10**

ITEM#E [ QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRIGE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
“Eave style™ with aluminum fap siding sides and
roof with 4" gverhang

1 1 6x8 $1,093.00 $1,113.00 51,136.00 i No.Bid.. Lo §1,110,00
2 1 6x10 $1,340.00 $1,360.00 51,380.00 No Bid' - +:$1.380.00
3 1 8x8 $1,429.00 $1,449.00 $1.469.00 “No:Bid - “$1,400.00
4 1 ax10 $1,789.00 $1,811.00 $1,831.00 “1:No'Bid* $1.,550.00
5 1 8x12 $1,830.00 $1,850.00 $1,870.00 S Né Bid~ - o $'I,-7'9(§?'{}{}
8 1 10x10 $2,081.00 52,101.00 $2,121.00 SN BIE :§1,815.00
7 1 10x 12 $2,289.00 52,309.00 $2,329.00 SINOBId i §1,965.00
8 1 10x14 32,666.60 $2,686.00 $2.706.00 - NoBid-. T 8210000
9 1 10x16 52,958.00 $2,978.00 $2,998.00 NG Bid S R28TB00
10 1 10 x 20 $3,442.00 $3,462.00 $3,432.00 -+ NoBid - S $2/800.00 0
11 1 12x12 $2,781.00 $2,801.00 $2,821.00 “No Bid s T $2,275.00
12 1 12x14 $3,024.00 $3.044.00 $3,064.00 . NoBid i 1$2,49_5‘LGO :
13 1 12x16 $3,442 00 $3,462.00 $3,482.00 <2 /NoBid $270000 1
14 1 12 %20 $4,075.00 $4,095.00 $4,115.00 SNoBid 832651000
15 1 12x24 $4,868.00 4,588.00 $4,908.00 NoBid - $3,505.000
16 1 12x30 $5,983.00 $6,003.00 $6,023.00 : "$4,300.00 -
17 1 14 x20 $5,405.00 $5,425.00 $5,445.00 L $3,005.00: 0
i8 1 14 x 24 $6,260.00 $6,280.00 $6,300.00 84, 495.00 0
19 1 14 x 30 $7,867.00 $7,887.00 $7,907.00 '$5,620.
20 1 14 x 40 $10,506.00 $10,526.00 $10,546.00

Total Bid Price for Sguthern Region, Group

2 Total {Adding alf prices for 60 items, 1

through 20 listed above for “Eave Style™) $199,598.00* / $226,581.00** ©-$57:900:00:

peaouddy praog

B0 T 7 230

AunoQ ovseg J0
B480§ 100408 101810

Page 8of 9



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY EID TABULATION

{

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BiD TITLE: Storage Sheds Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Read 2323 5. Volusia Ave.
BiD: # 11-042-AF Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Qrange City, FL 32763
*Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITEME | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Options: (Not considered in bid award)
Pricing to be consistent for both Group 1
and 2 for ali regions. SIZE EACH PRICE SIZE EACH PR!CE
Small Vent {peak end) 3 e 162 x 4"
Large Vent (peak end) 12" % 1 v
Small Window 22“x27"
Large Window . 46“_:; by i
Additional 48" x 72" Door LT
72" x 72" Double Doors
96" x 72" Double Doors
9' x 7' Garage Door
8' x 7" Garage Door IB4T0.00
6' Roll-Up Door “$500.50 Lo
8' Roll-Uip Door o '$550 00 i
48" Aluminum Ramp i
60" Aluminum Ramp
108" Aluminum Ramp
i Electricat Options: s
One (1) overhead light, one (1) switch, one (1) ouf{- :*"
Extra outlet {limit 2) ) -
Extra overhead light (lmit 2}
*Vendor Math Error
**Total cajcaiated by the District
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