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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY RFP TABULATION

1 of 1

Date of Opening: March 10, 2011 @ 2:30 pm Carrier Corporation
Cortez Heating & Air 

Conditioning, Inc. McQuay International

RFP Title: HVAC Factory Chiller Services 8656 Elm Fair Boulevard 5928 21st Street East
1911 US Hwy 301 North 

Suite 300

RFP #: 11-067-AF Tampa, FL 33610 Bradenton, FL 34203 Tampa, FL 33619

Part I: **Award Date: September 6, 2011**
Labor Rates Per Manufacturer:

Manufacturer: Carrier
Certified Chiller Technician Hourly Rate: $115.00 $85.00 No Bid

Certified Control Technician Hourly Rate: $125.00 $85.00 No Bid

Manufacturer: McQuay
Certified Chiller Technician Hourly Rate: No Bid $85.00 $95.00

Certified Control Technician Hourly Rate: No Bid $85.00 $95.00

Manufacturer: Trane
Certified Chiller Technician Hourly Rate: No Bid $85.00 No Bid

Certified Control Technician Hourly Rate: No Bid $85.00 No Bid

Criteria:
A. Letter of Transmittal/Table of Contents (max 10 pts) n/a 8.00 4.30
B. Firms's Profile (max 30 pts) n/a 20.00 18.33
C. Firm's Technical Qualifications (max 40 pts) n/a 23.33 13.33
D. Proposal (max 5 pts) n/a 30.00 15.00
E. Pricing (max 50 pts) n/a 5.00 5.00
F. References (max 20 pts) n/a 50.00 44.75

20.00 16.00
Score: Disqualified 156.33 116.71 RANK ORDER - HIGH TO LOW

Cortez Heating & Air 
Conditioning, Inc. 156.33
McQuay International 116.71
Carrier Corporation Disqualified
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