



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard • Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services

Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Purchasing Agent

813/794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2111

727/774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484

352/524-2221 email: nwestmor@pasco.k12.fl.us

May 6, 2014

MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Purchasing Agent *NW*

RE: Bid #14-003-VJ, Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Coolers, Freezers,
And Associated Wireless Monitoring Systems
Second Year Renewal of a Three-Year Contract
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.

On June 18, 2013 official action (attached) was taken to award the above-referenced bid to Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. This bid is a three-year contract, renewable annually based upon mutual consent of both parties. The first year of the agreement will expire on June 18, 2014.

Considering services have been satisfactory, Rita K. Nurdin, President was contacted to verify his willingness to enter into the second year of the agreement. As such, Ms. Nurdin has agreed in writing (attached), to enter into the second year of the contract.

Therefore, at this time, it is my recommendation to enter into the second year of the agreement with Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. The second year of the contract will cover the period of June 19, 2014 through June 18, 2015.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if I can be of further assistance, please feel free to contact me at your earliest convenience.

NW/dam

Attachment(s)

Date/Time: April 30, 2014 09:46:00

(813) 794-2000 • (352) 524-2000 • (727) 774-2000 • www.pasco.k12.fl.us



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard • Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services

Nicole Westmoreland, MBA, Purchasing Agent

813/794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2111

727/774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484

352/524-2221 email: nwestmor@pasco.k12.fl.us

BID RENEWAL REQUEST

BID #: 14-003-VJ

BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Coolers, Freezers, and Associated Wireless Monitoring Systems

Yes, I agree to renew for the second year of a three year agreement for 14-003-VJ under the same terms and conditions for the period of June 19, 2014 and expire on June 18, 2015.

No, I do not agree to renew 14-003-VJ

Company Name: Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.

Signature: Rita K. Nardin Date: 4/22/14

Typed Name and Title: Rita K. Nardin

Telephone (w/area code): 813-239-1136 Number (w/area code): 813-237-0851 or ritan@beltram.com

DATE DUE: PLEASE FAX TO PURCHASING NO LATER THAN TUESDAY, APRIL 22, 2014.

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction per the provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a).

PLEASE RETURN TO: DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
ATTN: Deb Mateo, Buyer

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O' LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 794-2227 (PHONE) (813) 794-2111 (FAX)

District School Board of Pasco County Bid Recommendation

Bid Title	Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System	Number of Vendors Notified	257
Bid Number	14-003-VJ	Number of Bids Distributed	22
Date Solicited	April 25, 2013	Number of Vendors Bidding	4
Date Opened	May 31, 2013	Number of Vendors Not Bidding	1
Date Board Presentation	June 18, 2013	Funding Source	Capital
Total Savings	N/A	Grand Total of Bid	\$1,827,955.00 Estimated 1 st Year

Recommendation:

Recommend acceptance of bid highlighted on the attached bid tabulation, as the lowest and best, responsive, responsible bidder meeting written specifications.

Term of Contract:

The intent of this bid is to establish a firm-fixed price between the District and a supplier for the purchase & installation of walk-in coolers, freezers, and wireless monitoring system "as needed" throughout the District. This is a one-year contract, with two subsequent one-year renewal periods, at the mutual agreement of the parties. The first year term will commence on June 19, 2013 and continue through June 18, 2014.

Notations and Exceptions:

Recommend rejection of bids received from Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc., SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, and Winston Industries for failure to submit pricing for Group A and Group B as specified in the bid document.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bid Evaluated By:

Barry Burgess, Equipment Specialist, Food & Nutrition Department

Bid Prepared By:

Deb Mateo, Interim Buyer, Purchasing Services

Reviewed and Authorized By:

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

District School Board of Pasco County
JUN 18 2013
Board Approved



Item or Total \$ Amt.

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
 BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Cooler/Freezer (Inside/Outside Building)					
Item 1	10' x 8' x 8'7" High (Inside Building)				
	Shelving: 4-24" x 60", 1-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 24-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$28,373.00	\$29,778.00	\$31,706.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$29,415.00	\$29,122.00	\$32,303.00	
	Total - Item 1	\$57,788.00	\$58,900.00	\$64,009.00	No Bid
Item 2	10' x 8' x 8'7" High (Outside Building)				
	Shelving: 4-24" x 60", 1-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 24-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$31,443.00	\$31,846.00	\$35,925.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$32,550.00	\$32,568.00	\$36,522.00	
	Total - Item 2	\$63,993.00	\$64,414.00	\$72,447.00	No Bid
Item 3	10' x 10' x 8'7" High (Inside Building)				
	Shelving: 3-24" x 36", 4-24" x 60", 28-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$30,345.00	\$30,693.00	\$33,675.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$32,054.00	\$31,939.00	\$34,151.00	
	Total - Item 3	\$62,399.00	\$62,632.00	\$67,826.00	No Bid
Item 4	10' x 10' x 8'7" High (Outside Building)				
	Shelving: 3-24" x 36", 4-24" x 60", 28-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$33,293.00	\$33,388.00	\$38,008.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$35,000.00	\$34,635.00	\$38,484.00	
	Total - Item 4	\$68,293.00	\$68,023.00	\$76,492.00	No Bid

District School Board
 of Pasco County

JUN 18 2013

 Board Approved

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
 BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltran Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Item 5	10' x 12' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 72", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$32,762.00	\$32,506.00	\$36,080.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$34,473.00	\$33,753.00	\$37,600.00	
	Total - Item 5	\$67,235.00	\$66,259.00	\$73,680.00	No Bid
Item 6	10' x 12' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 72", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$35,325.00	\$37,983.00	\$40,527.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$37,034.00	\$39,229.00	\$42,047.00	
	Total - Item 6	\$72,359.00	\$77,212.00	\$82,574.00	No Bid
Item 7	10' x 14' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$33,947.00	\$33,335.00	\$37,632.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$35,657.00	\$34,582.00	\$39,151.00	
	Total - Item 7	\$69,604.00	\$67,917.00	\$76,783.00	No Bid
Item 8	10' x 14' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$37,505.00	\$36,590.00	\$42,194.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$39,581.00	\$38,202.00	\$43,714.00	
	Total - Item 8	\$77,086.00	\$74,792.00	\$85,908.00	No Bid
Item 9	10' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$38,679.00	\$36,759.00	\$40,982.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$40,628.00	\$38,129.00	\$42,651.00	
	Total - Item 9	\$79,307.00	\$74,888.00	\$83,633.00	No Bid

District School Board
 of Pasco County
JUN 18 2013
 Board Approved

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
 BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m. BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed" BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. 6800 N. Florida Avenue Tampa, FL 33604	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc. 990 Harbor Lake Drive Safety Harbor, FL 34695	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies 1126 Lime Avenue Sarasota, FL 34237	Winston Industries 2345 Carton Drive Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Item 10	10' x 20' x 8'7" High (Outside Building)				
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$42,931.00	\$40,329.00	\$45,950.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$45,231.00	\$41,699.00	\$47,621.00	
	Total - Item 10	\$88,162.00	\$82,028.00	\$93,571.00	No Bid
Item 11	12' x 8' x 8'7" High (Inside Building)				
	Shelving: 7-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 32-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$30,049.00	\$30,458.00	\$33,281.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$32,098.00	\$32,005.00	\$34,087.00	
	Total - Item 11	\$62,147.00	\$62,463.00	\$67,368.00	No Bid
Item 12	12' x 8' x 8'7" High (Outside Building)				
	Shelving: 7-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 32-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$33,250.00	\$33,370.00	\$38,402.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$35,296.00	\$34,917.00	\$37,585.00	
	Total - Item 12	\$68,546.00	\$68,287.00	\$75,987.00	No Bid
Item 13	12' x 10' x 8'7" High (Inside Building)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$32,485.00	\$32,350.00	\$35,898.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$34,195.00	\$33,596.00	\$37,418.00	
	Total - Item 13	\$66,680.00	\$65,946.00	\$73,316.00	No Bid
Item 14	12' x 10' x 8'7" High (Outside Building)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$35,584.00	\$35,352.00	\$40,345.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$37,294.00	\$36,599.00	\$41,866.00	
	Total - Item 14	\$72,878.00	\$71,951.00	\$82,211.00	No Bid

District School Board
 of Pasco County
JUN 18 2013
 Board Approved

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Item 15	12' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$37,407.00	\$35,558.00	\$39,986.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$39,750.00	\$37,116.00	\$41,505.00	
	Total - Item 15	\$77,157.00	\$72,674.00	\$81,491.00	No Bid
Item 16	12' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$40,311.00	\$39,140.00	\$44,908.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$46,124.00	\$44,008.00	\$46,438.00	
	Total - Item 16	\$86,435.00	\$83,148.00	\$91,346.00	No Bid
Item 17	12' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$40,615.00	\$37,916.00	\$43,632.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$43,012.00	\$39,770.00	\$46,331.00	
	Total - Item 17	\$83,627.00	\$77,686.00	\$89,963.00	No Bid
Item 18	12' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$45,123.00	\$41,712.00	\$50,043.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$47,701.00	\$43,638.00	\$52,411.00	
	Total - Item 18	\$92,824.00	\$85,350.00	\$102,454.00	No Bid
Item 19	14' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$40,345.00	\$37,677.00	\$42,391.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$43,062.00	\$39,725.00	\$44,061.00	
	Total - Item 19	\$83,407.00	\$77,402.00	\$86,452.00	No Bid

District School Board
of Pasco County

JUN 18 2013

Board Approved

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
 BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Item 20	14' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$44,095.00	\$42,168.00	\$49,117.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$48,492.00	\$44,080.00	\$50,644.00	
	Total - Item 20	\$92,587.00	\$86,248.00	\$99,761.00	No Bid
Item 21	15' x 15' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$40,425.00	\$37,743.00	\$42,974.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$43,135.00	\$39,791.00	\$44,644.00	
	Total - Item 21	\$83,560.00	\$77,534.00	\$87,618.00	No Bid
Item 22	15' x 15' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$45,459.00	\$43,299.00	\$49,684.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$49,405.00	\$44,888.00	\$51,096.00	
	Total - Item 22	\$94,864.00	\$88,187.00	\$100,780.00	No Bid
Item 23	16' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$37,116.00	\$34,767.00	\$38,201.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$38,987.00	\$36,052.00	\$39,391.00	
	Total - Item 23	\$76,103.00	\$70,819.00	\$77,592.00	No Bid
Item 24	16' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$39,285.00	\$37,572.00	\$42,610.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$41,629.00	\$39,291.00	\$44,130.00	
	Total - Item 24	\$80,914.00	\$76,863.00	\$86,740.00	
Total "All-Or-None"		\$1,827,955.00	\$1,761,623.00	\$1,980,002.00	No Bid

District School Board
of Pasco County

JUN 18 2013

Board Approved

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
	Group B - Wireless Monitoring Equipment				
	E-Control System or Equal				
	Make	E-Controls			Kitchen Data System
	Model #	IntelliSense			KDS Guard
	PRICE per Unit	\$2,295.00	No Pricing	No Pricing	\$213.50
			*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B	*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B	*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B

District School Board
of Pasco County

JUN 18 2013

Board Approved