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October 16, 2012

MEMORANDUM

il Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent AAXW.
RE: Third Year of a Three-Year Contract

Bid 11-042-AF, Purchase & Installation of Storage Sheds
Superior Sheds, Inc. (Renewal)
Factory Direct Sheds LLC (Non-Renewal)

On December 21, 2010, official action (attached) was taken to award the bid to Superior Sheds,
Inc. and Factory Direct Sheds, LLC. for the Purchase & Installation of Storage Sheds Thisisa
three year bid renewable annually based upon mutual consent of both parties. The second year
of the contract will expire on December 31, 2012.

Considering services have been satisfactory, Superior Sheds, Inc. was contacted to verify their
willingness to enter into the third-year of the agreement. As such, Alex G. Martens, President,
has agreed in writing (attached), to enter into the third-year term of the contract. Further,
Factory Direct Sheds LLC has chosen not to renew. Documentation is on file in the Purchasing
Department for your review.

At this time, it is my recommendation to enter into the third-year term of the agreement with
Superior Sheds, Inc. The third year of the contract will cover the period January 1, 2013 through
December 31, 2013.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if I can be of further assistance, please feel
free to contact me at your earliest convenience.

MJW/dam
Attachments

District Wide Accreditation ® Southern Association of Colleges and Schools

Date/Time: October 10, 2012 09:12:00


Lora B. Lester
Typewritten Text
Date/Time:  October 10, 2012  09:12:00
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Heather Fiorentino, Superintendent wi. pasco.#12.flus
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Kendra Goodman, CPPQ, CPPB, Purchasing Agent
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727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484
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August 20, 2012
BID RENEWAL REQUEST
BID#: 11-042-AF
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Storaze Sheds

. Yes, Tagree to renew for the third year of athree year agreement for 11-042-AF under the same terms dnd conditions
for the period of January 1, 2013 and expire on December 31, 2013.

Ne, Ldo not agree to renew 11-042-AF

Company Name: Superior zf@ds, ine.
Signature; m—’" Date: ? /é /{ &

4 ;
Typed Name and Title; _ 4 [EX & M4 s mT 7 /ﬁ AL,

Telephone (w/area code); 386-774-9861  Fax Number (w/area code): 386-774-9862 or csibila@superiorsheds.com

DATE DUE: PLEASE FAX TO PURCHASING NO LATER THAN FRIDAY, 82417

By agreeing to renew, vendor acknowledges and agrees to be in compliance with the “Jessica Lunsford Aet”. Vendors
conducting business, with the District School Board of Pasce County, whe will (1) be at the school when students are present, or
(2) have direct contact with students, or {3) have access to or control of school funds must be Level 2 fingerprinted by Human
Resources. Hany of the above applies to this contract; you mast have those individuals Level 2 fingerprinted and screened by the
Districts Human Resource Department prior to commencement of services or work and must provide a list of employees with
renewal. Please contact 813/794-3521 10 arrange for an appointment. Costs assgciated with this background screening are to
borne by the vendor. You may access information regarding, this law through the internet link:
http:Helection, dos. state. flus/laws/05] lawsich 2003-028 pdf. This law became sffective September i, 2005.

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that neither it nor its principals are
presenily debairred, suspended, proposed for debarmerit, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this
transaction per the provisions of Florida Statute 287, 133¢2)(a).

PLEASE RETURN TO: DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD GF PASCO COUNTY
ATTN: Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

20430 GATOR LANE

LAND O° LAKES, FI. 34638

(813) 794-2227 (PHONE) (813) 794-2111 (FAX)

Disttics Wide Accreditation © Sonthem Association of Colleges and Schools




District School Board of Pasco County
Bid Recommendation

'Bid Title | Purchase & Installation of M Number of Vendors | 145
| Storage Sheds — Notified |
' “As—Needed”/ FEPC i ‘
Bnd Number | 11-042-AF - B NumberofBids | 35
. ‘ | Distributed
Date- - Ocitreberr20, 2010 - Number Of Veﬂdﬂl’sr - 7! e Hji
Solicited || Bidding "
Date Opened | November 30, 2010 2| Number of Formal “No | 0

| ' Presentation

' Recommendation: Rééoinméﬁ&%ccéﬁaﬁéé of bids as noted on attached bid tabulation sheet, as
' lowest and best, responsive and responsible “all-or-none” bid meeting written specifications for

Bid” Responses !
ﬁ_até Board  December 21,2010 ' Funding Source
Total Savings | Estimated for DSBPC -
$13,869.50 DSBPC
$20, 600

each region/group.

Term of Contract: This bid is for the purchase and installation of s storage sheds “as needed” for
use throughout the District. This is a three-year bid renewable annually based upon mutual

. agreement of both parties. The first year of this contract shall be effective from January 1, 2011

through December 31, 2011. The bid prices are firm and fixed for the first year of the contract

- and may be adjusted annually based on changes in the Producer Price Index of #WPU10250105.

Notations and Excebtlons This bid was solicited on behalf of the Florida Education Purchasing
- Consortium with the following school districts actively participating: Lake, Madison, and Pasco.

f The grand total for the bid and the savings provided above are for the District School Board of
| Pasco County only and do not include the other participating school districts.

| Savings were determined by averaging all bids submitted for the Central region and deducting the
' recommended awarded vendor’s bid. The bid savings are based on a quantity of 1 unit of each

; ‘Bids Evaluated By: Joe Scudiero, Chief B Building Official, Construction Services and Code

i

size.

| Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified

opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are
hereby rejected as late.

*Various fundmg sources: Capltal Federal, General, and Internal

Comphance

Pt e e .- S OE et S S| |

BldS Prepared By: Amy TFlack, Buyer Assistant, Purchasmg Department
Revnewed and Authorized By: Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasmg Agenﬁ,ﬁL |\ ,3

AR

District Sehoaol Board

Distriet 8ehool Board of Pasco County
of Pasco County
DEC 21 2010
DEC 2 0 2011
Board Approved

Board Approved

| ‘ ~ *See below
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds B Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 S. Volusia Ave. |
BID: # 11-042-AF Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10™ - )
ITEM# | QTY | SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed style" with aluminum lap siding | B N
| sides and roof with no overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,326.00 $1,346.00 $1,366.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1 6x10 $1,561.00 $1,581.00 $1,601.00 No Bid No Bid ‘No Bid
3 1 — ~ 8x8 $1,665.00 $1,685.00 $1,705.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 8x10 $2,002.00 $2,022.00 $2,042.00 B No Bid_ NoBid No Bid
5 1 8x12 $2,245.00 $2,265.00 $2,285.00 No Bid NoBid ~NoBid
6 | 1 | 10x 10 $2,422.00 $2,442.00 $2,462.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 ~10x12 $2,663.00 $2,683.00 $2,703.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1
8 1 10x 14 $1,301.00 $3,121.00 $3,141.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 1 10x 16 $3,439.00 $3,459.00 $3,479.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 1 B 10x 20 $4,001.00 $4,021.00 $4,041.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1 12x12 $3,233.00 $3,253.00 $3,273.00 ‘No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 [ 1 12x 14 $3,516.00 $3,536.00 . $3,556.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid }
13 1 12x16 $3,986.00 $4,006.00 $4,026.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 1 12 x 20 $4,736.00 $4,756.00 $4,776.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 | 1 - 12x24 | $5,685.00 $5,705.00 $5,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 1 12 x 30 $6,950.00 $6,970.00 $6,990.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid
17 | 1 14 x20 $6,089.00 $6,109.00 $6,129.00 | NoBid No Bid ~ NoBid
18 1 14 x 24 $7,261.00 $7,281.00 $7,301.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 1 14 x 30 $9,024.00 $9,034.00 $9,054.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 | 1 ~ 14x40 $12,150.00 $12,170.00 $12,190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Bid Price for Western Region, Group 1
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $262,335.00* / $260,545.00*" No Bid
T oom 22
® (| oa
a _ =8 Distriet 8ahool Board
> X 3@ of Pasco County
= i oy
= 0
g B 23 DEC 2 0 2011
@ = 59
=% = < S
a Board Approved
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds B Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road 2323 8. Volusia Ave. ]
BID: # 11-042-AF , _ Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763 ]
**Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH [ TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
- Standard "shed style™ with aluminum lap siding -
] sides and roof with no overhang i
1 1 6x8 $1,108.00 $1,128.00 $1,148.00 No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
2 [ 1| 6x10 $1,354.00 $1,374.00 $1,394.00 No Bid No Bid $1,330.00
3 1 8x8 $1,455.00 $1,465.00 $1,485.00 No Bid No Bid $1,350.00
4 1 8x10 B $1,738.00 $1,758.00 $1,778.00 No Bid No Bid $1,490.00
5 1| 8x12 $1,951.00 $1,971.00 $1,991.00 No Bid No Bid $1,720.00
6 1 ~10x10 $2,104.00 $2,124.00 $2,144.00 No Bid No Bid $1,745.00
7 1 10x12 B $2,313.00 $2,333.00 $2,353.00 No Bid No Bid $1,895.00
8 1 10x14 ~ $2,733.00 $2,753.00 $2,773.00 No Bid No Bid $2,050.00
9 | 1 | 10x 16 $2,998.00 ~ $3,018.00 $3,038.00 No Bid No Bid $2,285.00
10 1 10x20 $3,478.00 $3,498.00 ~ $3,518.00 No Bid No Bid $2,695.00
11 1 12x12 $2,820.00 $2,830.00 $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid $2,185.00
12 1 | 12x 14 $3,056.00 $3,076.00 . $3,096.00 No Bid No Bid $2,400.00
13 1 12x16 ) $3,468.00 $3,488.00 $3,518.00 No Bid No Bid $2,600.00
14 1 12 x 20 $4,105.00 $4,125.00 $4,145.00 No Bid No Bid $3,140.00
15 1. 12x 24 $4,945.00 $4,965.00 $4,985.00 No Bid No Bid $3,475.00
16 1] 12 x 30 $6,046.00 ~ $6,066.00 $6,086.00 No Bid No Bid $4,140.00
17 1 14 x 20 $5,086.00 $5,106.00 $5,126.00 No Bid No Bid $3,840.00
18 | 1 ~ 14x24 ) $6,090.00 $6,110.00 $6,130.00 No Bid No Bid $4,320.00
19 1 14 x 30 $7,576.00 $7,596.00 $7,616.00 No Bid No Bid $5,400.00
20 1 14 x 40 $10,260.00 $10,280.00 $10,300.00 No Bid No Bid $6,610.00
' Total Bid Price for Northern Region, Group 1
|Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
\through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $225,222.00 $55,715.00* ] $55,740.00*
i | g
m T 22 e
2 © 33 i 9.§
& o 2w 2 32
& .. 6% no 8@
T T o8 s -~ °%
g 3 &g i - 28
8 23 § = 38
a S = =B
a
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCQO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

_ Superior Sheds, Inc.

2323 8. Volusia Ave.

BID: # 11-042-AF

*Board Meeting 12/21/10% _

~ Palm City, FL 34990-0770

Orange City, FL 32763

ITEM# | QTY - ~ SIZE/DESCRIPTION | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed style” with aluminum lap siding -
| sides and roof with no overhang |
1 1 6x8 $1,039.00 $1,059.00 $1,079.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,020.00
2 1 6x10 | $1,223.00 $1,243.00 $1,263.00 No Bid No Bid $1,265.00
3 1 - 8x8 $1,306.00 $1,326.00 $1,346.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,285.00
4 1 8x10 $1,561.00 $1,581.00 $1,611.00 No Bid No Bid $1,420.00
| 5 1 8x12 - ~ $1,764.00 ~ $1,784.00 $1,804.00 No Bid No Bid $1,635.00
6 | 1 10x10 $1,903.00 $1,923.00 | $1,943.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,660.00
7 1 10x 12 $2,093.00 $2,113.00 $2,133.00 No Bid No Bid $1,810.00
8 1 10x14 $2,443.00 $2,463.00 $2,483.00 No Bid No Bid $1,940.00
9 1 10x 16 $2,711.00 - $2,731.00 $2,751.00 No Bid No Bid $2,175.00
10 1 - 10x20 $3,231.00 $3,251.00 $3,211.00 | No Bid No Bid $2,575.00
11 1 | 12x12 $2,540.00 $2,560.00 $2,580.00 No Bid No Bid $2,085.00
12 1 ] 12 x 14 $2,760.00 $2,780.00 - $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $2,295.00
13 1 12x 16 $3,161.00 $3,181.00 $3,211.00 No Bid No Bid $2,485.00
14 1 12x 20 $3,723.00 $3,743.00 $3,763.00 No Bid No Bid $2,995.00
15 1 12x24 $4,478.00 $4,498.00 $4,518.00 No Bid No Bid $3,365.00
16 1 12x30 $5,470.00 $5,490.00 $5,510.00 No Bid No Bid $3,985.00
17 1 14 x 20 - | $4,715.00 $4,735.00 $4,755.00 No Bid No Bid $3,695.00
18 1 B 14 x 24 $5,610.00 5,630.00 $5,650.00 No Bid No Bid $4,150.00
19 1 14 x 30 | 36948.00 6,968.00 $6,988.00 No Bid No Bid $5,195.00
20 1 14 x 40 ‘ $9,343.00 9,363.00 $9,383.00 No Bid No Bid $6,360.00
o i
Total Bid Price for Central Region, Group 1
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $214,146.00% / $205,226.00** $53,395.00
e 2 o8 g B of
=] — - ™ .
2 O wvg 2 3%
a ] a ®
s 0 2@ = 2 8
g . °% 2 o 2
= 08 i Qs
e ro 62 2 o 2=
3 S 5o g =2 3¢
a = 28 2 = <a
a o
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds

_ Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

BID: # 11-042-AF

Superior Sheds, Inc.

2323 S. Volusia Ave.

Palm City, FL 34990-0770

Orange City, FL 32763

**Board Meeting 12121/10*

| TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH

Page 4 of 9

ITEN# | QTY | SIZE/DESCRIPTION | TOTALPRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Standard "shed style™ with aluminum lap siding o a
sides and roof with no overhang |
1 1 6x8 $1,063.00 $1,083.00 $1,103.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,070.00
2 1 B 6x10 $1,300.00 $1,320.00 $1,340.00 No Bid No Bid $1,330.00
3 1 8x8 ~ $1,387.00 $1,407.00 $1,427.00 No Bid No Bid $1,350.00
4 10 8x10 $1,738.00 $1,758.00 $1,778.00 No Bid No Bid $1,490.00
5 1 - 8x12 $1,863.00 $1,883.00 $1,913.00 No Bid No Bid $1,720.00
6 1 10x 10 ~ $2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2,060.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,745.00
7 1 10x12 $2,222.00 $2,242.00 B $2,262.00 No Bid No Bid $1,895.00
8 1 | 10x14 $2,588.00 $2,608.00 - $2,628.00 No Bid No Bid $2,050.00
9 1 10x16 $2,861.00 $2,881.00 $2,911.00 No Bid No Bid $2,285.00
10 1 10x 20 - $3,341.00 $3,361.00 ) $3,381.00 No Bid No Bid $2,695.00
11 1 12x12 $2,699.00 $2,719.00 $2,739.00 No Bid No Bid $2,185.00
12 1 o 12x14 $2,955.00 $2,975.00 - $2,975.00 | No Bid No Bid $2,400.00
13 1 12x16 $3,341.00 $3,361.00 $3,381.00 No Bid No Bid $2,600.00
14 1 . 12x20 $3,956.00 $3,976.00 $3,996.00 No Bid No Bid $3,140.00
15 1 12x24 - $4,726.00 $4,746.00 $4,766.00 No Bid No Bid $3,475.00
16 1 12 x30 $5,808.00 $5,828.00 $5,848.00 No Bid No Bid $4,140.00
17 1 14 x 20 ~55247.00 $5,267.00 $5,287.00 No Bid No Bid $3,840.00
18 1 - 14 x 24 $6,077.00 $6,097.00 $6,117.00 No Bid No Bid $4,320.00
19 | 1 14 x 30 $7,637.00 $7,657.00 $7,677.00 No Bid No Bid $5,400.00
20 1 14 x 40 $10,199.00 $10,219.00 $10,239.00 No Bid No Bid $6,610.00
Total Bid Price for Southern Region, Group
1 Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Shed Style") $220,284.00 $55,715.00* / $55,740.00**
i L= ,, =
2 T of g m 2
8 O 3§ g O
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

Factory Direct Buildings, LLC

|BID TITLE: Storage Sheds
BID: # 11-042-AF

Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road

Palm City, FL 34990-0770

Superior Sheds, Inc.

2323 S. Volusia Ave.

Orange City, FL 32763

**Board Meeting 12/21/10**

TEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH_| TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
|
1 "Eave style” with aluminum lap siding sides and | - =i
roof with 4" overhang )
1 1 6x8 $1,367.00 $1,387.00 $1,407.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1 6x10 - $1,609.00 $1,629.00 $1,649.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
| 3 1 8§x8 $1,716.00 $1,736.00 $1,756.00 No Bid | No Bid No Bid
4 1 8x10 $2,063.00 $2,083.00 $2,103.00 No Bid i No Bid No Bid
5 1 8x12 - $2,313.00 $2,333.00 $2,353.00 No Bid : No Bid No Bid
6 1 10x10 $2,495.00 $2,515.00 $2,535.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 10x12 $2,744.00 $2,764.00 $2,784.00 No Bid ~_No Bid No Bid
8 1 10x14 $3,195.00 $3,215.00 $3,235.00 “No Bid B No Bid No Bid
9 1 10x 16 $2,513.00 $2,533.00 $2,553.00 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
| 10 1 10 x 20 $4,122.00 $4,142.00 $4,162.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 T 12x12 $3,331.00 $3,351.00 $3,371.00 NoBid No Bid ' No Bid
12 1 12 x 14 $3,622.00 $3,642.00 . $3,662.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid
13 1 | 12x16 $4,106.00 $4,126.00 $4,146.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 | 1 B ~ 12x20 $4,891.00 $4,899.00 $4,919.00 ~ NoBid No Bid NoBid
15 1 12 x 24 $5,856.00 $5,876.00 $5,896.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 | 1 ~ 12x30 - $7,159.00 $7,181.00 $7,199.00 ~ NoBd No Bid ' No Bid_ 1
17 1 14 x 20 $6,273.00 $6,293.00 $6,313.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 1 14 x 24 $7,480.00 $7,500.00 $7,520.00 B No Bid ~ No Bid NoBid
19 1 - 14x30 $9,285.00 $9,305.00 $9,325.00 No Bid No Bid ) No Bid
20 | 1 14 x 40 $125,515.00 $25,535.00 $12,555.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Total Bid Price for Western Region, Group 2
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style") $267,129.00* / $393,143.00** No Bid
- =4 N =
2 m 22 g m of
8 O w3 g 7 »3
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCQ COUNTY BID TABULATION

paaoiddy pieog

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM | Factory Direct Buildings, LLC ) | B Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds N Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road f_ 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF ) | Palm City, FL 34990-0770 | Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10** | \
ITEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
"Eave style" with aluminum lap siding sides and T B
roof with 4" overhang 1 -
1 1 B _ 6x8 - | $1,142.00 ~ $1,162.00 $1,182.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,110.00
2 1 6x10 $1,396.00 $1,416.00 I $1,436.00 No Bid No Bid $1,380.00
| 3 1 - 8x8 | $1,490.00 $1,510.00 $1,530.00 No Bid No Bid $1,400.00
4 1 8x10 $1.791.00 |  §1,811.00 $1,831.00 No Bid No Bid $1,550.00
5 1 8x12 ] $2,011.00 ~ $2,031.00 ~ $2,051.00 No Bid No Bid $1,790.00
6 1 10x 10 $2,168.00 $2,188.00 $2,208.00 il No Bid No Bid $1,815.00
7 1 10x 12 ' $2,384.00 $2,404.00 $2,424.00 No Bid No Bid $1,965.00
8 1 10 x 14 ~_$2,901.00 $2,921.00 ~ $2,941.00 No Bid No Bid $2,100.00
9 1 10x 16 i $3,089.00 $3,109.00 $3,129.00 No Bid No Bid $2,375.00
10 1 10 x 20 $3,584.00 ~ $3,604.00 $3,624.00 No Bid No Bid $2,800.00
11 1 12x12 $3,805.00 $2,915.00 $2,935.00 No Bid No Bid $2,275.00
12 | 1 - 12x 14 i $3,149.00 $3,165.00 . $3,189.00 No Bid No Bid $2,495.00
13 [ 1 12 x 16 $3,583.00 $3,603.00 $3,623.00 No Bid No Bid $2,700.00
14 1 12x 20 | $4,229.00 $4,249.00 ) $4,269.00 No Bid No Bid $3,265.00
15 1 | 12x24 $5,248.00 | $5,268.00 $5,288.00 No Bid No Bid $3,595.00
16 1 12 x 30 | $6,228.00 $6,248.00 _$6,268.00 No Bid No Bid $4,300.00
17 1 14 x 20 $5,239.00 $5,259.00 $5,279.00 No Bid No Bid $3,995.00
18 1 - 14x24 $6,273.00 $6,293.00 $6,313.00 No Bid No Bid $4,495.00
19 | 1 14 x 30 | $7,804.00 $7,824.00 _ $7,844.00 No Bid No Bid $5,620.00
20 | 1 | 14 x 40 $10,569.00 |  $10,589.00 $10,609.00 No Bid No Bid $6,875.00
Total Bid Price for Northern Region, Group 2|
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1 |
[through 20 listed above for "Eave Style") | $232,869.00* / $233,715.00™" $57,900.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM - Factory Direct Buildings, LLC . ~___ Superior Sheds, Inc. ]
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds B | ) Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road . 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF - Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITENMZ | QTY ] SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
|
"Eave style" with aluminum lap siding sides and
roof with 4" overhang
1 1 6x8 $1,074.00 $1,094.00 $1,114.00 No Bid No Bid $1,060.00
2 | 1 B 6x10 - ~ $1,261.00 $1,281.00 $1,301.00 No Bid No Bid $1,315.00
3 1 8x8 $1,346.00 _ $1,366.00 i $1,386.00 No Bid No Bid $1,335.00
4 1 8x10 $1,619.00 $1,639.00 | $1,659.00 No Bid No Bid $1,475.00
5 | 1 8x12 $1,818.00 - $1,838.00 $1,858.00 No Bid No Bid $1,700.00
6 1 10x10 $1,961.00 - $1,981.00 $2,001.00 No Bid No Bid $1,725.00
7 11 10x12 ' $2,156.00 $2,176.00 $2,196.00 No Bid No Bid $1,885.00
8 |1 10x 14 ] . $2,517.00 $2,537.00 $2,557.00 No Bid No Bid $2,020.00
9 1 10x 16 $2,793.00 i $2,813.00 ] $2,833.00 No Bid No Bid $2,260.00
10 1 10x 20 $3,267.00 $3,287.00 ~ $3307.00 No Bid No Bid $2,675.00
111 12x12 $2,617.00 $2,637.00 $2,657.00 No Bid No Bid $2,195.00
12 1 12x 14 $2,844.00 $2,864.00 - $2,884.00 No Bid No Bid $2,410.00
13 1 12x 16 $3,262.00 $3,282.00 - $3,307.00 No Bid No Bid $2,930.00
14 1 . 12x20 B $3,835.00 $3,855.00 $3,875.00 No Bid No Bid $3,150.00
15 1 12 x24 $4,614.00 | $4,634.00 ! ~ $4,654.00 B No Bid No Bid $3,550.00
16 1 | ~12x30 _ - $5,635.00 $5,655.00 ] $5,675.00 No Bid No Bid $4,185.00
17 1 14x 20 $4,858.00 | $4,878.00 $4,898.00 No Bid No Bid $3,885.00
18 1 14 x 24 B $5,179.00 $5,799.00 $5,819.00 No Bid No Bid $4,375.00
19 | 1 14 x 30 ] B $7,157.00 $7,177.00 $7,197.00 No Bid No Bid $5,500.00
20 1 14 x 40 $9,624.00 - 1$9,644.00 ~ $9,664.00 No Bid No Bid $6,695.00
Total Bid Price for Central Region, Group 2
Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style") $211,326.00* / $210,716.00** $56,325.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATICN

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds ] Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road ) 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF - Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITEM# | QTY SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
"Eave style" with aluminum lap siding sides and
roof with 4" overhang i
1 1 6x8 $1,093.00 $1,113.00 $1,136.00 B No Bid No Bid $1,110.00
2 1 6x10 $1,340.00 $1,360.00 $1,380.00 No Bid No Bid $1,380.00
3 1 | 8x8 ~ $1,429.00 | $1,449.00 $1,469.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,400.00
4 1 8x10 $1,789.00 $1,811.00 $1,831.00 No Bid No Bid $1,550.00
5 1 8x12 i $1,830.00 $1,850.00 $1,870.00 No Bid No Bid $1,790.00
6 | 1 10x10 $2,081.00 $2,101.00 | $2,121.00 No Bid No Bid $1,815.00
7 1 10x12 ' $2,289.00 $2,309.00 $2,329.00 No Bid No Bid $1,965.00
8 1 10x 14 - $2,666.00 $2,686.00 | $2,706.00 No Bid No Bid $2,100.00
9 | 1 10x 16 - $2,958.00 $2,978.00 $2,998.00 | No Bid No Bid $2,375.00
10 1 10x 20 $3,442.00 | $3.462.00 $3,482.00 No Bid No Bid $2,800.00
11 1 12x12 $2,781.00 $2,801.00 $2,821.00 No Bid No Bid $2,275.00
12 1 B B 12 x 14 B $3,024.00 $3,044.00 . $3,064.00 | No Bid No Bid $2,495.00
13 1 12x 16 $3,442.00 $3,462.00 ~ $3,482.00 No Bid No Bid $2,700.00
14 1 12x20 $4,075.00 $4,095.00 $4,115.00 No Bid No Bid $3,265.00
15 1 12x24 ~ $54868.00 $4,888.00 ~$4,908.00 No Bid No Bid $3,595.00
16 1 12x 30 o $5,983.00 $6,003.00 $6,023.00 No Bid No Bid $4,300.00
17 1 14 x 20 $5,405.00 $5,425.00 $5,445.00 No Bid No Bid $3,995.00
18 | 1 14 x 24 1 $6,260.00 $6,280.00 [ $6,300.00 | No Bid No Bid $4,495.00
19 1 14x30 $7,867.00 $7,887.00 ‘ $7,907.00 No Bid No Bid $5,620.00
20 1 14 x 40 $10,506.00 $10,526.00 _ $10,546.00 No Bid No Bid $6,875.00
Total Bid Price for Southern Region, Group
2 Total (Adding all prices for 60 items, 1
through 20 listed above for "Eave Style") | $199,599.00* / $226,591.00** $57,900.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: November 30, 2010 @ 2:30 PM Factory Direct Buildings, LLC Superior Sheds, Inc.
BID TITLE: Storage Sheds - ~ Box 770, 560 SW Mapp Road - 2323 S. Volusia Ave.
BID: # 11-042-AF - Palm City, FL 34990-0770 Orange City, FL 32763
**Board Meeting 12/21/10**
ITEM# | QTY - SIZE/DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 130MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 140MPH | TOTAL PRICE - 150MPH
Options: (Not considered in bid award)
Pricing to be consistent for both Group 1
and 2 for all regions. SIZE EACH PRICE SIZE EACH PRICE
Small Vent (peak end) 12x12 $37.25 16" x 4" $15.00
Large Vent (peak end) 12x18 $42.60 12" x 12" $40.00
Small Window 24 x 27 $69.00 22" x 27" $60.00
N ) ~ Large Window 24 x 36 $75.00 46" x 27" $80.00
Additional 48" x 72" Door $138.00 $235.00
72" x 72" Double Doors $260.00 $325.00
96" x 72" Double Doors $280.00 No Bid
N | 9'x7 Garage Door $500.00 $510.00
| 8' x 7' Garage Door $470.00 $510.00
6' Roll-Up Door $500.50 ~ $410.00
8' Roll-Up Door $550.00 $510.00
48" Aluminum Ramp - No Bid No Bid
60" Aluminum Ramp No Bid No Bid
108" Aluminum Ramp No Bid No Bid
I Electrical Options: EACH PRICE EACH PRICE
One (1) overhead light, one (1) switch, one (1) outl $100.00 $65.00
| - Extra outlet (limit 2} $50.00 $30.00
- Extra overhead light (limit 2) $60.00 $40.00
|
- ) *Vendor Math Error - - }‘
“*Total calculated by the District
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