DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt S. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O’ Lakes Boulevard ¢ Land O’ Lakes, Florida 34638

Department of Purchasing

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent
813/794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2111

T271774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484
352/524-2221 email: mwoodall@pasco.k12.fl.us

November 5, 2013

MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agemw
F

SUBJECT: RFP 13-043-SB Science & Classroom Catalog Discount
Second Year of a Three-Year Contract
Science Supply Vendors-
Frey Scientific, Sargent-Welch, and Ward’s Science
Classroom Supply Vendors-
Kaplan Early Learning Company, Lakeshore Materials, and The Learning Station

Direct Negotiation 13-043-DN Science & Classroom Catalog Discount
Second Year of a Three-Year Contract

Classroom Supply Vendors-

John R. Green Company and School Specialty

On December 18, 2012 and February 5, 2013, official action (attached) was taken to award the
above-referenced contracts to Frey Scientific, John R. Green Company, Kaplan Early Learning
Company, Lakeshore Learning Materials, Sargent-Welch, School Specialty, The Learning Station
and Ward’s Science. The RFP is a three-year contract, renewable annually based upon mutual
consent of the parties. The first year of the contracts will expire on December 31, 2013.

Considering services have been satisfactory, the above-referenced vendors were contacted to
determine their willingness to enter into the second year of the contracts. As such, they have
agreed in writing (attached) to do so.

It is my recommendation at this time to enter into the second year of the contracts with the vendors
noted above. The contract period will be January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014. The

anticipated expenditures for the second year period are $500,000 and will be paid out of General
Funds.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if I can be of further assistance, please feel
free to contact me at your earliest convenience.

MIW/mv
Attachments
Date/Time: October 30, 2013 8:38:00

(813) 794-2000 e (352) 524-2000 e (727) 774-2000 e www.pasco.k12.fl.us
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PAsco COUNTY
Kurt 8. Browhing, Superintendent of Schgols

7227 Land O" Lakes Boulevard = Land O Lakes, Fiorida 34638

Purchasing Services

‘Michael ). \Wootall, CPPQ; Pirchasing Agent

B3 794-2221  Fax 813/ 7942111
72717742221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484

3621 824-2221  e-mail: mwoodali@pasco.k12.f.us

BIG RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Science:and Classroom Catalog ,

"/ L Yes; | agree fo renew BID # 13-043-SB under the same{erms and
cenditions as fhe exi ing-agreement. The second year period shall be
from January 1, 2014:‘thmugh December 31, 20614.

No, | do ot agree-te-renew BID. # 13-043-SB.

COMPANY NAME: Freu Sienbifie, o dpasim 6f Defta tdurghon JpL
SIGNATURE: __ /7 /W é%( S

TYPED NAME AND TITLE: /d - K/ﬁfﬁ M{Kw’ ) /{‘55/-%_ _ SﬁO“a?é“V

| AREA CODE): __ /D~ 23"—3‘ i i /

FAX NUMBER @NITHAREA CopE): _900-295 - 7574

Esmait _ Scionte Dids. frey D \Pa/)ﬁn/m//’/ 4,/7’1/ W))id

DATE: ) / J 3/ [3

The prospectwe bidder certﬁfles by subriission and signature of thisbid renewal form, that.

'nci‘pals are presently debarred suspended proposed for dabarment
o;untarl!y exciude.d from: participatmn inthis transaction per the

TELEPHONE (W

Disetict Witie: Accreditation * Southern Assoctation of Colleges andSchoals:




DIsTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASco COUNTY

Kurt 8, Browning, Superintendent of Schools

p 7227 Land O Lakes Boulevard » Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221  Fax: 813/734-2111

727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 524-2221  e-mail: mwoodall@pasco.k12.fl.us

BID RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Classroom Catalog

e

Yes, | agree to renew BID # 13-043-DN under the same terms and
conditions as the existing agreement. The second year period shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014.

No, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-DN.

COMPANY NAME: _ Joha K (Greea (o 0!54} (yreen éfovw Edt (e
SIGNATURE: W%W— '

Lz
TYPED NAME AND TITLE: __/liebacd _ Gr e Diectec

TELEPHONE (WITH AREA CODE): Foo- 359- 9Z3F

FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA CODE): ___ K@ — ¥ 3- [F2/(
E-MAIL: michaclgreen @ john roreence. Com
= = -

DATE: lo- 22~ 2713

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that
neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment,
declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction per the
provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a).

PLEASE EMAIL BACK TO: mvelez@pasco.k12.fl.us
DISTRICT SCHOCL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

ATTENTION: Monica Velez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O’ LAKES, FL 348638
(813) 794-2222 (PHONE)
(813) 794-2111 (FAX)

District Wide Accreditation ® Southern Association of Colleges and Schools



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt 8. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O Lakes Boulevard = Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent
B13/794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2111
72717742221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 524-2221  e-mail: mwoodal@pasco.k12.fl.us

BID RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Scisnce and Classroom Catalog

Yes, | agree to renew BID # 13-043-8B under the same terms and
conditions as the existing agreement. The second year period shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014.

Ne, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-8B.

COMPANY NAME: Kaplan Farly Learning Company
SIGNATURE: ‘:“*f”’)érfﬁé ii\i‘gﬂu e,

TYPED NAME AND TITLE: Kate Shelton " Bids/Contracts Manager

TELEPHONE (WITH AREA CODE): __ 800-334-2014

FAX NUMBER (WITH AREACODE): __336-712-2241%3

E-MAIL bids@kaplanco.com

DATE: 10/22/14

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that
neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment,
declared Ineligible, or voluntarlly excluded from participation In this transaction per the
provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a}.

PLEASE EMAIL BACK TO: mvelez@pasco.ki2.flus
DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

ATTENTION: Monica Velez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 794-2222 (PHONE)
(813) 794-2111 (FAX)

Disteict Wide Accreditation ® Southern Association of Colleges and Schools



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt 8. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O Lakes Boulevard « Land O’ Lakes, Florida 34838

Purchasing Services

Michael J. Woodali, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 794-2111

7271 774-2221  TDD: 813/794-2484

352/ 524-2221  e-mall: mwoodali@pasco.k12.fl.us

BID RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Science and Classroom Catalog

v Yes, | agree to renew BID # 13-043-58 under the same terms and
conditions as the existing agreement. The second year period shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 21, 2014.

No, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-SB.

COMPANY NAME: Lakeshore Learning Materials
SIGNATURE: C}A@K/
TYPED NAME AND TITLE: Ashley Bicanek, Bid Coordinator

TELEPHONE (WITH AREA CODE): ___ (800) 421-5354

FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA CODE): _ (310) 537-7990

E-MAIL:  biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

DATE: __10/22/2013

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that
neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment,
deciared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation In this transaction per the
provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a).

PLEASE EMAIL BACK TO: mvelez@pasco.k12.flL.us
DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

ATTENTION: Monica Velez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O’ LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 794-2222 (PHONE)
(813} 794-2111 (FAX)

District Wide Accreditation ® Southern Association of Colleges and Schools



10/22/2013 16:23 FAX 800 6762540 SARGENT-WELCH dool

DiIsTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt 8. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O’ Lakes Boulevard = Land O’ Lakes, Florida 34638

Purchasing Services

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221  Fax: 813/ 794-2111

T27] 774-2221  TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 524-2221  e-mail: mwoodall@pasco.k12.fl.us

BiD RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Science and Classroom Cataloo

/ Yes, | agree to renew BID # 13-043-SB under the same terms and
conditions as the existing agreement. The secand year period shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014,

No, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-81.

COMPANY NAME: Sal’gent-Welch/VWR

SIGNATURE: &Mféw

TYPED NAME AND TITLE: [@i}y KL{WT 31D SALES rMAAGK.
TELEPHONE (WITH AREA cODE): &4 7- %5 l{Bo

FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA COPE): 800 - €14 ~0607)
E-MAIL: __Fay. KufFeldt@vwir c opn
DATE: j©o-22-13

The nrospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renswal forma, that

nelther it nor its principals are gfwwnnﬂy deharred, suspended, oroposed for debarment,
declared insligible, or voluntarily sxcluded from partmapmaau in this transaction per the
provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2){a).

PLEASE EMAIL BACK TO: mvelez@pasco. ki2.flL.us
ISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
ATTENTION: Monica Yelez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE

L.j"u\iD Y 1 f\ FH’—F‘—'C" :L'w ':7 A ‘- ‘)t

Dlieteiot Wide deneadivatlan o Sopurbioin Ao ointion \.Vrru:!ﬁ.__‘. el )

t0/22/72013 TUE 18:18 [TX/RX NO 62001



10/23/2013 03:31 Fa¥ 770 510 7237 SCHOOL SPECTALTY #001/001

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PAscO COUNTY

Kurt S, Browning, Superintendent of Schools

A 7227 Land O Lakes Boulevard = Land O' Lakes, Flornda 34638

Furchasing Servicas

Michaal J. Waodall, CPPQ, Purchasing Agenl

813/ 794-2221 Fax: B13/734-2111

727/ 774-2227 TDD: 813/ 794-24R4

362/ 524-2221 e-mall; mwoodall@pasco k12.fl.us

BID RENEWAL REQUEST

BID TITLE: Clazsroom Cataloqg

Yes, | agree to renaw BID # 13-043-DN under the same terms and
conditions s the existing agreement. The sacond year pariod shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014,

Na, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-DN.

COMPANY NAME: _ School Sm /

SIGNATURE:

TYPED NAME AND TlTLE:/’éGood;an Bid Manager
L

TELEPHONE (WITH AREA CODE): _R88-388.3774

FAX NUMBER (W(/TH AREA CODE): __ 883-386-6344

E-MAIL: _ bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

DATE: 10/23/2013

The prospective bidder certiflas, by submiszion and signatura of thiz bid renawal form, that
neither it nor its pnnclpals are presef\liy debara ed, su muu wupusau for debarmant,

—- —daglared-ineligible, or voluntarity===¢ wthils transaction per the ——
provislons of Florida Statute 287,133(2)(a).

PLEASE EMAIL BACK TO: mvelez@pasco.k12.fl.us
DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD QF PASCO COUNTY

ATTENTION: Monica Velez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE

LAND Q' LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 794-2222 (PHONE)
(813) 794-2111 (FAX)

In/2a720713 WED 09 .48 [TH/SRE HO B203 @ 0ol
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUN"I"V
Fart 8, Browning, Superiitendent o) Buhwgls

7147 Lanid O Lukey Boulevand « Lurt O Likes, Flonda $ae3s : |
|
|

1 ijrehssing Servicas
Vihaal J, Woadal, CPPQ, Purehasing AGent

A THE-Z222Y  Fax 813/ 784.81°1

Pe7/ T7a-22219  TDD. 81Y 791.2484

4 Baaddet  email mwoosalidpunce k2.0 us

!
| BID RENEWAL REQUESY
j BID TITLE: Belence and Glansroom Cataton

Yar, | 2piee o enew BID € 13-043-38 under tha same rerms and
conrditiona a3 tha exéing agreement, The gacond yean panod shall be . '
frarm January 1, 2014 through Deecsmber 31, 2014, ; . !

Na | do not agraa (o rnnnw 8D # 13-043-3B

dampany bavE T he Lea rn. ng J\T-Fq ] s
ONATURE: 7

[

Y PED NAME AND TITLE }/ _Bancy deitany  Vice Presldent
FLEPHIONE (WITH AREA GCDE) 7:217—848-— &/a9. . oo~ g 3 B 073
rpX NUMBER (WIT AREA CODEY 27 = Be8—- £l 9 |

het o

—3

e

{

BMAIL l.eavrn iy qS“"Tor“t? @ Veyr)=or

daree 20 )22)75
|

B lll!hl?.hﬂlﬂr AT i aEwiiLty o Tﬂﬂ ﬂuﬁ‘jallﬂlﬂﬂ plip\jbvi:rU foradsosT : . =
clared ineligibke, or voiuntarily sxcluded from pﬁﬂic!pﬂtlon It this traraaction per the
pravislons of Fiodds Statule 58T 135(5Ma).

Ee proar:e-..t?ve b[ddar nsrlifies, by B:.émwa-mon and signaturs of Thig hid tanwwﬂ ‘?uuv,‘ that
._ @ d

IR EASE EMAIL BACK TO: myeiez@pasco. k12 f.us 1

; NSTRICT SCHOOU BOARD OF PASCD COLINTY i '
| ATTENTION: Monlca Velez :
FURCHASING DEPARTMENT ,

20430 GATOR LANE :

_ANuG LAKES, FL 34638

(B4 1-2222 (PHONE)

TEAd 2444 !F'J-a:k
T ]

A B U L R . T T S A iy v

Tog2a 2008 WED 100371 [THARY WO B205]1 Qoo



10/23/2013 WED 8:38 TFaAX 585 321+0372 [dool/001

DIsTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kuit 8. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard « Land Q’ Lakes, Florida 340638

FPurchasing Services

Michael J. Woodall, CPPQO, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 724-2111

727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 524-2221 e-mait. mwoodall@pasco. k12.flus

BID RENEWAL REQUEST
BID TITLE: Science and Classvoom Catalogy

_— Z Yes, | agree to renew BID # 13-043-SB under lhe same terms and

conditions as the existing agreement  The second year peried shall be
from January 1, 2014 through December 311, 2014,

e No, | do not agree to renew BID # 13-043-S8.

\/ Atern onal,
)Nl'hf-:; \M-Jrr{'

ITCA l

SIGNATURE: Q/X C'7['Z( @(J(’M .

TYPED NAME ANP TITLE: LM@(\Q’V}O ﬂ)//ﬂ’ S)V/AZ@_@?O
TELEPHONE/(WTH AREA CODE): W Qéﬂ& «?&éﬂO -
FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA CODE): 877 &) - 0/7//;

E-MAIL: h//( M//ﬂ/?/’/f C Vi . (20

pate: _[D-F-15

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this bid renewal form, that
neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debariment,
declaredineligible, or voluntasiy-sselededdsmaaatislaation in this fransaction per the—
provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2){a).

COMPANY NAME

DISTRICT SCHOQL BOARD OF PAS(‘O COUNTY
ATTENTION: Monica Velez
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O LAKES, FL 346558

-2222 (PHONE)

-2 (FAX)

10/23/201% WED 08:56 [TTX/RX NO 620171 oo



District School Board of Pasco County
Bid Recommendation

RFPTltle Science and Classroom Number of Vendors 413
i Supplies — “As-Needed” Notified
Basis

Nuiﬁi;\éi;\ prfobd,sal,s R AR bR TR AT Aquv:ml..O'? e

?mRFP e T TY
Distributed

Number of Vendors 12
Proposing

Number of “No Bid” 5
Vendors

' Date October 12, 2012
' Solicited

DateOpened i 8,20 ;

‘Date Board  December 18,2012 Funding Source | General
Presentation | Funds
' Total Savings | N/A || Grand Total of RFP . Est. $500,000

Recommendation:
Recommend acceptance of the highlighted proposals as noted on the attached tabulation sheet, as
the responsive, responsible proposals having the highest points per “PART” and meeting written
specifications.

Term of Contract:

The intent of this RIFP is to establish a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual consent,
with up to twelve (12) vendors (six vendors for “PART A™ Science Supplies and six (6) vendors
for “PART B” Classroom Supplies) to purchase classroom and science supplies on an “as-
needed” basis. The contract for “PART A” - Science Supplies will commence on February 6,
2013 and continue through December 31, 2013 and the contract for “PART B” - Classroom
‘Supplies will commence on January 1, 2013 and continue through December 31, 2013.

Notations and Exceptions:

. Each RFP was evaluated and points assigned according to the following criteria for each “PART”
- as outlined in the specifications: Cost (15), Vendor Inventory (15), References (5), Minimum

- Order Requirement (5), Delivery/Free Shipping Requirement (5), and Customized Website (5).

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified
- opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are
. hereby rejected as late.

PART A - Science Supply Notations:
- Recommend rejection of the proposals from Nasco and Flinn Scientific as the mandatory attorney
. signature was not provided on the principal place of business section of the RFP.

District Sehool Boaid
of Pasco County

WFC 18 2012

Baard Approvec



RFP # 13-043-SB
Page 2

PART B - Classroom Supply Notations:
- Recommend rejection of the proposal from Constructive Playthings as they could not supply 50% of
- the most frequently purchased classroom supply items and the mandatory attorney signature was not
- provided on the principal place of business section of the RFP. Recommend rejection of the

- proposal from School Specialty as the mandatory attorney signature was not provided on the

principal place of business section of the REP.

Recommend rejection of the proposal from Fisher Scientific for PART A and B as they are
. considered non-responsive for declining to accept the RFP’s indemnification provision without
- alteration.

- Recommend rejection of proposal from Science Kit for PART B as they could not supply 50% of
the most frequently purchased classroom supply items as outlined in the RFP document.

After evaluation of this RFP was complete, the Purchasing Department compared the recommended
classroom supply vendor’s prices with Office Depot’s prices under our current office supply
contract. It has been determined to be in the Board’s best interest to allow the schools to purchase
classroom supplies from the recommended vendors (The Learning Station, Kaplan Early Learning,
and Lakeshore Learning) along with Office Depot utilizing our current office supply contract RFP
10-020-SN as this would save the schools approximately 50% on select items. The language
contained in RFP 13-043-SB allows the District to purchase classroom supply items utilizing other
District contracts if it is deemed to be in the Board’s best interest.

In addition, due to the unique nature and volume of classroom supplies purchased by schools
throughout the District, we are requesting permission to negotiate with interested parties to obtain :
two (2) additional classroom supply vendors as the intended six (6) vendors requested as part of RFP
13-043-SB were not obtained. The final negotiated contracts will be forwarded to a future board :
meeting for approval.

REPs Evaluated By:
Stephanie Bunford, Buyer, Purchasing Department

RFPs Prepared By:
Stephanie Bunford, Buyer, Purchasing Department

Reviewed and Authorized By:
- Michael J. Woodall, CPP9‘, Rur;:hasing Agent -
i _ /!

]

Distriet Sencai Boaid
of Pasco County

DEC 18 2012

Board Approved



District School Board of Pasco County

Tabulation Sheet

RFP # 13-043-SB
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

The Learning Station

Kaplan Early Learning

Lakeshore Learning

RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

10425 US Hwy 19

PO Box 609
1310 Lewisville-Clemmons Road

2695 E. Dominquez Street

Board Meeting: December 18, 2012

Port Richey, FL 34668

Lewisville, NC 27023

Carson, CA 90895

Quote # C-191

Quote # 58595

Part A Science Supplies and Equipment

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Category A |Cost: (15 Point Max)

Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max)

Number of items available

Category C |References: (5 Point Max)

Category D [Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max)

Category E [Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max)

Category F  |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max)

Catalog Name/Year

Fixed Percentage Discount

Exclusions to Discount

Total Points PART A Science Supplies: (50 Point Max)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Page 1 of 6




Tabulation Sheet

District School Board of Pasco County

RFP # 13-043-SB
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

Frey Scientific

Fisher Science

Sargent-Welch

RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

80 Northwest Blvd.

4500 Turnberry Drive

3850 N. Wilke Rd. Suite 300

Board Meeting: December 18, 2012

Nashua, NH 03063

Hanover Park, IL 60133

Arlington Heights, IL 60004

Contract # C-022443802-F

Bid # 12290-0540

Part A Science Supplies and Equipment

Disqualified for Part A

Category A [Cost: (15 Point Max) 15.00 14.56
Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max) 5 10
Number of items available 41 43
Category C |[References: (5 Point Max) 4.58 4.83
Category D |Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5
No minimum order No minimum order requrirement
requrirement
Category E [Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5
No minimums for free No Minimum for free shipping.
shipping. Excludes live Excludes hazardous material
specimens, hazardous surcharges
materials and products that
must ship by motor freight.
Category F  |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max) 5 0
Meets requirement No
Catalog Name/Year Frey Scientific 2013 Sargent-Welch 2012

Elementary and Science

Fixed Percentage Discount

30%

33%

Exclusions to Discount

No Discount on Frey
Scientific Exclusive products
with a prefix of N. Discount
does not appy to any other
school specialty Catalogs or
Flyers

No discount on items with a
catalog price ending in "9" (i.e.,
$5.49, $12.89, etc.) Will be
charged net price.

Total Points PART A Science Supplies: (50 Point Max)

39.58

Disqualified for Part A

39.40

Page 2 of 6




District School Board of Pasco County

Tabulation Sheet

RFP # 13-043-SB
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

VWR Education/ d.b.a. Science Kit

WVE Education / d.b.a Wards Natural Science

RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

777 East Park Drive PO Box 5003

5100 West Henrietta Road PO Box 92912

Board Meeting: December 18, 2012

Tonawanda, NY 14151-5003

Rochester, NY 14692-9012

Quote # L.210292-005

Part A Science Supplies and Equipment

Category A [Cost: (15 Point Max) 12.47 11.00
Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max) 15 10
Number of items available 49 43

Category C |[References: (5 Point Max) 4.67 4.08

Category D |Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5
No minimum order requrirement No minimum order requrirement

Category E [Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5
No minimums for free shipping. No minimums for free shipping. Excludes
Excludes live materials, hazardous |Vernier Brand labPro Probes & Sensors, RED
materials, items required to be Brand probes & Sensors, Bio-Rad brand
shipped via motor freight, overnight, [products and special-order items.
and two-way delivery

Category F  |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max) 5 0
Meets requirement No

Catalog Name/Year

Science Kit 2012 and Science Kit
Elementary 2012

Biology Chemistry 2011/Geology 2012 - 2013
Catalog will go into effect 1-1-2013

Fixed Percentage Discount

15%

10%

Exclusions to Discount

Any special orders, red items, vernier
probeware, custon Kits, publisher kits
and their replacement parts are
excluded from this discount.
Designated catalog prices ending
with a "9" will be excluded from
discounting and will be shipped at
the noted list price.

No discount on Vernier Brand labPro Probes &
Sensors, RED Brand probes & Sensors, Bio-
Rad brand products and special-order items.

Total Points PART A Science Supplies: (50 Point Max)

47.13

35.08

Page 3 of 6




District School Board of Pasco County

Tabulation Sheet

RFP # 13-043-SB The Learning Station Kaplan Early Learning Lakeshore Learning
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount
RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm 10425 US Hwy 19 PO Box 609 2695 E. Dominquez Street
1310 Lewisville-Clemmons Road
Board Meeting: December 18, 2012 Port Richey, FL 34668  [Lewisville, NC 27023 Carson, CA 90895
Quote # C-191 Quote # 58595
Part B Classroom Supplies and Equipment
Category A |Cost: (15 Point Max) 15.00 10.63 9.26
Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max) 5.00 15 10
Number of items available 40 45 44
Category C |References: (5 Point Max) 5.00 5.00 3.33
Category D |Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5 5
No Minimum No Minimum No Minimum
Category E |Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max) 5 5 5
No Minimum No minimum. Excludes next day |[No Minimum
air, 2nd day air, and K-Truck
delivery services.
Category F |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max) 5 5 5
Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Name/Year The Learning Station 2012 Kaplan Early Learning Lakeshore 2012, Lakeshore
2012 Company Elementary 2012-2013
Fixed Percentage Discount 20% 15% 5%
Exclusions to Discount None Not valid with any other sale None
offers, bids, quotes, coupons, or
discounts. Excludes outdoor
playground, parts, surfacing, or
services of playgrounds, lofts,
technology products, computers
and accessories, curriculum,
assessments, and screening
materials, All about Ecers-R, All
about Iters-R, professional
development, Tot Tree, RM
Dance to Advance.
Total Points PART B Classroom Supplies: (50 Point Max) 40.00 45.63 37.60
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District School Board of Pasco County

Tabulation Sheet

RFP # 13-043-SB
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

Frey Scientific

Fisher Science

Sargent-Welch

RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

80 Northwest Blvd.

4500 Turnberry Drive

3850 N. Wilke Rd. Suite 300

Board Meeting: December 18, 2012

Nashua, NH 03063

Hanover Park, IL 60133

Arlington Heights, IL 60004

Contract # C-022443802-F

Bid # 12290-0540

Part B Classroom Supplies and Equipment

No Bid

Disqualified for Part B

No Bid

Category A |Cost: (15 Point Max)

Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max)

Number of items available

Category C |References: (5 Point Max)

Category D |Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max)

Category E |Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max)

Category F |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max)

Catalog Name/Year

Fixed Percentage Discount

Exclusions to Discount

Total Points PART B Classroom Supplies: (50 Point Max)

No Bid

Disqualified for Part B

No Bid
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District School Board of Pasco County
Tabulation Sheet

RFP # 13-043-SB
RFP Title: Science Supplies and Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

VWR Education/ d.b.a. Science Kit

WVE Education / d.b.a Wards Natural Science

RFP Due Date/Time: October 8, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

777 East Park Drive PO Box 5003

5100 West Henrietta Road PO Box 92912

Board Meeting: December 18, 2012

Tonawanda, NY 14151-5003

Rochester, NY 14692-9012

Quote # L.210292-005

Part B Classroom Supplies and Equipment Disqualified for Part B No Bid
Category A |Cost: (15 Point Max)
Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max)
Number of items available
Category C |References: (5 Point Max)
Category D |Minimum Order Requirements (5 Point Max)
Category E |Delivery/Free Shipping Requirements (5 Point Max)
Category F |Customized Online Ordering Requirement (5 Point Max)
Catalog Name/Year
Fixed Percentage Discount
Exclusions to Discount
Total Points PART B Classroom Supplies: (50 Point Max) Disqualified for Part B No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY

Kurt 8. Browning, Superintendent of Schools

7227 Land O’ Lakes Boulevard  Land O’ Lakes, Florida 34638

Department of Purchasing

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 794-2112

7271 774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484

352/ 524-2221  e-mail: mwoodall@pasco.k12.fl.us

February 5, 2013

MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable School Board Members
. . .—.——’/’( 3
FROM:  Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent }\5 WD,

RE: Direct Negotiation 13-043-DN Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount
Addition of Two (2) Vendors
John R. Green Company and School Specialty Inc.

On December 18, 2012, official action was granted to allow the Purchasing Department to directly negotiate with
interested parties to obtain two (2) additional classroom supply vendors as the intended six (6) vendors requested as
part of the original classroom supply REFP 13-043-SB were not attained.

The intent of this direct negotiation is to establish a three-year contract, renewable annually by mutual consent, with
up to two (2) vendors to purchase classroom supplies on an “as-needed” basis. Recommend acceptance of proposals
from John R. Green Company and School Specialty as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as the responsive,
responsible proposals with the highest points meeting written specifications and evaluation criteria.

Expenditures for classroom supplies with the four (4) previously awarded vendors (RFP 13-043-SB) and the two (2)
recommended vendors (13-043-DN) are estimated at $350,000 annually and will be purchased on an “as-needed”
basis. The funding source to purchase classroom supplies will be from General and Internal Funds. To sync up
dates with RFP 13-043-SB, this contract will commence on February 6, 2013 and continue through December 31,
2013.

If you should have any questions regarding this matter, please contact me at your earliest convenience.
MIW/sb

Attachment

Disiriet Sehool Board
of Pasco County

FER 05 2013

Board Approved

(813)794-2000 © (352) 524-2000 * (727) 774-2000 * www.pasco.k12 fl.us
The District School Board of Pasco County is System Accredited by AdvancED/Southern Association of Colleges and Schools




District School Board of Pasco County
Tabulation Sheet

Direct Negotiation # 13-043-DN
DN Title: Classroom Supplies Catalog Discount

Becker's School Supplies

Office Quad / d.b.a Classic
School Supply

Green Group Enterprises /
d.b.a. John R. Green
Company

School Specialty Inc.

DN Due Date: January 22, 2013

1500 Melrose Highway

P.O. Box 417 5730 Three
Notched Road

411 West Sixth Street

W6316 Design Drive

Board Meeting: February 5, 2013

Pennsauken, NJ 08110-1410

Crozet, VA 22932

Covington, KY 41011

Greenville, WI 54942

Category A |Cost: (15 Point Max) 12.00 12.45 15.00 12.00

Category B |Vendor Inventory (15 Point Max) |7.50 3.75 15.00 11.25

Category C [References: (5 Point Max) 5.00 3.29 4.75 3.33

Category D [Minimum Order Requirements (5 |5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
Point Max)

Category E |Delivery/Free Shipping 3.33 5.00 5.00 5.00
Requirements (5 Point Max)

Category F  |Customized Online Ordering 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Requirement (5 Point Max)

Catalog Name/Year

Early Childhood Edition 2013

Classic School Supply 2013

John R. Green Quality

School Specialty Educational

Teaching Tools 2013 Essentials 2013
Fixed Percentage Discount 18% 27% 25% 15%
Total Points: (50 Point Max) 32.83 34.50 49.75 41.58
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