

## District School Board of Pasco County Bid Recommendation

<b>Bid Title</b>	Large Kitchen Equipment	<b>Number of Vendors Notified</b>	181
<b>Bid Number</b>	13-063-DR	<b>Number of Bids Distributed</b>	47
<b>Date Solicited</b>	March 7, 2013	<b>Number of Vendors Bidding</b>	4
<b>Date Opened</b>	April 29, 2013	<b>Number of Formal "No Bid" Responses</b>	0
<b>Date Board Presentation</b>	May 21, 2013	<b>Funding Source</b>	General
<b>Total Savings</b>	\$3,795.00	<b>Grand Total of Bid</b>	\$185,154.00

**Recommendation:**

Recommend acceptance of bid from SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc. as noted on the attached bid tabulation sheet, as lowest and best, responsive and responsible bidder meeting written specifications.

**Term of Contract:**

This bid is for Large Kitchen Equipment to be utilized by the Food & Nutrition Services Department throughout the District. This is a three-year contract, renewable annually, based upon mutual agreement of the parties. The first year of this contract shall be effective from May 21, 2013 through May 20, 2014.

**Notations and Exceptions:**

Recommend rejection of bid received from Pueblo Hotel Supply for failure to submit pricing for all items, as this is an "all-or-none" bid.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

**Bids Evaluated By:**

Barry Burgess, Equipment Specialist, Food and Nutrition Services Department

**Bids Prepared By:**

Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant, Purchasing Services Department

**Reviewed and Authorized By:**

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent

Date/Time: May 15, 2013 08:37:00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	Steam-Jacketed Kettle - 480 volts, 3 phase, w/Accessory Kit KAK Cleveland KEL-40-T or equal:	<b>\$13,490.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$14,768.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
2	Steam-Jacketed Kettle - 208 volts, 3 phase, w/Accessory Kit KAK Cleveland KEL-40-T or equal:	<b>\$12,975.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$14,206.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
3	Table Type, Electric Kettle - 208 volts, 3 phase, 17.0 amps Cleveland KET-6-T or equal:	<b>\$5,260.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$5,612.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
4	Table Type, Electric Kettle - 480 volts, 3 phase, 9.8 amps Cleveland KET-6-T or equal:	<b>\$5,770.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$6,174.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
5	Pressureless Connections Steamer Stand Accutemp SNX-21 or equal:	<b>\$653.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$897.00</b>
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		SNH-21-05 Accutemp
6	Electric Boilerless Convection Steamer, 208 volts, 3 Phase Accutemp E62083E100SGL or equal:	<b>\$6,151.89</b> As Specified	<b>\$7,399.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
7	Electric Boilerless Convection Steamer, 480 volts Accutemp E64803E140SGL or equal:	<b>\$6,187.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$7,399.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
8	Holding and Proofing Cabinet Alto Sham #1000-UP-P with complete e-control system or equal:	<b>\$6,550.00</b> As Specified	<b>\$5,285.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
		<b>*Disqualified</b>	
1	Steam-Jacketed Kettle - 480 volts, 3 phase, w/Accessory Kit KAK Cleveland KEL-40-T or equal:	<b>\$17,733.76</b> As Specified	<b>\$14,086.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
2	Steam-Jacketed Kettle - 208 volts, 3 phase, w/Accessory Kit KAK Cleveland KEL-40-T or equal:	<b>\$17,057.79</b> As Specified	<b>\$13,549.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
3	Table Type, Electric Kettle - 208 volts, 3 phase, 17.0 amps Cleveland KET-6-T or equal:	<b>\$7,557.18</b> As Specified	<b>\$5,361.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
4	Table Type, Electric Kettle - 480 volts, 3 phase, 9.8 amps Cleveland KET-6-T or equal:	<b>\$6,015.11</b> As Specified	<b>\$5,898.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
5	Pressureless Connections Steamer Stand Accutemp SNX-21 or equal:	No Bid	<b>\$727.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
6	Electric Boilerless Convection Steamer, 208 volts, 3 Phase Accutemp E62083E100SGL or equal:	No Bid	<b>\$7,599.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
7	Electric Boilerless Convection Steamer, 480 volts Accutemp E64803E140SGL or equal:	No Bid	<b>\$7,599.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
8	Holding and Proofing Cabinet Alto Sham #1000-UP-P with complete e-control system or equal:	No Bid	<b>\$6,500.00</b> As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
9	Jet Air Oven	<b>\$9,985.00</b>	<b>\$9,812.00</b>
	Doyon JA8 to include stand JA8B or equal	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
10	Heavy Duty Utility Carts	<b>\$376.00</b>	<b>\$377.00</b>
	Lakeside Ergo-One System Model #6810 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
11	Mobile Tray Drying Rack	<b>\$1,395.00</b>	<b>\$1,469.00</b>
	Channel ATDR-3 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
12	Pan Rack	<b>\$450.00</b>	<b>\$349.00</b>
	Channel #405A or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
13	Roll-In Refrigerator	<b>\$7,218.50</b>	<b>\$6,554.00</b>
	Nova #WR722 w/ complete e-control system or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
14	2-Door Reach-In	<b>\$5,871.25</b>	<b>\$5,444.00</b>
	Nova #NR522 w/ complete e-control system or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
15	Stand for Microwave/Steamer	<b>\$575.00</b>	<b>\$569.00</b>
	Panasonic Model #FCS-FM-100 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
16	Microwave/Steamer	<b>\$3,250.00</b>	<b>\$3,099.00</b>
	Panasonic #NE-3280 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
9	Jet Air Oven	<b>\$8,716.51</b>	<b>\$9,400.00</b>
	Doyon JA8 to include stand JA8B or equal	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
10	Heavy Duty Utility Carts	<b>\$331.21</b>	<b>\$390.00</b>
	Lakeside Ergo-One System Model #6810 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
11	Mobile Tray Drying Rack	<b>\$1,394.86</b>	<b>\$1,370.00</b>
	Channel ATDR-3 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
12	Pan Rack	<b>\$333.21</b>	<b>\$325.00</b>
	Channel #405A or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
13	Roll-In Refrigerator	<b>\$4,974.43</b>	<b>\$6,716.00</b>
	Nova #WR722 w/ complete e-control system or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
14	2-Door Reach-In	<b>\$3,827.07</b>	<b>\$5,312.00</b>
	Nova #NR522 w/ complete e-control system or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
15	Stand for Microwave/Steamer		<b>\$570.00</b>
	Panasonic Model #FCS-FM-100 or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
16	Microwave/Steamer	<b>\$4,766.84</b>	<b>\$3,610.00</b>
	Panasonic #NE-3280 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
17	Drink Merchandiser	<b>\$6,095.00</b>	<b>\$5,999.00</b>
	True TAC48GS or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
18	Sandwich Slide	<b>\$2,875.00</b>	<b>\$2,863.00</b>
	Slant Model Dual Shelf-Glo-Ray #GR2SDS-36D or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
19	Sandwich Slide	<b>\$3,400.00</b>	<b>\$3,384.00</b>
	Slant Model Dual Shelf-Glo-Ray #GR2SDS-48D or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
20	Milk Coolers : <b>Duplication of Line 21</b>	N/A	N/A
	Norlake Food Service Equipment Model# AR084 or equal:	<b>Duplication of Line 21</b>	<b>Duplication of Line 21</b>
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
21	Milk Coolers	<b>\$2,510.00</b>	<b>\$1,999.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR084 or equal:	<b>As Specified</b>	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
	Alternate Price		
22	Milk Coolers	<b>\$2,765.00</b>	<b>\$2,248.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR124 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
	Alternate Price		
23	Milk Coolers	<b>\$3,217.00</b>	<b>\$2,399.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR164 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
17	Drink Merchandiser	<b>\$6,714.87</b>	<b>\$5,651.00</b>
	True TAC48GS or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
18	Sandwich Slide	<b>\$3,065.80</b>	<b>\$2,867.00</b>
	Slant Model Dual Shelf-Glo-Ray #GR2SDS-36D or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
19	Sandwich Slide	<b>\$3,409.34</b>	<b>\$3,389.00</b>
	Slant Model Dual Shelf-Glo-Ray #GR2SDS-48D or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
20	Milk Coolers : <b>Duplication of Line 21</b>	N/A	N/A
	Norlake Food Service Equipment Model# AR084 or equal:	<b>Duplication of Line 21</b>	<b>Duplication of Line 21</b>
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
21	Milk Coolers	<b>\$2,160.21</b>	<b>\$2,367.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR084 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		Beverage Air / STN34-S
	Alternate Price		<b>\$2,073.00</b>
22	Milk Coolers	<b>\$2,429.23</b>	<b>\$2,633.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR124 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		Beverage Air / ST49N-S
	Alternate Price		<b>\$2,335.00</b>
23	Milk Coolers	<b>\$2,592.73</b>	<b>\$3,015.00</b>
	Norlake Model# AR164 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		Beverage Air / ST58N-S
			<b>\$2,577.00</b>

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
24	Cold Food Table	<b>\$7,517.00</b>	<b>\$7,720.00</b>
	ColorPoint Tempest Aire 74-CFMA or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
25	Utility Cart	<b>\$1,955.00</b>	<b>\$2,008.00</b>
	ColorPoint 28 ST-EB or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
26	Hot Food Table	<b>\$8,090.00</b>	<b>\$8,309.00</b>
	ColorPoint 5E5 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
27	Hot Food Table	<b>\$8,750.00</b>	<b>\$8,984.00</b>
	ColorPoint EF5-CPA-84 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
28	Cashier Table	<b>\$2,812.00</b>	<b>\$2,888.00</b>
	ColorPoint 28-CSE or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
29	Cashier Table	<b>\$4,067.00</b>	<b>\$4,176.00</b>
	ColorPoint 50-CSS or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
30	Hot Food Table	<b>\$5,147.00</b>	<b>\$5,286.00</b>
	ColorPoint EF3-CPA or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
31	Cold Food Table	<b>\$5,210.00</b>	<b>\$5,352.00</b>
	ColorPoint 50-CFMX-3 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
24	Cold Food Table		<b>\$7,335.00</b>
	ColorPoint Tempest Aire 74-CFMA or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
25	Utility Cart	<b>\$550.39</b>	<b>\$1,908.00</b>
	ColorPoint 28 ST-EB or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
26	Hot Food Table	<b>\$1,301.40</b>	<b>\$7,894.00</b>
	ColorPoint 5E5 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
27	Hot Food Table		<b>\$8,535.00</b>
	ColorPoint EF5-CPA-84 or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
28	Cashier Table		<b>\$2,744.00</b>
	ColorPoint 28-CSE or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
29	Cashier Table		<b>\$3,968.00</b>
	ColorPoint 50-CSS or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
30	Hot Food Table	<b>\$759.97</b>	<b>\$5,022.00</b>
	ColorPoint EF3-CPA or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
31	Cold Food Table		<b>\$5,084.00</b>
	ColorPoint 50-CFMX-3 or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
32	Solid Top Table	<b>\$4,020.00</b>	<b>\$4,129.00</b>
	Open Base ColorPoint: 50-ST Series or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
33	Solid Top Table	<b>\$10,195.00</b>	<b>\$10,469.00</b>
	Closed Base ColorPoint: #74-ST-EB Series or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
34	Solid Top Table	<b>\$3,289.00</b>	<b>\$3,377.00</b>
	Closed Base ColorPoint: #66-ST-EB Series or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
35	Walk-In Cooler Shelving	<b>\$390.00</b>	<b>\$399.00</b>
	Cambro Model #CSU41546 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
36	Hand Sink	<b>\$1,300.00</b>	<b>\$1,281.00</b>
	Advance Tapco Model #EC31000-HG or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	Advance / 7-PS-51 w/Electronic Faucet by T & S	
37	Can Storage (FIFO) Front Loading Can Rack	<b>\$1,399.00</b>	<b>\$1,199.00</b>
	Channel Model #CSR-156 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
38	Dunnage Racks	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>\$99.00</b>
	4" Wide E Channel Model EHD2048 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
	Alternate Price		

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
32	Solid Top Table		<b>\$3,923.00</b>
	Open Base ColorPoint: 50-ST Series or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
33	Solid Top Table		<b>\$9,946.00</b>
	Closed Base ColorPoint: #74-ST-EB Series or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
34	Solid Top Table		<b>\$3,210.00</b>
	Closed Base ColorPoint: #66-ST-EB Series or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
35	Walk-In Cooler Shelving	<b>\$406.50</b>	<b>\$385.00</b>
	Cambro Model #CSU41546 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
36	Hand Sink	<b>\$230.52</b>	<b>\$607.00</b>
	Advance Tapco Model #EC31000-HG or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
37	Can Storage (FIFO) Front Loading Can Rack	<b>\$1,201.74</b>	<b>\$1,150.00</b>
	Channel Model #CSR-156 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
38	Dunnage Racks	<b>\$99.06</b>	<b>\$110.00</b>
	4" Wide E Channel Model EHD2048 or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	Advance Tabco / DUN-2048	
	Alternate Price	<b>\$111.22</b>	

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		6800 N. Florida Avenue	150 Semoran Commerce Place
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Tampa, FL 33604	Apopka, FL 32703
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
<b>ITEM#</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>
39	Camcart	<b>\$695.00</b>	<b>\$675.00</b>
	Cambro Model 1826LTC or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
40	Hand Sink	<b>\$2,715.00</b>	<b>\$2,769.00</b>
	Cambro CVC72 or equal:	As Specified	
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		Camcruiser Vending Cart 110 (BLK)
41	Food Bar Ultra	<b>\$1,999.00</b>	<b>\$2,455.00</b>
	Cambro Model #6UBR or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	w/Tray Slide & End Tables	w/Tray Slide & End Tables
		(NEW ITEM #) VBRU6-110 Versa Ultra Series Food Bar	(NEW ITEM #) VBRU6-110 Versa Ultra Series Food Bar
	Alternate Price		
42	Food Bar Ultra	<b>\$1,925.00</b>	<b>\$2,328.00</b>
	Cambro Model #5UBR to include side tables & tray slide or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	Cambro / VBR6110 w/Endtables & Tray Slide	w/Tray Slide & End Tables
		(NEW ITEM #) VBRU5-110 Versa Ultra Series Food Bar	(NEW ITEM #) VBRU5-110 Versa Ultra Series Food Bar
43	Grab 'N Go Breakfast Cart	<b>\$6,565.00</b>	<b>\$6,741.00</b>
	ColorPoint to include side tables & tray slide or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
<b>"All-Or-None" Grand Total:</b>		<b>\$185,284.64</b>	<b>\$188,949.00</b>
Total with Alternates			

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY  
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: April 29, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Pueblo Hotel Supply	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
BID TITLE: Large Kitchen Equipment (As-Needed-Basis)		430 w. 4th Street	5330 Pinkney Avenue
BID NUMBER: 13-063-DR		Pueblo, CO 81003	Sarasota, FL 34233
<b>BOARD "5/21/13"</b>			
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
39	Camcart	<b>\$712.94</b>	<b>\$675.00</b>
	Cambro Model 1826LTC or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
40	Hand Sink		<b>\$2,762.00</b>
	Cambro CVC72 or equal:	No Bid	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
41	Food Bar Ultra	<b>\$1,185.73</b>	<b>\$2,245.00</b>
	Cambro Model #6UBR or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	w/Tray Slide & End Tables	w/Tray Slide & End Tables
		(NEW ITEM #) Cambro / VBRU6-110	(NEW ITEM #) VBRU6-110
	Alternate Price	<b>\$1,943.70</b>	Versa Ultra Series Food Bar
42	Food Bar Ultra	<b>\$1,821.13</b>	<b>\$2,118.00</b>
	Cambro Model #5UBR to include side tables & tray slide or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #	w/Tray Slide & End Tables	
		(NEW ITEM #) VBRU5-110	
		Versa Ultra Series Food Bar	
43	Grab 'N Go Breakfast Cart	<b>\$2,112.31</b>	<b>\$6,599.00</b>
	ColorPoint to include side tables & tray slide or equal:	As Specified	As Specified
	Alternate bid Manufacturer and Model #		
<b>"All-Or-None" Grand Total:</b>		<b>\$105,516.76</b>	<b>\$185,154.00</b>
Total with Alternates		\$107,676.97	\$192,139.00
		<b>*Disqualified</b>	