

District School Board of Pasco County Bid Recommendation

Bid Title	Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System	Number of Vendors Notified	257
Bid Number	14-003-VJ	Number of Bids Distributed	22
Date Solicited	April 25, 2013	Number of Vendors Bidding	4
Date Opened	May 31, 2013	Number of Vendors Not Bidding	1
Date Board Presentation	June 18, 2013	Funding Source	Capital
Total Savings	N/A	Grand Total of Bid	\$1,827,955.00 Estimated 1 st Year

Recommendation:

Recommend acceptance of bid highlighted on the attached bid tabulation, as the lowest and best, responsive, responsible bidder meeting written specifications.

Term of Contract:

The intent of this bid is to establish a firm-fixed price between the District and a supplier for the purchase & installation of walk-in coolers, freezers, and wireless monitoring system "as needed" throughout the District. This is a one-year contract, with two subsequent one-year renewal periods, at the mutual agreement of the parties. The first year term will commence on June 19, 2013 and continue through June 18, 2014.

Notations and Exceptions:

Recommend rejection of bids received from Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc., SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies, and Winston Industries for failure to submit pricing for Group A and Group B as specified in the bid document.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bid Evaluated By:

Barry Burgess, Equipment Specialist, Food & Nutrition Department

Bid Prepared By:

Deb Mateo, Interim Buyer, Purchasing Services

Reviewed and Authorized By:

Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent



Date/Time: June 12, 2013 08:14:00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries				
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive				
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299				
BOARD 6/18/13									
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE				
	Cooler/Freezer (Inside/Outside Building)								
Item 1	10' x 8' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 4-24" x 60", 1-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 24-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 1								
Item 2	10' x 8' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 4-24" x 60", 1-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 24-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 2								
Item 3	10' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 3-24" x 36", 4-24" x 60", 28-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 3								
Item 4	10' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 3-24" x 36", 4-24" x 60", 28-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 4								

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries	
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive	
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299	
BOARD 6/18/13						
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
Item 5	10' x 12' x 87" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool		
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 72", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width					
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping					
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)					
	PRICE / Cooler		\$32,762.00	\$32,506.00	\$36,080.00	
	PRICE / Freezer		\$34,473.00	\$33,753.00	\$37,600.00	
	Total - Item 5		\$67,235.00	\$66,259.00	\$73,680.00	No Bid
Item 6	10' x 12' x 87" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)		Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 72", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width					
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping					
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)					
	PRICE / Cooler	\$35,325.00		\$37,983.00	\$40,527.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$37,034.00		\$39,229.00	\$42,047.00	
	Total - Item 6	\$72,359.00		\$77,212.00	\$82,574.00	No Bid
Item 7	10' x 14' x 87" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls		Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width					
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping					
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)					
	PRICE / Cooler		\$33,947.00	\$33,335.00	\$37,632.00	
	PRICE / Freezer		\$35,657.00	\$34,582.00	\$39,151.00	
	Total - Item 7		\$69,604.00	\$67,917.00	\$76,783.00	No Bid
Item 8	10' x 14' x 87" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)		Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width					
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping					
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)					
	PRICE / Cooler	\$37,505.00		\$36,590.00	\$42,194.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$39,581.00		\$38,202.00	\$43,714.00	
	Total - Item 8	\$77,086.00		\$74,792.00	\$85,908.00	No Bid
Item 9	10' x 20' x 87" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls		Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width					
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping					
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)					
	PRICE / Cooler		\$38,679.00	\$36,759.00	\$40,982.00	
	PRICE / Freezer		\$40,628.00	\$38,129.00	\$42,651.00	
	Total - Item 9		\$79,307.00	\$74,888.00	\$83,633.00	No Bid

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
Item 10	10' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 1-24" x 48", 6-24" x 60", 2-24" x 36", 36-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$42,931.00	\$40,329.00	\$45,950.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$45,231.00	\$41,699.00	\$47,621.00	
	Total - Item 10	\$88,162.00	\$82,028.00	\$93,571.00	No Bid
Item 11	12' x 8' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 7-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 32-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$30,049.00	\$30,458.00	\$33,281.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$32,098.00	\$32,005.00	\$34,087.00	
	Total - Item 11	\$62,147.00	\$62,463.00	\$67,368.00	No Bid
Item 12	12' x 8' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 7-24" x 48", 1-24" x 36", 32-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$33,250.00	\$33,370.00	\$38,402.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$35,296.00	\$34,917.00	\$37,585.00	
	Total - Item 12	\$68,546.00	\$68,287.00	\$75,987.00	No Bid
Item 13	12' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$32,485.00	\$32,350.00	\$35,898.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$34,195.00	\$33,596.00	\$37,418.00	
	Total - Item 13	\$66,680.00	\$65,946.00	\$73,316.00	No Bid
Item 14	12' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width				
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping				
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	
	PRICE / Cooler	\$35,584.00	\$35,352.00	\$40,345.00	
	PRICE / Freezer	\$37,294.00	\$36,599.00	\$41,866.00	
	Total - Item 14	\$72,878.00	\$71,951.00	\$82,211.00	No Bid

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries				
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive				
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299				
BOARD 6/18/13									
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE				
Item 15	12' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 15								
Item 16	12' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 16								
Item 17	12' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 17								
Item 18	12' x 20' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 18								
Item 19	14' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 19								

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries				
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive				
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299				
BOARD 6/18/13									
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE				
Item 20	14' x 16' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 20								
Item 21	15' x 15' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 21								
Item 22	15' x 15' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 22								
Item 23	16' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Inside Building</i>)					Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 23								
Item 24	16' x 10' x 8'7" High (<i>Outside Building</i>)	Thermalrite / Cambro / E-Controls	Thermalrite	Thermokool	No Bid				
	Shelving: 5-24" x 48", 4-24" x 36", 1-24" x 30", 40-72" post, 4-24" shelf width								
	Thermo-Kool, Thermal Rite, or Chrysler Kopping								
	Manufacturer (Cooler/Freezer)								
	PRICE / Cooler								
	PRICE / Freezer								
	Total - Item 24								
	Total "All-Or-None"					\$1,827,955.00	\$1,761,623.00	\$1,980,002.00	No Bid

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: May 31, 2013 @ 2:30 p.m.		Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.	Johnson-Lancaster & Associates, Inc.	SRE Culinary Equipment & Supplies	Winston Industries
BID TITLE: Purchase & Installation of Walk-In Cooler, Freezer, and Associated Wireless Monitoring System "As Needed"		6800 N. Florida Avenue	990 Harbor Lake Drive	1126 Lime Avenue	2345 Carton Drive
BID NUMBER: 14-003-VJ		Tampa, FL 33604	Safety Harbor, FL 34695	Sarasota, FL 34237	Louisville, KY 40299
BOARD 6/18/13					
ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
	Group B - Wireless Monitoring Equipment				
	E-Control System or Equal				
	Make	E-Controls			Kitchen Data System
	Model #	IntelliSense			KDS Guard
	PRICE per Unit	\$2,295.00	No Pricing	No Pricing	\$213.50
			*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B	*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B	*Disqualified - failure to submit pricing for Group A & B